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Date: 20 December 2019
Our Reference: 6880989

Dear Mr Kariuki
Information Request - 6880989 - Zebra Crossings

| am responding to your request for information, which has been considered under the Environmental
Information Regulations 2004 (EIR) and logged as case 6880989.

Your request is as follows:
1) A list of all the pedestrian zebra crossings within Cheshire East Council boundaries.
2) Information on how many Belisha beacons on each crossing point.

3) The above would ideally include the use of the Geo-coordinate system information of each site,
but also the street name and location.

| am writing to advise you that, following a search of our paper and electronic records, | have established
that the information you requested is not held by Cheshire East Council. Therefore regulation 12(4)(a)
applies to your request. Regulation 12(4)(a) provides an exception to the duty to disclose information
when information is not held. The information is not held because Cheshire East Council does not have a
data base of zebra crossings. Therefore the authority is unable to run a report which enables it to answer
your request.

Please quote the reference number 6880989 in any future communications.

Please note that an anonymised copy of this response may be published in the Council’s Disclosure Log,
which is available online at the following address: www.cheshireeast.gov.uk/foi
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If you are not satisfied with the outcome of your request or if you are not happy with the way your request
has been handled, you can request an internal review. Internal review requests should be submitted
within 20 working days of our response by emailing foi@cheshireeast.gov.uk or in writing to Compliance
& Customer Relations Team, Cheshire East Council, 1st Floor, Westfields, c/o Municipal Buildings, Earle
Street, Crewe, CW1 2BJ.

If you are not content with the outcome of the internal review, you then have the right to apply directly to
the Information Commissioner for a decision. The Information Commissioner can be contacted at
Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF; Tel:
0303 123 1113; Fax: 01625 524510 or https://ico.org.uk The Information Commissioner will not normally
investigate your case until the Council’s internal review process has been completed.

Yours sincerely

Helen Sweeney
Senior Compliance & Customer Relations Officer
Cheshire East Council
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