

Maidstone Borough Council

Freedom of Information Act Request

Ref: FOI/6991

Date: 25/05/2022

Request and Response

Q1. During the month of April 2022, how many council employees were working from home, and what percentage of the office based workforce does this represent?

Under section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act, I can confirm we do not hold this information.

Q2. Between 1st and 30th April 2022, how many desk bookings were made across the council's office buildings and, on average, how many desk bookings were there a day during this month?

Number of desks bookings in April 2022 = 696.

Average number of desk bookings per day in April 2022 = 36.

Q3. How many desks were available for use in the month April 2022 across the council's office buildings?

There are 167 desks in Maidstone Borough Council's main office building.

Under section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act, I can confirm we do not hold the number of desks available for use in the town hall, Maidstone Museum, the crematorium, or the depot.

Q4. What was the maximum number of office staff who could theoretically work in the office on any given day in April 2022?

Under section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act, I can confirm we do not hold this information.

Q5. What was the total number of office staff who worked in your council's offices each day prior to the pandemic?

Under section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act, I can confirm we do not hold this information.