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Amy Harron 

Via e-mail: request-514056-525def0a@whatdotheyknow.com 

 

Dear Ms Harron 

I have received your request for an internal review of the Department’s response to 

your FOI request REF: DE/2018-0104. 

In line with Departmental procedures, as a senior official in the Department, who was 

not involved in the original decision making process and has no responsibility for the 

team which originally considered your request, I have been asked to undertake the 

Internal Review. 

Your request for internal review asks for the Department to confirm or deny each 

individual item requested.  “If this is not held by the DEPARTMENT OF 

EDUCATION, please “confirm or deny”.  It is your duty to “confirm or deny” each 

individual item requested.”  

As advised in the Department’s response of 26 September 2018, Exemption 39 of 

the Freedom of Information Act 2000 was applied to your request for information and 

the Department responded under the Environmental Information Regulations 2004 

(EIR). 

EIR Regulation 3(2) states: 

3.—(2) For the purposes of these Regulations, environmental information is held by 

a public authority if the information— 

(a) is in the authority’s possession and has been produced or received by the 

authority; or 

(b) is held by another person on behalf of the authority. 

I have considered the Department’s response to your request and I am content that 

the Department has confirmed it does not hold the information requested and that it 

has carried out a reasonable check of documents held and has advised you that 

following a reasonable search, it does not hold the information that references the 

seven points in your request. 
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The Department advised you of the scope of the search for the documents 

requested i.e. the title search, as a check of all Departmental records would not be 

feasible and quoted EIR Exception 12(4)(b) that would support a check of all 

Departmental records as being manifestly unreasonable.   

The ICO advises that if a public authority refuses a request under 12(4)(b), it should 

still let the requester know whether or not it holds information falling within the scope 

of the request. I am satisfied that the Department established that the information 

you requested is not held.   

However, if the public authority isn’t sure whether information is held and the costs of 

establishing this are in themselves clearly and obviously unreasonable, then the ICO 

does not expect the public authority to put itself to this expense. To do so would be 

counter to the purpose of the exception. 

Nevertheless, public authorities must go on to apply the public interest test set out in 

Exception 12(1)(b). A public authority can only withhold information if the public 

interest in maintaining the exception outweighs the public interest in disclosing the 

information. 

The public interest in maintaining this exception lies in protecting public authorities 

from exposure to disproportionate burden.  Dealing with manifestly unreasonable 

requests can place a strain on resources and get in the way of public authorities 

delivering mainstream services or answering other requests. 

When refusing a request for environmental information under regulation 12(4)(b) on 

the grounds of cost, the ICO advises that public authorities should provide the 

requester with appropriate advice and assistance. 

Under Regulation 9 of the EIR a public authority has a duty to provide advice and 

assistance to those who propose to make or have made requests and help them 

make good use of the Regulations. According to the ICO a public authority is 

deemed to have complied with its duty in a particular case, if it has conformed with 

the Code of Practice on the Discharge of the Obligations of Public Authorities under 

the EIR in relation to the provision of advice and assistance in that case. Every 

public authority should be ready to provide advice and assistance. The duty on the 

public authority is to provide advice and assistance “so far as it would be reasonable 

to expect the authority to do so”.  

Appropriate assistance might include: 

• Providing an outline of the different kinds of information that might meet the 

terms of the request; and 

• Providing a general response to the request setting out options for further 

information that could be provided on request (from other agencies). 

I am content that the Department has fulfilled its duty under Regulation 9 and 

12(4)(b), by advising you of links to sources of information and in explaining the 

Education Authority’s role as the organisation with operational responsibility for the 

provision of ICT Services in the Education Sector.  I understand you have also 

requested the information from the Education Authority.  



As set out in the Department’s letter of 26th September, if you would like to discuss 

this further please do not hesitate to contact Dr Suzanne Kingon Tel; 02891 279162  

If you are not content with the outcome of the internal review, you have the right to 

apply directly to the Information Commissioner for a review of the Department’s 

decision. The Information Commissioner may be contacted at: 

Information Commissioner’s Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire 
SK9 5AF. 
 
 
Yours sincerely 

 

MARGARET ROSE MCNAUGHTON 


