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Request / response 

 

….Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 and the Environmental Information 

Regulations 2004, you are requested to provide the following: 

 

1.  All documents written or electronic, scientific studies or reports, World Health 

Organisation’s International Agency for Research on Cancer monographs and 

classifications, or any other form of evidence in which it is stated that “Wi-Fi 

exposure is safe and poses no risks to children’s health, including cancer”. 

If you, Gavin Boyd, acting as Chief Executive of the Education Authority, confirm that 

there are no such documents, please answer: "The Education Authority do not hold 

any documents, written or electronic, scientific studies or reports, World Health 

Organisation’s International Agency for Research on Cancer monographs and 

classifications, or any other form of evidence stating that that Wi-Fi exposure is safe 

and poses no risks to children’s health, including cancer". 

The Education Authority does not hold the requested information. However, the 

Education Authority does hold reference links to websites on WiFi health and safety. 

These links are provided below: 

https://www.education-ni.gov.uk/articles/computer-health-and-safety 

https://www.gov.uk/government/publications/wireless-networks-wi-fi-radio-waves-

and-health 

http://webarchive.nationalarchives.gov.uk/20140714084352/http://www.hpa.org.uk/T

opics/Radiation/UnderstandingRadiation/UnderstandingRadiationTopics/Electromag

neticFields/RadioWaves/WiFi/ 

https://www.education-ni.gov.uk/articles/computer-health-and-safety
https://www.gov.uk/government/publications/wireless-networks-wi-fi-radio-waves-and-health
https://www.gov.uk/government/publications/wireless-networks-wi-fi-radio-waves-and-health
http://webarchive.nationalarchives.gov.uk/20140714084352/http:/www.hpa.org.uk/Topics/Radiation/UnderstandingRadiation/UnderstandingRadiationTopics/ElectromagneticFields/RadioWaves/WiFi/
http://webarchive.nationalarchives.gov.uk/20140714084352/http:/www.hpa.org.uk/Topics/Radiation/UnderstandingRadiation/UnderstandingRadiationTopics/ElectromagneticFields/RadioWaves/WiFi/
http://webarchive.nationalarchives.gov.uk/20140714084352/http:/www.hpa.org.uk/Topics/Radiation/UnderstandingRadiation/UnderstandingRadiationTopics/ElectromagneticFields/RadioWaves/WiFi/


 

2. All documents written or electronic, scientific studies or reports, World Health 

Organisation’s International Agency for Research on Cancer monographs and 

classifications, etc. in which it is stated the known safe level of exposure for children 

aged 0-4 years to wireless RF/EMF radiation, including Wi-Fi.  

If you, Gavin Boyd, acting as Chief Executive of the Education Authority, confirm that 

there are no such documents please answer: “No known safe levels of exposure to 

wireless RF/EMF radiation, including Wi-Fi, for children aged 0-4 years are held by 

the Education Authority.”   

The requested information is not held. 

 

3.  All documents written or electronic, scientific studies or reports, World Health 

Organisation’s International Agency for Research on Cancer monographs and 

classifications, etc. in which it is stated the known safe level of exposure for children 

aged 4-11 years to wireless RF/EMF radiation, including Wi-Fi.  

If you, Gavin Boyd, acting as Chief Executive of the Education Authority, confirm that 

there are no such documents please answer: “No known safe levels of exposure to 

wireless RF/EMF radiation, including Wi-Fi, for children aged 4-11 years are held by 

the Education Authority.”   

The requested information is not held. 

 

4.  All documents written or electronic, scientific studies or reports, World Health 

Organisation’s International Agency for Research on Cancer monographs and 

classifications, etc. in which it is stated the known safe level of exposure for children 

aged 12-18 years to wireless RF/EMF radiation, including Wi-Fi.  

If you, Gavin Boyd, acting as Chief Executive of the Education Authority, confirm that 

there are no such documents please answer: “No known safe levels of exposure to 

wireless RF/EMF radiation, including Wi-Fi, for children aged 12-18 years are held 

by the Education Authority.”   

The requested information is not held. 

 

5.  All documents written or electronic, scientific studies or reports, World Health 

Organisation’s International Agency for Research on Cancer monographs and 

classifications, etc. in which it is stated the known safe level of exposure for children 



with Down’s Syndrome aged 0-4 years to wireless RF/EMF radiation, including Wi-

Fi.  

If you, Gavin Boyd, acting as Chief Executive of the Education Authority, confirm that 

there are no such documents please answer: “No known safe levels of exposure to 

wireless RF/EMF radiation, including Wi-Fi, for children with Down’s Syndrome aged 

0-4 years are held by the Education Authority.”   

The requested information is not held. 

 

6.  All documents written or electronic, scientific studies or reports, World Health 

Organisation’s International Agency for Research on Cancer monographs and 

classifications, etc. in which it is stated the known safe level of exposure for children 

with Down’s Syndrome aged 4-11 years to wireless RF/EMF radiation, including Wi-

Fi.  

If you, Gavin Boyd, acting as Chief Executive of the Education Authority, confirm that 

there are no such documents please answer: “No known safe levels of exposure to 

wireless RF/EMF radiation, including Wi-Fi, for children with Down’s Syndrome aged 

4-11 years are held by the Education Authority.”   

The requested information is not held. 

 

7.  All documents written or electronic, scientific studies or reports, World Health 

Organisation’s International Agency for Research on Cancer monographs and 

classifications, etc. in which it is stated the known safe level of exposure for children 

with Down’s Syndrome aged 12-18 years to wireless RF/EMF radiation, including 

Wi-Fi.  

If you, Gavin Boyd, acting as Chief Executive of the Education Authority, confirm that 

there are no such documents please answer: “No known safe levels of exposure to 

wireless RF/EMF radiation, including Wi-Fi, for children with Down’s Syndrome aged 

12-18 years are held by the Education Authority.”  

The requested information is not held. 


