
 
 
 

INFORM ATION M AN AGEMENT AND COMPLI ANCE 
Sussex House | University of Sussex | Falmer | Brighton BN1 9RH | United Kingdom 

T +44 (0)1273 873954 | foi@sussex.ac.uk   
http://www.sussex.ac.uk/ogs/policies/information/foi 

Ms Jackie Grant 
By email only to request-623098-ea43ac08@whatdotheyknow.com 

19 December 2019  
 
Dear Ms Grant,  
 
Our ref: FOI-19-0289  
 
Thank you for your correspondence of 25 November 2019, in which you requested the 
following information from the University of Sussex. 
 
Request 
 
Please send me the University of Sussex’s full response to the UUK message inviting views 
and engagement from employers following the results of the ballot for industrial action over 
USS pensions.  
 
The invitation for views and engagement may have been sent by Head of Pensions, UUK or 
another UUK representative and was dated 5 November 2019 or near this date. 
 
Response 
 
Your request has been dealt with under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (“the Act”). 
 
The University is unable to comply with your request as it does not hold the information that you 
have requested. 
 
The University is only required to provide recorded information which it holds, as the Act does 
not require a public authority to create information to answer a request if the requested 
information is not already held, or to answer a question unless the information requested exists. 
 
You can find out more about the relevant section of the Act, and some guidance points which 
the University has considered when applying the Act in this response, in the form of a Guidance 
Note attached to this letter.  
 
If you are not satisfied with this response you may request a review but this must be within 40 
days of receiving this response. In the first instance please write to Alexandra Elliott, the Head 
of Information Management and Compliance, at the address below. Full details of our Freedom 
of Information internal review procedure are at: 
http://www.sussex.ac.uk/ogs/policies/information/foi/procedure. 
 
If you need to contact us about your request please quote your reference number FOI-19-0289 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 
Lucy Pattenden 
Information Officer 
Information Management and Compliance 
  

mailto:xxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxx@xxxxxxxxxxxxxx.xxx
http://www.sussex.ac.uk/ogs/policies/information/foi/request/procedure


EXPLANATION OF FOIA  

You will find additional information about Section 1(1) of the Act below. Some extracts from the 
legislation, as well as some of the guidance used when applying it is included.  

Section 1 (1) General right of access to information held by public authorities. 

Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled—. 

(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of the 
description specified in the request, and. 

(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to him. 

Section 3(2) Public authorities. 

For the purposes of the Act, information is held by a public authority if: 

(i) it is held by the authority, otherwise than on behalf of another person, or 

(ii) it is held by another person on behalf of the authority.  

Guidance 

The University has an obligation to inform a requester whether it holds the information you have 
requested. 

If the University does not hold the information requested, provided it provides notification to you 
pursuant to section 1(1)(a) of the Act, it is not under any further obligations.   

 
 
 
 
 
 
 


