
 

British Business Bank 
3rd floor 
Fleetbank House 
2-6 Salisbury Square 
London EC4Y 8JX 

 
 
Mr Scott Davies 
[request-349722-dc424d98@whatdotheyknow.com] 
 
BBB Reference: 16-016-1 
 
26th August 2016 
 
Dear Mr Davies, 
 
RE: Freedom of Information Request 
  
Thank you for your freedom of information request received on 4th August 2016, where you 
requested the following information: 
   
“This request relates to UK Legislation, specifically TM44 Air Conditioning Inspections.  
 
Q. Are you responsible for any buildings with more than 12kw of air conditioning present? 
Q. Who is the responsible person for ensuring that your buildings are inspected and reports lodged, 
please provide the name, address, and telephone number of the responsible person. 
Q. If your TM44 Air Conditioning Inspection Certificates are in place, what is their expiry date?   
Q. What was the order value of the works placed with the Company who undertook the work? 
Q. How many Certificates were produced? 
Q. Was the TM44 Inspector independent as required under the Regulations? 
Q. Name the Inspector Organisation." 
  
 
Response: 
 
We are treating your correspondence as a request for information under the Freedom of 
Information Act 2000 (‘the Act’).  Under the Act you have the right to:  

• know whether we hold the information you require  
• be provided with that information (subject to any exemptions under the Act which may 

apply).  
 
The British Business Bank holds some information within the scope of your request.   
 
 
 

 



 

1. Are you responsible for any buildings with more than 12kw of air conditioning present? 
 
The British Business Bank is not responsible for any buildings with more than 12kw of air 
conditioning present. 
 

2.  Who is the responsible person for ensuring that your buildings are inspected and reports 
lodged, please provide the name, address, and telephone number of the responsible person. 

 
Our offices are leased and the maintenance and inspection of the air conditioning systems 
is the responsibility of the respective landlord.  The landlord responsible for our London 
office is: 
 

Department for Business, Energy & Industrial Strategy 
1 Victoria Street 
London 
SW1H 0ET 

 Telephone: 020 7215 5000 
 
The landlord responsible for our Sheffield office is: 
 

The Home Office 
Direct Communications Unit 
2 Marsham Street 
London 
SW1P 4DF 
Telephone: 020 7035 4848 

 
3. If your TM44 Air Conditioning Inspection Certificates are in place, what is their expiry date?   

 
We do not hold this information. 
 

4. What was the order value of the works placed with the Company who undertook the work? 
 

We do not hold this information. 
 

5. How many Certificates were produced? 
 

We do not hold this information. 
 

6. Was the TM44 Inspector independent as required under the Regulations? 
 
We do not hold this information. 
 
 
 

 



 

7. Name the Inspector Organisation. 
 

We do not hold this information. 
 
 
Your right to complain under the Freedom of Information Act 
 
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to ask for an internal 
review. Internal review requests should be submitted within two months of the date of receipt of 
the response to your original letter and should be addressed to: FOI Officer, British Business Bank, 
3rd floor, Fleetbank House, 2-6 Salisbury Square, London EC4Y 8JX. 
 
Please remember to quote the reference number above in any future communications. 
 
If you are not content with the outcome of the internal review you may apply directly to the 
Information Commissioner’s Office for a decision. Generally the Commissioner cannot make a 
decision unless you have exhausted our own complaints procedure. The Information 
Commissioner can be contacted at: The Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water 
Lane, Wilmslow Cheshire SK9 5AF www.ico.gov.uk   
 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 
 
British Business Bank FoI Officer 

 


