Derby City Council — Freedom of Information Response

Number 14896

Date 24/12/2020

TD1586 — The Provision of Security Services:
http://ted.europa.eu/udl?uri=TED:NOTICE:389132-2020: TEXT:EN:HTML

The details we require are:

1.Suppliers who applied for Information not held — procurement process is
inclusion on each ongoing so information will not be available until
framework/contract and were the process has been completed and Framework

successful & not successful at the jawarded.
PQQ & ITT stages.

2. Actual spend on this Information not held as the Framework has not yet
contract/framework (and any sub [commenced.

lots), from the start of the contract
to the current date.

3.Start date & duration of Information not held for start date as yet to be
framework. confirmed. The initial Framework term will be for
12 months.

4. Is there an extension clause in [There will be an option to extend the Framework
the framework(s)/contract(s) and, for a further 36 months in annual increments. The

if so, the duration of the maximum framework duration is 48 months.
extension?

5. Has a decision been made yet [Information not held as the Framework has not yet
on whether the commenced.

framework(s)/contract(s) are
being either extended or

renewed?
6. Who is the senior officer Melanie Pratt, Catering and Contracts Manager,
(outside of procurement) Facilities Management

responsible for this contract?

Please note, the following applies, if the response includes council officers (or
other officers) names.

If you are a company that intends to use the names and contact details of council
officers (or other officers) provided for direct marketing, you need to be registered
with the Information Commissioner to process personal data for this purpose. You
must also check that the individual (whom you wish to contact for direct marketing
purposes) is not registered with one of the Preference Services to prevent Direct
Marketing. If they are you must adhere to this preference. You must also ensure you
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http://ted.europa.eu/udl?uri=TED:NOTICE:389132-2020:TEXT:EN:HTML

comply with the Privacy Electronic and Communications Regulations (PECR). For
more information follow this Link www.ico.org.uk

For the avoidance of doubt the provision of council (and other) officer names and
contact details under FOI does not give consent to receive direct marketing via any
media and expressly does not constitute a ‘soft opt-in’ under PECR.
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