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9 October 2009 

Our Ref: FOI 2009/153 – F0070340 

Dear Mr Buchan, 
 
Re: Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 – Re quest for Information 
 
Thank you for your email which was received by the University on 11 September 2009 timed 
07:21, requesting the following information: 
 
 
a.  What are the success criteria for the student lifecycle project? 
 
b.  For each of the success criteria, please send me details of when each will be 

materialised and how the success will be measured? 
 
c.  Has an external and independent body assessed the viability of this project? If so 

could I please see the report? 
 
 
University’s Response  
 
a & b. The University of Glasgow does not hold the information that you have requested and 

is not aware of any other public authority that could respond to your request.   Section 
17 of FOISA states that where public authorities receive requests for information that 
they do not hold, they must issue a notice advising that they do not hold the requested 
information.  

   
However, the attached paper (Appendix A) presented to the University’s Senior 
Management Group in March 2009 sets out the rationale for the Student Lifecycle 
Project and includes a discussion of the contribution the project will make to the 
achievement of the University’s strategic objectives.     

 
c. The University has not used an external body to assess the viability of the project. 
 

Mr Cameron Buchan 
request-17908-ae512215@whatdotheyknow.com 

 



  

 
 

 
The supply of documents under the terms of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 
does not give the applicant or whoever receives the information any right to re-use it in such a 
way that might infringe the Copyright, Designs and Patents Act 1988 (for example, by making 
multiple copies, publishing or otherwise distributing the information to other individuals and the 
public). The Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 (Consequential Modifications) Order 
2004 ensured that Section 50 of the Copyright, Designs and Patents Act 1988 (“CDPA”) 
applies to the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 (“FOISA”).   
 
Breach of copyright law is an actionable offence and the University expressly reserves its 
rights and remedies available to it pursuant to the CDPA and common law. Further information 
on copyright is available at the following website: 
 
http://www.ipo.gov.uk/copy.htm 

Your right to seek a review 
 
Should you be dissatisfied with the way in which the University has dealt with your request, 
you have the right to require us to review our actions and decisions. Please refer to the 
Review Procedure (http://www.gla.ac.uk/services/dpfoioffice/policiesandprocedures/foisa-
complaintsandreview/) for further information.  All complaints regarding requests for 
information will be handled in accordance with this procedure. 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 
 
 
 
Data Protection and Freedom of Information Office 


