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FOI Request — FOI11718/07/10

| refer to your Freedom of Information request received on 17" July 2018.

Your Request
Please could you provide the following information for the current academic year (2017-2018):

1. The number of registered students with a visual impairment
2. The number of students are text to speech users

3. The number of students are screen reader users

4. The total number of students

University’s Response
Further to Section 1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (the “Act”) we confirm that the
information requested is partially held by the University of Sunderland (the “University”).

The number of registered students with a visual impairment — 16

The number of students are text to speech users — This information is not held
The number of students are screen reader users — This information is not held
The total number of students — 11457
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If you have any further enquiries about this matter, please do not hesitate to contact us on 0191
515 2627, or by emailing sunfoi@sunderland.ac.uk.

Kate O’Neill

Legal & Governance Support Assistant
Human Resources, Legal & Governance
University of Sunderland

Chester Road

Sunderland

SR1 3SD
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