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The University is able to advise you that some of the numbers involved are five or fewer. The University
does not disclose publicly personal data, including not just names, but also other information which
identifies, or might lead, together with other information which is in the public domain (or may otherwise
be available) to the identification of individuals, or to the disclosure of personal information about
individuals.

This is particularly the case where very low numbers are involved, and accordingly other information may
also have been withheld for this reason.

Such information has been withheld under the exemption for personal data in section 38(1)(b) of the
Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002. Where very low numbers of staff or students are concerned,
and the institution itself is relatively small, it is accordingly easier to discover their identities. The University
needs to ensure that identification of individuals, and the disclosure of their personal data, is not thereby

directly or indirectly revealed.

Notes for question 1:

Items 1. - shows the total number of students enrolled in the University in the final semester of
academic year 2020/21. This includes all levels and modes of study and includes intake and continuing
students. 3 year pre-reg nursing students detailed in the table as requested.

Item 1.2 shows the total number split by nationality as declared by students on enrolment.

Items 1.3 shows the total number split by ethnicity.

Item 1.4 shows the total number split by disability.

1. Inthe final semester of the academic year 2020/2021 how many students in total (across all levels
and modes of study) studied at your institution? 17,316.
Of this total please provide a breakdown by:

1.2 Nationality

Nationality Name Academic Year
2020/21

British National 9525
Scottish 1511
Nigerian 1090
Sri Lankan 587
Irish 477
Indian 426
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Nationality Name

Academic Year

2020/21
Polish 313
Italian 154
Chinese 141
German 130
Canadian 124
Bulgarian 113
Ghanaian 112
Spanish 106
English 104
Thai 97
Malaysian 89
French 87
Swiss 85
Egyptian 82
Romanian 81
American 78
Pakistani 71
Hungarian 65
Greek 61
Russian 60
Lithuanian 56
Portuguese 55
Vietnamese 53
Latvian 53
Finnish 50
Austrian 50
South African 47
Dutch 46
Zimbabwean 43
Myanmarese (Burmese) 40
Kenyan 40
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Nationality Name

Academic Year

2020/21
Australian 37
South Korean 36
Slovak 35
Jordanian 33
Turkish 29
Czech 29
Lebanese 28
United Kingdom 27
Swedish 27
Indonesian 27
I[ranian 25
Ukrainian 24
Philippine 24
Mexican 23
Hong Kong 23
Nepalese 22
Kazakh 20
Iraqi 20
Brazilian 20
Trinidad and Tobago 18
Ugandan 16
Taiwanese 16
Singaporean 15
Estonian 15
Cypriot (European Union) 15
Sudanese 13
Omani 13
Danish 13
Maltese 12
Bangladeshi 12

Jamaican

11
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Nationality Name

Academic Year

2020/21

Belgian 11
Zambian 10
Saudi Arabian 10
Mauritian 10
Kuwaiti 10
Angolan 10
Syrian 9
Serbian

Northern Irish

New Zealander

Mongolian

Croatian

Botswanan

Welsh

Japanese

Cambodian

Norwegian

Venezuelan

Uzbek

Moroccan

Libyan

Barbadian

Albanian

Yemeni

Tanzanian

Unknown

Namibian

Malawian
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Nationality Name

Academic Year

2020/21
Guyanese 5
Cameroonian 5
Belarusian 5
Algerian 5
Sierra Leone <5
Peruvian <5
Malagasy <5
Bruneian <5
Bosnian <5
Azerbaijani <5
Tunisian <5
St Lucia <5
Slovenian <5
Mozambican <5
Luxembourger <5
Colombian <5
Channel Islander - Guernsey <5
Virgin Islander (British) <5
Tongan <5
Swazi <5
Palestinian <5
Lesotho <5
Lao <5
Icelander <5
Gambian <5
Cayman Islands <5
British Antarctic Territory <5
Afghan <5
Togolese <5
South Sudanese <5
Senegalese <5
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Nationality Name

Academic Year

2020/21
Salvadorean <5
Qatari <5
Paraguayan <5
Panamanian <5
Montenegrin <5
Moldovan <5
Maldivian <5
Liberian <5
Kyrgyz Republic <5
Ivorian <5
Isle of Man <5
Honduran <5
Guinean <5
Grenadian <5
Georgian <5
Gabonese <5
Fijian <5
Ecuadorian <5
Costa Rican <5
Congolese (DRC) <5
Channel Islander - Jersey <5
Burundian <5
Bahraini <5
Argentine <5
Antigua and Barbuda <5
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1.3 Ethnicity
Ethnicity Academic Year

2020
Asian 2301
Black 1814
Other 1450
White 11751

1.4 The number that were required to provide evidence of English Language competence to
commence study due to International status.

5,348 Students, across all levels and modes of study would have been asked to provide evidence.

1.5 Disability, as a total figure and where possible a breakdown of type, for example in the
following format:

A No disability

B social/communication impairment such as Asperger's syndrome/other autistic spectrum
disorder

C Blind or have a serious visual impairment uncorrected by glasses

D Deaf or have a serious hearing impairment

E Long standing illness or health condition such as cancer, HIV, diabetes, chronic heart disease, or
epilepsy

F Mental health condition, such as depression, schizophrenia or anxiety disorder

G Specific learning difficulty such as dyslexia, dyspraxia or AD(H)D

H Physical impairment or mobility issues, such as difficulty using your arms or using a wheelchair
or crutches

| Disability, impairment or medical condition that is not listed above

J Two or more impairments and/or disabling medical conditions

The University does not record or breakdown data regarding disabilities in the categories listed
above. We have provided the data we do record below. All other categories fall into information
not held and is therefore exempt under section 17 of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act

2002.
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Disability Full Name Academic Year
2020
No disability 14207
A specific learning difficulty such as
) 999
dyslexia
A mental health condition, such as
. 929
depression
Two or more impairments 590
A long standing iliness or health
o 238
condition
A disability, impairment or medical
. 208
condition
A social/communication 59
impairment.
Deaf or have a serious hearing 45
impairment.
Physical impairment or mobility 27
issues.
Blind or have a serious visual 14
impairment.
Nul 7

2. Academic misconduct questions:
Total number of referrals:
2.1 In the final semester of the academic year 2020/2021 how many students were referred for
academic misconduct (institution wide)? If a student was referred more than once, please only
count them once.
237 cases Academic Misconduct were considered across all of Session 2020/21. Some of these
included multiple cases.
Of that number please provide a breakdown (in numbers) by:
The University does not record academic misconduct data broken down by any of the categories
below accept by domicile. For those referred, the breakdown by domicile is as follows: 100 Home,
4 Other, 122 Overseas, 11 Rest of UK.
Therefore, for all other categories below and under section 17 of the Freedom of Information

(Scotland) Act 2002, | give notice that this is information not held.

2.2 Nationality

Information is not held.

2.3 Ethnicity.
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Information is not held.

2.4 The number that were required to provide evidence of English Language competence to
commence study due to International status.

Information is not held.

2.5 Disability, as a total figure and where possible a breakdown of type, for example in the
following format:

Information is not held.

A No disability

Information is not held.

B social/communication impairment such as Asperger's syndrome/other autistic spectrum
disorder

Information is not held.

C Blind or have a serious visual impairment uncorrected by glasses

Information is not held.

D Deaf or have a serious hearing impairment

Information is not held.

E Long standing illness or health condition such as cancer, HIV, diabetes, chronic heart disease, or

epilepsy

Information is not held.

F Mental health condition, such as depression, schizophrenia or anxiety disorder

Information is not held.

G Specific learning difficulty such as dyslexia, dyspraxia or AD(H)D

Information is not held.
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H Physical impairment or mobility issues, such as difficulty using your arms or using a wheelchair

or crutches Information is not held.

| Disability, impairment or medical condition that is not listed above
J Two or more impairments and/or disabling medical conditions

Information is not held.

3. Total cases proved / substantiated
3.1. In the final semester of the academic year 2020/2021 how many student cases of academic
misconduct (institution wide) were found proven/ substantiated? If a student was referred more
than once, please only count them once.
Of 237 referred across all of Session 2020/21, 197 were established. Some of these included

multiple cases.

Of that number please provide a breakdown (in numbers) by:

The University does not record academic misconduct data broken down by any of the categories
below accept by domicile. Of 197 established, the breakdown by domicile is as follows: 81 Home,
4 Other, 101 overseas, Rest of UK 11.

Therefore, for all other categories below and under section 17 of the Freedom of Information

(Scotland) Act 2002, | give notice that this is information not held.

3.2. Nationality

Information is not held.

3.3 Ethnicity.

Information is not held.

3.4 The number that were required to provide evidence of English Language competence to
commence study due to International status.

Information is not held.

3.5 Disability, as a total figure and where possible a breakdown of type, for example in the
following format:

A No disability
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Information is not held.

B Social/communication impairment such as Asperger's syndrome/other autistic spectrum
disorder

Information is not held.

C Blind or have a serious visual impairment uncorrected by glasses

Information is not held.

D Deaf or have a serious hearing impairment

Information is not held.

E Long standing illness or health condition such as cancer, HIV, diabetes, chronic heart disease, or

epilepsy

Information is not held.

F Mental health condition, such as depression, schizophrenia or anxiety disorder

Information is not held.

G Specific learning difficulty such as dyslexia, dyspraxia or AD(H)D

Information is not held.

H Physical impairment or mobility issues, such as difficulty using your arms or using a wheelchair
or crutches

Information is not held.

| Disability, impairment or medical condition that is not listed above

Information is not held.

J Two or more impairments and/or disabling medical conditions

Information is not held.

4, Does your institution use Turnitin to help staff identify cases of academic misconduct?

Yes.
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5. Does your institution give students access to Turnitin to help students understand academic
misconduct prior to submission of work?

Yes.



