West Midlands Police Freedom of Information

Request reference: 4110/10

1. The total running cost of 1 TETRA HANDHELD TERMINAL for a period of 1
year.

The cost of a terminal with maintenance is £363.

2. The total running cost of ALL TETRA TERMINALS this includes
HANDHELDS, MOBILE, BASE UNITS ETC for a period of 1 year.

The annual bill for using the Airwave radio system in 2009/10 was £2,970,060.

3. The total running cost of the old style ANALOGUE RADIO HANDHELD
TERMINAL for a period of one year prior to the introduction of the digital
network.

Data not held. Old Information is not available.

4. The total running cost of ALL ANALOGUE RADIO TERMINALS this includes
HANDHELDS, MOBILE, BASE UNITS, REPEATERS ETC for a period of 1 year,
this is prior to the introduction of the digital network.

Data not held. Old Information is not available.

5. The total running cost of ALL TETRA TERMINALS this includes
HANDHELDS, MOBILE, BASE UNITS ETC since your force changed to the
AIRWAVE/TETRA network. This is not to include the initial purchase of
terminals but is to include any other costs incurred in gaining access to
network.

See answer to question 2.

6. The total running cost of of ALL ANALOGUE RADIO TERMINALS this
includes HANDHELDS, MOBILE, BASE UNITS, REPEATERS ETC for a period
matching the timescale of Q5. i.e. if your force has only been on the
AIRWAVE/TETRA network for 2 years and 4mths please only give the running
costs for 2 years and 4 mths of the analogue system.

Data not held. Old Information is not available.

7. The total amount of TETRA TERMINALS that have been reported as being
lost QTY & £.

For the period 01 January 2004 up to 06 December 2010 a total of 123 terminals are
recorded as lost.

8. The total amount of ANALOGUE RADIOS that were reported as being lost
QTY & £ for a period matching the timescale of Q7.

Data not held. Old Information is not available.
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