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Mr Carroll 

Our Ref: ER/C/ 766 

Your Ref: Email of 08 August 2011 

Date: 24 August 2011  

 

 

 

 

 
Dear Mr Carroll 

RE: Request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA) / 
Environmental Information Regulations 2004 (EIR) 
 
Thank you for your enquiry which was received on 08 August 2011. 
  
Requests for information that is recorded are generally governed by the Freedom of 
Information Act 2000 (FOIA).The information you have requested is environmental and 
it is therefore exempted from the provisions of FOIA by FOIA s.39(1). We have 
therefore considered your request under the provisions of the Environmental 
Information Regulations 2004 (EIR). 
  
You asked us to provide: 
1.      a list of alleged 3,100 residential and commercial properties that the Environment 
Agency claims are still at risk of flooding following the River Tame flood risk 
management strategy. ... a list of these properties by house number, street and 
postcode.  

2.    the additional 2,300 properties by the same method, that it is claimed are likely to 
be at risk from "climate change" impact.  

3.   What methods were used to calculate the properties at risk from "climate change",  

To deal with the elements of your request in order: 
1.  It is not possible for the Environment Agency to provide a list of properties in the 
form you have requested. To identify areas at risk of flooding we use specialist 
computer mapping software.  This software identifies the geographical location of the 
properties, which are represented as individual points on a map.  There is an obligation 
on a public authority to provide information held at the time of a request; in the case of 
house numbers, street names and post-codes in the areas referred to in the River Tame 
Flood Risk Strategy, we do not hold this information and accordingly the duty to make 
information available to you under EIR Regulation 5(1) does not arise because in 
accordance with EIR Regulation 3(2) we do not hold the information you have 
requested. EIR Regulation 12(4)(a) also applies – we do not hold the information that 
you have requested. 
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2. As above, the information you have requested is not held in the form of house 
numbers, street names or post-codes, and the duty to provide information does not 
arise. 
3. The methods used to calculate the size of the area potentially affected by climate 
change are detailed in the Environment Agency's publication Adapting to Climate 
Change: Advice for Flood & Coastal Erosion Risk Management Authorities 
http://publications.environment-agency.gov.uk/PDF/GEHO0711BTZU-E-E.pdf 
  
I hope that we have correctly interpreted your request.  Please see the Standard Notice 
for details of permitted use. 
  
If you are not satisfied with our response to your request for information you can contact 
us to ask for our decision to be reviewed.  If you are still not satisfied following this, you 
can then make an appeal to the Information Commissioner, who is the statutory 
regulator for Freedom of Information.   
 
The address is:  
 
Office of the Information Commissioner, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, 
Cheshire SK9 5AF. 
Tel: 01625 545700.  
Fax: 01625 524 510.  
E-mail:xxxx@xxx.xxx.xxx.xx.   
Website: http//www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk 
 
 
Yours sincerely 
  
 
 
External Relations Officer 
Direct e-mail:- xxxxxxxxxxx@xxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxx.xxx.xx 
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Standard Notice [not for use with Special Data, Personal Data or unlicensed 3rd party rights]     

Information warning 

We (The Environment Agency) do not promise that the Information supplied to You will always be accurate, free from 
viruses and other malicious or damaging code (if electronic), complete or up to date or that the Information will 
provide any particular facilities or functions or be suitable for any particular purpose. You must ensure that the 
Information meets your needs and are entirely responsible for the consequences of using the Information. Please 
also note any specific information warning or guidance supplied to you. 

Permitted use 

•  The Information is protected by intellectual property rights and whilst you have certain statutory rights which 

include the right to read the Information, you are granted no additional use rights whatsoever unless you agree to 
the licence set out below.  

•  Commercial use is subject to payment of a £50 licence fee (+VAT) for each person seeking the benefit of the 

licence, except for use as an Environment Agency contractor or for approved media use.  

•  To activate this licence you do not need to contact us (unless you need to pay us a Commercial licence fee) but 

if you make any use in excess of your statutory rights you are deemed to accept the terms below. 

Licence 

We grant you a worldwide, royalty-free, perpetual, non-exclusive licence to use the Information subject to the 
conditions below.  

You are free to: 

copy, publish, distribute and transmit the Information 

 

adapt the Information 

 

exploit the Information commercially, for example, by combining it with other Information, or by including it 
in your own product or application 

 

You must (where you do any of the above): 

acknowledge the source of the Information by including the following attribution statement:  

 

“Contains Environment Agency information © Environment Agency and database right” 

ensure that you do not use the Information in a way that suggests any official status or that We endorse 
you or your use of the Information  

 

ensure that you do not mislead others or misrepresent the Information or its source or use the Information 
in a way that is detrimental to the environment, including the risk of reduced future enhancement 

 

ensure that your use of the Information does not breach the Data Protection Act 1998 or the Privacy and 
Electronic Communications (EC Directive) Regulations 2003 

 

These are important conditions and if you fail to comply with them the rights granted to you under this licence, or any 
similar licence granted by us will end automatically. 

No warranty 

The Information is licensed ‘as is’ and We exclude all representations, warranties, obligations and liabilities in relation 
to the Information to the maximum extent permitted by law. We are not liable for any errors or omissions in the 
Information and shall not be liable for any loss, injury or damage of any kind caused by its use. We do not guarantee 
the continued supply of the Information. 

Governing Law 

This licence is governed by the laws of England and Wales.  

Definitions 

“Information” means the information that is protected by copyright or by database right (for example, literary and 
artistic works, content, data and source code) offered for use under the terms of this licence.  

“Commercial” means: 
ƒ  offering a product or service containing the Information, or any adaptation of it, for a charge, or 
ƒ  Internal Use for any purpose, or offering a product or service based on the Information for indirect commercial 

advantage, by an organisation that is primarily engaged in trade, commerce or a profession 

 

Contact: xxxxxxxxx@xxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxx.xxx.xx        03708 506506 
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