Feeney, Joe

Subject: FW: Reply from Julie Thompson, DHSSPS F8 ...cceeecerveecrecncrennsessvsseesressensnes

From: Walsh, Tracey [mailto:Tracey.Walsh@dhsspsni.gov.uk]
Sent: 05 April 2012 11:44

Subject: FW: Reply from Julie Thompson, DHSSPS re [N

For information.
Thanks.

Tracey

From: Chammings Greg (ED) [mailto:greg.chammings@bis.gsi.gov.uk]
Sent: 05 April 2012 11:43

To: Walsh, Tracey
Cc: Harrison Andy (ED)

Subject: RE: Reply from Julie Thompson, DHSSPS re N

thanks Tracey

| did wonder if the interpretation of financial loss is at odds with the legislation. In practice, any
payment not made by the date set out in the contract automatically attracts a compensation
fee plus daily interest - it isn't a matter of financial cost to the supplier, it is a right. But perhaps |
have misread the advice?

Greg Chammings | Enterprise Policy & Strategy | Department for Business, Innovation & Skills | E
greg.chammings@bis.gsi.pov.uk | T+44 (0) 20 7215 1814 | www.bis.gov.uk | Blog: blogs.bis.gov.uk | Twitter: @bisgovuk

The Department for Business, Innovation & Skills {815) is making a difference by supporting sustained growth and higher skills
across the economy.

BIS: working together for growth

From: Walsh, Tracey [mailto: Tracey.Walsh@dhsspsni.gsi.qgov.uk]
Sent: 05 April 2012 09:30

To: Chammings Greg (ED)

Subject: FW: Reply from Julie Thompson, DHSSPS re |

Please find attached letter sent on behalf of Julie Thompson.
Many thanks.

Tracey Walsh

PS to Julie Thompson
DHSSPS

Room CS5.22

Castle Buildings
Stormont, BT4 35Q



