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 10 September 2019 

Dear Mr Bhamjee, 
  
Thank you for your e-mail of 3rd September requesting an internal review of the Judicial 
Appointments Commission’s (JAC) handling of your Freedom in Information request of the 1st and 
2nd September 2019. In this request you asked for the following information:  
 

I, Ismail Abdulhai Bhamjee hereby make a request that:- 
 
1.  You do process the Appointment of Judges for England and Wales. 
 
2.  The Lord Chief Justice than Assigns them to Sit at a Particular court or Tribunal 
 
3.   I understand that Lady Justice Rafferty is a Judge and Sits in the Divisional Court, 
and in the Court of Appeal. 
 
4.   Your Office does have the decision of WILKINSON Versus Rossendale Borough Council which 
was decided in the year 2002 [2002]  30-05-2002. 
 
I am waiting for a copy of the Sealed Order as I have Paid the Court Fees £10-00 from the 
Administrative Court office. 
 
Your Office may obtain copies of the orders without paying any amount money. 
 
5.  ARE DISTRICT JUDGES AND HIGH COURT JUDGES ALLOWED TO DISAPPLY THE 
PARLIAMENTS ACTS AND GIVE INJUNCTION ORDERS BECAUSE OF REPEALED STATUTES 
ACT.  The Supreme Court of Jurisdiction and Consolidation Act 1925 was repealed under Schedule 
7 of the SCA 1981 

 
In his reply, Mr Thomson explained that the Judicial Appointments Commission (JAC) is only 
responsible for recommending candidates for appointment to judicial positions following a fair and 
open recruitment process. It has no responsibility for the deployment of judges, nor does it hold 
decisions made by judicial members. Mr Thomson explained therefore that he was unable to assist 
you with your request as the JAC does not hold the information you have requested. He suggested 
that you approach the Judicial Office whose purpose is to support the judiciary in upholding the 
rule of law and in delivering justice impartially, speedily and efficiently.  
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The Judicial Office was set up following the Constitutional Reform Act 2005, under which the Lord 
Chief became Head of the Judiciary with responsibilities in relation to: 

• representing the views of the judiciary of England and Wales to Parliament, the Lord 
Chancellor and ministers generally; 

• maintaining arrangements for the welfare, training and guidance of the judiciary, within the 
resources made available by the Lord Chancellor; 

• maintaining arrangements for the deployment of judges and the allocation of work within 
the courts. 

 
Mr Thomson provided you with a link Judicial Office website where you could make a similar 
Freedom of Information Request. 
 
As part of your request for review you have mentioned that the enquiry you made at point 5 of your 
email has not been responded to. You also request details at the Green Bench Book, and ask 
whether the JAC has copies of the Legal Services Act 2007 Schedule 3 and Schedule 21.  
 
In reviewing your request, I have looked at all the documents. Whilst I do appreciate your concern, 
and can understand how important this issue is to you, I agree with Mr Thomson’s original decision 
that the matters you raise in your request does not fall within the Judicial Appointments 
Commission jurisdiction and thus it is not able to respond to your request.  

The Judicial Appointments Commission primarily responsibility is to undertake specific recruitment 
exercises to recommend candidates to Judicial positions. It is not responsible for the deployment of 
judges, the decision of judges, or for the content of relevant legislation. Nor does it hold copies of 
legislation which can be reasonably found otherwise. For example, in your email you ask whether 
the JAC has the “Legal Services Act 2007 Schedule 3 and Schedule 21. I can confirm that the JAC 
does not hold this information, though is able to access this by undertaking a search in the intranet. 
I enclose a link which provides this information 
(http://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2007/29/schedule/3). 

You have mentioned that Mr Thomson did not respond to your paragraph 5 of your initial request, 
in which you ask a question about the roles of District and High Court Judges. I accept that Mr 
Thomson did not specifically respond to this, but do consider that he made clear that it does not fall 
within the JAC jurisdiction to make such comment. The JAC does have a narrow remit, and is not 
responsible for making comments/views about the Judiciary or the law. 

Finally, I note you make reference to Lady Justice Rafferty as being Chair of the Judicial 
Appointments Commission. I should make it clear that Lady Justice Rafferty is the vice Chair of 
Judicial Appointments Commission. The actual Chair is Professor Lord Ajay Kakkar, and further 
information on the work of the JAC Commissioners can be found here. 
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Therefore, as requested, I have reviewed the handling of your Freedom of Information request and 
have found that it was properly considered, and furthermore that the explanation that your request 
did not fall within the JAC’s jurisdiction was correct.  
 
If you remain dissatisfied after an internal review decision, you have the right to apply to the 
Information Commissioner’s Office under Section 50 of the FOIA.  You can contact the Information 
Commissioner’s Office at the following address: 
 
Information Commissioner’s Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire 
Internet:  https://www.ico.gov.uk/Global/contact_us.aspx 
 
Yours sincerely 
 

 
 
 
Steven Ball 
Corporate Services 
Judicial Appointments Commission 
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