
 

Freedom of Information 

Internal Review decision 
 

Internal Reviewer Lawyer – Legal Workplace and Information Rights 

Reference RFI20181504 /  IR2018071 
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Requested information 

 

On 1 August 2018, you requested that the BBC provide the following information under the 

Freedom of Information Act 2000 (‘the Act’):   

“Details of your procedure for reporting copyright infringements. Please include full details of 

how reports are made, how reports are processed and how reports are accessed. If this 

information is already in the public domain please provide a link to the location of the 

information. 

How many times this procedure has been used within the last year. Please provide this data by 

calendar month.  

The statistics about the courses of action taken for each report.” 

On 28 August 2018, the BBC responded that:  

 

“The BBC does not hold a central record of infringing content that has been taken down from 

websites such as YouTube, Facebook, Instagram or Twitter, or details of individual accounts 

against which notices are filed. In order to identify number of requests made by calendar month 

and the details of the course of action taken for each report, , the BBC would need to review 

each individual infringement notice and the URLs within each notice, during the period of your 

request. It is not possible to retrospectively determine the accounts that have been terminated 

by the respective platforms; the BBC does not hold this information.  

 

Under Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, we are not obliged to comply with a 

request for information if compliance would exceed “the appropriate limit” - set under 

regulation 3(3) of Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) 

Regulations 2004 (‘the Regulations’) as being £450 (equivalent to two and a half days’ work at 

an hourly rate of £25).  

 

To provide further advice and assistance in accordance with the BBC’s obligations under the FOI 

Act, the BBC has searched the records available to us and can confirm that the total number of 

requests issued by the BBC’s Intellectual Property Legal team from July 2017 to July 2018 on 

the basis of intellectual property infringements (including copyright) across all of the major social 

media platforms (YouTube, Facebook, Twitter, Instagram) was approximately 630. A single 

infringement notice can include URLs to multiple individual videos, which may not necessarily be 

connected to a single account. 

 

The forms used to submit infringement notices are specific to each platform and are publicly 

available on their websites; however, for your convenience here are links to the forms on:  
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 Facebook [https://www.facebook.com/help/contact/trademarkform]; 

 Twitter [https://help.twitter.com/forms/trademark];  

 Instagram [https://help.instagram.com/222826637847963]; and  

 Below is an example of YouTube’s current form.  

 

 
The BBC acts irrespective of political views and has taken action against the use of BBC 

material by individuals or organisations from across the political spectrum.” 

 

On 29 August 2018, you sought internal review on the basis that the BBC’s initial response did 

not address the first part of your request for the “procedure for reporting copyright infringements” 

and “how reports are made, how reports are processed and how reports are accessed”. You also 

clarified that you want to know “how reports about potential copyright infringements are made to the 

BBC, how the BBC processes those reports and how those reports are accessed”.  

 

The issues for review  

 

In the circumstances, this review will consider: 

 

1) whether the BBC complied with its obligation under section 1(1)(a) of the FOI Act in 

confirming or denying that it holds recorded information relevant to part 1 of your 

request; and  

2) if this information is held, whether the BBC is required to communicate this information 

to you pursuant to section 1(1)(b) of the FOI Act, or whether: 

a. all or any part of this information falls within the exemption from disclosure 

under section 43(2) of the FOI Act on the basis that disclosure would be likely 

to prejudice the commercial interests of the BBC; and  

b. if so, whether the public interest in maintaining the exemption outweighs the 

public interest in disclosure.  

 

 

 

https://www.facebook.com/help/contact/trademarkform
https://help.twitter.com/forms/trademark
https://help.instagram.com/222826637847963
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Decision 

 

I consider that the BBC holds additional recorded information that is within the scope of the 

broader request for information about the BBC’s procedures for reporting copyright 

infringement. This information was identified as being relevant pursuant to the clarification you 

provided when seeking internal review.  However, I am satisfied that the BBC does not hold any 

information about the procedures for how members of the public and other external entities 

can report copyright infringements to the BBC.  

 

I consider that some of the information that is held within the scope of the broader request is 

subject to disclosure. This information is provided in the enclosed Disclosure Document.  

 

In addition, there is some information within the scope of the broader request that I consider to 

be exempt from disclosure under section 43(2) of the FOI Act, as disclosure would be 

prejudicial to the BBC’s commercial interests. I am satisfied that the public interest in 

maintaining the exemption outweighs that of disclosure.  

 

The reasons for my decision are set out below.  

 

Reasons for decision  

 

Issue (1) – whether the BBC complied with its duty to confirm or deny 

 

Information about the BBC’s copyright procedures  

 

The FOI Act provides a general right of access to recorded information held by public 

authorities. Section 1 of FOI Act provides that any person making a request for information is 

entitled to be told whether the public authority holds the information requested and, if held, to 

be provided with it.  

 

I note that the BBC provided some information about the procedures for issuing copyright 

infringement notices in the initial response. In particular, the response noted that the forms 

used to submit infringement notices are specific to each platform and are publicly available on 

the websites of those platforms. The links to the forms for Facebook, Twitter and Instagram, as 

well as an example of YouTube’s current form, were provided for your reference. However, as 

you have clarified the scope of your request while seeking internal review, I have liaised with the 

Intellectual Property team within BBC Legal (IP Legal) and identified additional information that 

is relevant to your request for information about the BBC’s procedures for reporting copyright 

infringements.   

 

The information that is held falls into the following categories:  
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(A) the steps involved in reporting copyright infringements on various platforms, drawing on 

the information published by those platforms. This information is a practical guidance 

note to new joiners rather than a statement of process. (Note that this information was 

collated by the IP Legal team between 2012 and 2015. Therefore, some of the 

information, such as URLs and processes, may no longer be current; in particular the 

YouTube process has changed since this note was created);  

(B) internal know-how and advice that draws upon the BBC’s own experiences with 

copyright infringement matters; and  

(C) other intellectual property issues, such as trademarks.  

 

I consider that the information in categories (A) and (B) broadly falls within the scope of your 

request for the BBC’s “procedures” relating to copyright infringement. I consider that the 

information within category (C) is outside the scope of your request, as this information relates 

to other intellectual property issues.  

 

How reports of copyright infringement are made to the BBC  

 

Your request also sought “full details of how reports are made, how reports are processed and how 

reports are accessed”. In your request for internal review, you clarified that this meant 

information about “how reports about potential copyright infringements are made to the BBC…”  

 

In the circumstances, I have understood this part of your request as relating to information 

about how members of the public and other external sources can report copyright 

infringements to the BBC; how the BBC deals with any such reports; and how they can be 

accessed.   

 

IP Legal has confirmed that, in some instances, complaints about potential copyright 

infringement may be received from outside the BBC, through the BBC’s Audience Services. 

However, the BBC does not have any specific procedures in place for this type of reporting. It is 

open to members of the public, and any other external entity, to comment on or complain 

about any aspect of the BBC and the BBC’s services using Audience Services.  

 

Complaints that raise copyright issues will be referred by Audience Services to IP Legal as a 

matter of practice as opposed to a documented procedure. IP Legal will then assess the legal 

position as it applies to the facts and take decisions at a purely legal and rights level. The BBC 

makes these decisions irrespective of how it became aware of the infringement, and whether 

this was an internal or external source.     

 

In these circumstances, I confirm that the BBC does not hold any recorded information that is 

relevant to the specificity of your request for “how reports about potential copyright infringements 

are made to the BBC, how the BBC processes those reports and how those reports are accessed”.  
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Conclusion on whether information is held  

 

Overall, I find that following clarification of the scope of your request, the BBC holds some 

additional information falling within categories (A) and (B), above, that is broadly relevant to 

your request for information about the BBC’s procedures for reporting copyright infringements.  

 

I will consider whether the BBC is required to communicate the information in categories (A) 

and (B) to you pursuant to section 1(1)(b) of the FOI Act below.   

 

Issue (2)(a) – duty to communicate  

 

Information in category (A)  

 

I consider that the information in category (A) is subject to disclosure. This information has 

been provided in the Disclosure Document.   

 

Information in category (B)  

 

I will now consider whether the information in category (B) is subject to disclosure, or whether 

this information is exempt under section 43(2) of the FOI Act. This section relevantly provides 

that “information is exempt information if its disclosure under this Act would, or would be likely to, 

prejudice the commercial interests of any person (including the public authority holding it).” 

 

As mentioned above, this information relates to the IP Legal team’s internal approach and know-

how, drawing on their past experiences and lessons learnt. This information is intended as 

guidance and advice for new lawyers, and contains legally sensitive information. There is a real 

risk that the disclosure of this information would expose the BBC to an increased risk of 

exploitation of any perceived loopholes in the BBC’s processes for copyright protection. In 

addition, there is a real risk that the disclosure of this information would undermine the BBC’s 

position in respect of the legal processes that need to be undertaken for enforcing copyright 

protection.  

 

While the BBC is a public services broadcaster, we operate in a competitive environment with 

other public and private broadcasters and media outlets. The BBC invests significant resources 

and skill in producing its content and the processes that we have in place for enforcing copyright 

protection are a means of protecting this output from unauthorised use and other infringing and 

harmful conduct. You will of course be aware that the BBC earns revenue from the commercial 

exploitation of its intellectual property rights worldwide, which is reinvested in further public 

service content. Given this, and the breadth and quality of BBC content, the infringement of our 

intellectual property rights is a real risk that we must be alive to. 

 

In this way, the processes that are in place for intellectual property rights protection are an 

important means of protecting the BBC’s brand and reputation, and parts of its revenue. For 
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these reasons, the disclosure of the information in category (B) would have a prejudicial effect 

on the BBC’s ability to compete on a fair and equal footing in the broadcasting and media 

market.   

 

I am therefore satisfied that the disclosure of the information is likely to be prejudicial to the 

BBC’s commercial interests. Therefore, I consider this information to be exempt under section 

43(2) of the FOI Act. 

 

Issue (2b) – public interest test  

 

Having found that the information in category (B) is exempt under section 43(2) of the FOI Act, 

I must now consider whether the public interest in maintaining the exemption outweighs the 

public interest in disclosure.  

 

In line with the ICO’s guidance and the comments of the Information Tribunal in Department for 

Business, Enterprise and Regulatory Reform v Information Commissioner and Friends of the Earth 

(EA/2007/0072, 29 April 2008), when carrying out the public interest test, it is the 

circumstances at the time of the request which should be considered.  In addition, the public 

interest means the public good, not what is of interest to the public, and not the private 

interests of the requester.1 

 

In favour of disclosure, I consider that there is a broad public interest in the transparency and 

accountability of the BBC’s processes.  

 

Against disclosure, I consider that there is a strong public interest in ensuring that the BBC is 

able to protect its intellectual property rights and the integrity of its content. There is also a 

public interest in ensuring that the BBC’s brand and reputation and its commercial income are 

not unfairly damaged through infringement activities and the exploitation of its content. In 

addition, I consider that there is a public interest in protecting the integrity of legal processes 

and the BBC’s ability to utilise these processes on an equal footing as others in the market.  

 

In weighing these countervailing factors, I am satisfied that the balance of the public interest lies 

in maintaining the exemption. In particular, I give significant weight to the public interest in 

ensuring that the integrity of BBC content, and the BBC’s reputation, is not unfairly 

compromised. This is not only in the commercial interests of the BBC; it is also a public duty 

that safeguards value-for-money to licence fee payers.  

 

Additional information  

 

I note that there is some data in the information that I have found to be exempt under section 

43(2) of the FOI Act that would also likely be exempt under section 40(2) of the FOI Act on the 

                                                           

1 Grace Szucs v the Information Commissioner (EA/2011/0072), 16 August 2011. 
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basis that disclosure would be contrary to the requirements under the General Data Protection 

Regulation to process personal data fairly and lawfully.  

 

Appeal Rights  

 

If you are not satisfied with the outcome of your internal review, you can appeal to the 

Information Commissioner. The contact details are: Information Commissioner’s Office, 

Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire SK9 5AF; Telephone 01625 545 700 or 

https://ico.org.uk/ 

 

 

 

 

 

 

https://ico.org.uk/

