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Re Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA)

I write further to your request for a review of the Council's decision of 28 January
2019 in relation to your request for the following information;

/l breakdown of the method of calculation of fees charged to private hire vehicles and
hackney carriage owners/operators, together with the amounts levied against each
head of expense for the financial years 2011/12, 2012/13. 2013/14, 2014/15,
2016/17 and 2017/18.

I confirm that I have conducted a review of the request and I would advise you that
the decision is partially upheld for the following reasons:

1. Your request set out above, was received by the Council on 18 December 2018.
2. As worded, the request is unclear in terms of what is requested in view of the

terminology, namely, 'A breakdown of the method of calculation of fees
charged'. This suggests two different pieces of information, both a breakdown
of fees charged and also the method of calculating those fees. Pursuant to
section 1(3) of FOIA, where a public authority reasonably requires further
information in order to identify and locate the information requested, this
should be obtained from the requester. In this case I am satisfied that the
Council should have clarified this with you, but rather made assumptions as to
what you required. You were therefore provided with details of the amounts
levied against each head of expenses within the budget held by the Licensing
Unit in relation to all hackney and private hire vehicles, drivers and operators.

3. As worded, the request is unclear in terms of what is requested in view of the
terminology, namely, 'private hire vehicles and hackney carriage
owners/operators'. As the service in questions licences all hackney and private
hire vehicles, drivers and operators, the wording of your request suggests you
only require information for private hire vehicles and hackney carriage
operators. Again, as stated above, pursuant to section 1(3) of FOIA, where a
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public authority reasonably requires further information in order to identify and
locate the information requested, this should be obtained from the requester.
In this case I am satisfied that the Council should have clarified this with you,
but rather made assumptions as to what you required. You were therefore
provided with details of the amounts levied against each head of expenses
within the budget held by the Licensing Unit in relation to all hackney and
private hire vehicles, drivers and operators.

4. In view of the position taken by the Council as stated in paragraph 2 above and
the lack of clarity in your request, I am satisfied that you could have been
directed to the page on the Council's website setting out all of the fees for all
hackney and private hire vehicles, drivers and operators, as this in my view
would amount to a 'breakdown' of the fees charged. This can be found at
htt s://www.bur . ov.uk/index.as x?articleid=10980 .

5. In relation to the 'method of calculation of fees charged', having made further
enquiries as to what information is actually held as to that matter, I am
satisfied that this information is not held by the Council, as there is no recorded
method of calculation of fees.

6. The Council does have a duty under section 16 FOIA to provide requesters with
advice and assistance and I am satisfied that this is the reason for the

provision of the information that was sent to you. However, you should have
been advised that pursuant to section 1 of FOIA, the information was not held.

7. Further, I note that the response of 28 January 2019 refers to an exemption
under section 12 of FOIA. As the information requested was not held, there was
in fact no requirement to provide a refusal notice with an exemption, but rather
one explaining that the information was not held and providing advice and
assistance. However, I am satisfied that the result was the same and that you
obtained information by way of advice and assistance that placed you in a
preferential position.

8. In conclusion, although this request was not dealt with correctly and you were
not directed to the Council's main website for further information, I am
satisfied no real prejudice was caused to you.

If you are not content with the outcome of the internal review, you have the right
to apply directly to the Information Commissioner for a decision. The Information
Commissioner can be contacted at:

Information Commissioner's Officer

Wycliffe House
Water Lane
Wilmslow
Cheshire
SK9 5AF

www. ico. or . uk

Tel: 0303 123 1113

Yours faithfully

ou olicitor

Electronic or fax service of Legal documents is not accepted
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