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My  r e f e r e n c e  

Yo u r  r e f e r e n c e  

E ma i l  

E nq u i r i e s  t o  

D i r e c t  L i n e  

Da t e  

 
Dear Mr Howle 

Information Request 

Thank you for your request for information, which was received on the 19 November 
2018.  
 
In response to your request, in which you sought the following information, to which 
we have responded to below: 
 
1) A list of all the different pedestrian crossings within Hampshire County Council 
boundaries. Including the location of all formal crossings: Zebra, Toucan, Pegasus, 
Staggered Pelican/Puffin and Toucan crossings.  
 
Please find attached a list of pedestrian crossings that Hampshire County Council 
maintain and controlled pedestrian crossings. 
 
2) Information on the type of tactile paving used at each site. 
 
Please see information on the ‘Crossing FOI’ attachment. 
 
3) A list of all lowered kerbs in the Hampshire County Council district. Showing the 
location of each and paying particular attention to the ones intended for use as 
pedestrian crossing points.  
 
This information is not held. 
 
4) The above would ideally include the use of the Geocoordinate system information 
of each site, but also the street name and location. 
 
This information is not held. Cont’d//… 

Mr E Howle 
 
By email: 
request-533212-
85643bd2@whatdotheyknow.com 
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We hope you find the information useful. 
 
Yours sincerely 
 
 
DMT Support Team 
 
 
 
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to ask for an internal 
review. Internal review requests should be submitted within 40 working days of receiving our 
response, and should be addressed to: Head of Information Compliance, Corporate Services, 
The Castle, Winchester, SO23 8UJ or emailed to foi@hants.gov.uk. 
 
If you are not content with the outcome of the internal review, you have the right to apply directly to 
the Information Commissioner for a decision. The Information Commissioner can be contacted at: 
Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF. 

 


