NHS

Blood and Transplant

Head Office

500 North Bristol Park

Our ref: CAS-260503-S4V0T8 Northway
Date: 22 May 2023 Filton
Bristol
BS34 7QH

Dear Daisy Greene,
www.nhsbt.nhs.uk

Re: Freedom of Information Request

Thank you for your request dated 26 April 2023 for information from NHS Blood and
Transplant (NHSBT) as stipulated below:

| would like the NHS to provide evidence of the following:

1. Can you confirm that, under national and international law, as well as the NHS
Constitution, adult patients with mental capacity have the right to absolute
bodily autonomy?

2. Can you provide any evidence to show that NHS policy can override a patient’s
right to absolute bodily autonomy?

3. Can you provide any evidence to show that NHS policy can override a patient’s
right to informed consent?

4. Please provide evidence to show that the NHS is now screening blood
donations for possible contamination by any of the contents of injectable,
experimental mRNA drugs?

If the NHS is NOT screening blood donations for contamination by experimental
mRNA drugs, please provide independent (that is, evidence not provided by the
pharmaceutical companies that supply the experimental mRNA drugs, or any
organisations funded by pharmaceutical companies or organisations that profit
or benefit in any way from the rollout of the experimental mRNA injectable
drugs) evidence to show with 100% accuracy that:

No components or ingredients of the experimental injectable mRNA drugs have
ever entered the bloodstream or lymphatic system of those injected with said
drugs.

Based on the previous questions, can you provide any legal precedent and/or
evidence to show that the current NHS policy of insisting staff use
contaminated (via experimental mRNA injectable drugs) NHS-stored blood for
transfusion into a patient can override said patient’s:

4.1. Right to informed consent

4.2. Right to absolute bodily autonomy

4.3. Right to not receive experimental drugs via stealth

4.4. Right to be free from discrimination based on belief (or any other protected
characteristic)

4.5. Right to the same bloodless surgery options as other protected groups
4.6. Right to be treated with dignity and respect under the NHS’s Constitution
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Under the Freedom of Information Act (FOIA) 2000 NHSBT is obliged to:

e Let you know whether we hold the information you have requested
¢ Provide you with the requested information, if held, (subject to any exemptions under
the Act which may apply).

| can confirm that NHSBT does not hold the information you have requested.

NHSBT does not hold this information. You may wish to contact NHS England.
NHSBT does not hold this information. You may wish to contact NHS England.
NHSBT does not hold this information. You may wish to contact NHS England.
The vaccination status of the donor is not recorded on blood components.
Recipients cannot request that they receive blood from vaccinated/not-
vaccinated individuals.
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You may wish to contact NHS England for information regarding blood
transfusion and recipients who are exempt from the vaccine.

If you are dissatisfied with the response to your request, you can ask for a review of the
handling of your request for information. Details of the complaint procedure are below:

Any person who has requested information from NHSBT, which has been dealt with under
the FOIA is entitled to make a complaint and request an internal review of the handling of
their request if they are dissatisfied with the response they have received. If you would like
us to conduct such a review, as per guidance from the Information Commissioners Office
(ICO) please contact us within forty working days of this letter. Please quote the reference
number above in any future communications.

Yours sincerely,

Dan Jeffery
Deputy Senior Information Risk Officer (SIRO)
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And

Wayne Lawley
Head of Corporate Communications

E-mail: FOl@nhsbt.nhs.uk



	Re: Freedom of Information Request

