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14 September 2022 
 

Ben Holdsworth 
 
 
Dear Ben Holdsworth 

Re: FOI request FOI202223/256 

Further to your request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, please find a response to your 
questions below.  
 
Q1 In the past 3 months (or the latest 3 months data you have available), how many 

melanoma patients were treated with: 
a. Bevacizumab (Avastin) 
b. Dacarbazine (DTIC) 
c. Trametinib (Mekinist) 
d. Dabrafenib (Tafinlar) 
e. Ipilimumab (Yervoy) 
f. Vemurafenib (Zelboraf) 
g. Nivolumab (Opdivo) 
h. Nivolumab + Ipilimumab (Opdivo + Yervoy) 
i. Pembrolizumab (Keytruda) • Vemurafenib + cobimetinib (Zelboraf + Cotellic)  
j. Dabrafenib + Trametinib (Tafinlar + Mekinist) • Braftovi (encorafenib) in 

combination with Mektovi (binimetinib) for BRAF V600 patients  
k. Other active systemic anti-cancer therapy [please state]  
l. Palliative care only 

  
A1 Information not held – The Trust has treated zero melanoma patients in this period 
  
Q2 In the past 3 months (or the latest 3 months data you have available), how many 

metastatic melanoma patients were treated with the following: 
a. Ipilimumab 
b. Ipilimumab AND Nivolumab 
c. Nivolumab 
d. Pembrolizumab 
e. Dabrafenib AND Trametinib 
f. Any Other Targeted Therapy (Dabrafenib /Encorafenib AND Binimetinib 

/Trametinib /Vemurafenib /Vemurafenib AND Cobimetinib)  
g. Other active systemic anti-cancer therapy  
h. Palliative care only 

  
A2 Information not held – The Trust has treated zero metastatic melanoma patients in this 

period 
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This information supplied to you is copyrighted to Alder Hey Children's NHS Foundation 
Trust. You are free to use it for your own purposes or for other specific uses permitted in 
the Copyright, Designs and Patents Act 1988. If you wish to use the information, we have 
provided for any commercial purposes including the sale of the information to a third party 
you must first obtain permission from us to do so. If we do grant such permission this may 
involve a licensing agreement and the application of a fee. 
 
Should you not be happy with the information provided you have a right to request a review of our 
response. In the first instance this should be addressed to: 
 
Information Governance Manager 
Eaton Road 
Liverpool 
L12 2AP 
 
If you ask for a review and are dissatisfied with the outcome, under Section 50 of the Freedom of 
Information Act you then have a right of appeal to the Information Commissioner. The Information 
Commissioner’s address is: 
 
Information Commissioner’s Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire 
SK9 5AF  

 
Yours sincerely 

 

Information Governance Team 
Alder Hey Children's NHS Foundation Trust  
 


