
 

1 

Reference:  FOI 36303 BUCKS 14Y 
 
Subject:  CAMHS 
 
I can confirm that the CCG does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. Breaking down the data by each month, how many young people 
were referred to CAMHS service for Tier 3 support from March 2019 
to July 2020? The CCG does not hold this information. Oxford Health NHS Foundation 

Trust may be able to assist you, if you would like to redirect your request 
please follow the link. 2. Breaking down the data by each month, how many young people 

were refused CAMHS services, because the service lacked capacity 
from March 2019 to July 2020? 

3. Regarding CAMHS services in the financial year 2018-19: 

a) How many patients waited more than 4 weeks for an initial 
assessment? (What percentage of the total is this?)  

The CCG does not hold this information. Oxford Health NHS Foundation 
Trust may be able to assist you, if you would like to redirect your request 
please follow the link. 

b) How many patients waited more than 18 weeks for an initial 
assessment? (What percentage of the total is this?)  

c) How many patients waited more than 12 months for an initial 
assessment? (What percentage of the total is this?)  

https://www.oxfordhealth.nhs.uk/foi/
https://www.oxfordhealth.nhs.uk/foi/
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d) How many patients waited more than 4 weeks to start treatment? 
(What percentage of the total is this?)  

The CCG does not hold this information. Oxford Health NHS Foundation 
Trust may be able to assist you, if you would like to redirect your request 
please follow the link. 

e) How many patients waited more than 18 weeks to start treatment? 
(What percentage of the total is this?)  

f) How many patients waited more than 12 months to start treatment? 
(What percentage of the total is this?)  

g) What was the longest wait time for treatment?  

4. Regarding CAMHS services in the financial year 2019-2020: 

a) How many patients waited more than 4 weeks for an initial 
assessment? (What percentage of the total is this?)  

The CCG does not hold this information. Oxford Health NHS Foundation 
Trust may be able to assist you, if you would like to redirect your request 
please follow the link. 

b) How many patients waited more than 18 weeks for an initial 
assessment? (What percentage of the total is this?)  

c) How many patients waited more than 12 months for an initial 
assessment? (What percentage of the total is this?)  

https://www.oxfordhealth.nhs.uk/foi/
https://www.oxfordhealth.nhs.uk/foi/
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d) How many patients waited more than 4 weeks to start treatment? 
(What percentage of the total is this?)  

The CCG does not hold this information. Oxford Health NHS Foundation 
Trust may be able to assist you, if you would like to redirect your request 
please follow the link. 

e) How many patients waited more than 18 weeks to start treatment? 
(What percentage of the total is this?)  

f) How many patients waited more than 12 months to start treatment? 
(What percentage of the total is this?)   

g) What was the longest wait time for treatment? 

 
 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 7th August 2020, and has been authorised for release by Robert Majilton, Deputy Chief 
Officer and Director of Sustainability & Transformation for NHS Buckinghamshire CCG.   

https://www.oxfordhealth.nhs.uk/foi/

