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Date:   02/10/2017 
 
Response/Digest FOI:   7406 
 
Wrexham County Borough Council does hold the information requested. 
 
Request:  
 
Inter-County Fees & Adoption Agency Fees 
 

1. The total value of Inter-County Fees received by Wrexham Council from other 
local authorities. Please provide the total value per year during the period 
2010 to 2016, along with the number of units that the value relates to. 

 
This response is from Wrexham County Borough Council as Lead 
Authority for the North Wales Adoption Service 

 
Financial Year: 
2010-2011  - Data Not Held 
2011-2012  - Data Not Held 
2012-2013  - £13,857 – 3 Children 
2013-2014  - £27,854 – 2 Children 
2014-2015 - £52,785 – 3 Children 
2015-2016 - £18,000 – 1 Child 

 
2. The total value of Adoption Agency Fees received by Wrexham Council from 

third party (external) agencies. Please provide the total value per year during 
the period 2010 to 2016, along with the number of units that the value relates 
to. 

 
2010-2016 £0 – 0 Children 
Wrexham County Borough Council as Lead Authority for the North 
Wales Adoption Service does not sell Adoption Places to Third Party 
External Agencies 

 
3. The total value of Inter-County Fees payed by Wrexham Council to other local 

authorities. Please provide the total value per year during the period 2010 t0 
2016, along with the number of units that the value relates to. 

 
This response relates to Wrexham County Borough Council Expenditure 
Only 

 
Financial Year: 
2010-2011  - £0 - 0 Children 
2011-2012  - £0 - 0 Children 



Please note that where information is subject to copyright belonging to the Council, you will need to 
obtain the permission of the Council to re-use it for purposes other than private study or non-
commercial research. The Council may charge for re-use. Where third party copyright material is 
disclosed, you must obtain permission to re-use from the copyright holders concerned. 

                                                                                                                                                                                            

2012-2013  - £0 - 0 Children 
2013-2014  - £0 – 0 Children 
2014-2015  - £27,000 – 1 Child 
2015-2016 - £60,167 – 3 Children 

 
4. The total value of Adoption Agency Fees paid by Wrexham Council to other 

third (external) agencies. Please provide the total value per year during the 
period 2010 to 2016, along with the number of units that the value relates to. 

 
This response relates to Wrexham County Borough Council Expenditure 
Only 
 
Financial Year: 
2010-2011  - £0 – 0 Children 
2011-2012  - £0 – 0 Children  
2012-2013  - £0 – 0 Children 
2013-2014  - £0 – 0 Children 
2014-2015  - £0 – 0 Children 
2015-2016  - £27,000 – 1 Child 

 


