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Dear Mr Townsend

Thank you for your email requesting information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. Please find
the response below as requested.

1. How many joiners, movers, and leavers do you process per year?
The Trust itself does not process joiners, movers and leavers. This is outsourced to NHS Shared
Business Services.

2. How many staff/whole time equivalents manage this process?
This is outsourced to NHS Shared Business Services. The Trust does not hold information on NHS
SBS staffing levels.

3. Do you have an automated system to manage ESR?
4. Do you use a single sign on solution across the organisation to manage the accounts?
5. If so, which solution do you have?

Q3-5
The Trust does not hold information on any software NHS SBS may use.

6. How many people are in your organisation's data quality team?
The Trust does not have specific data quality roles.

| trust this information meets your needs. If you have any query or concern about the handling of your
enquiry then please contact the Trust’s Freedom of Information Lead at the address below or you may ask
for a formal review. Internal review requests should be submitted within two months of the date of receipt
of this response.

If you remain dissatisfied after the internal review, you may make an approach to the Information
Commissioner.

Information Commissioner’s Office
Wycliffe House
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Water Lane
Wilmslow
Cheshire
SK9 5AF

Telephone: 01625 545700
Website: www.informationcommissioner.gov.uk

Yo incergly,

Director of People and Business lopment
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