NHS|

Crawley
Clinical Commissioning Group

Reference: FOI 23758 CRW 09H + FOI 23759 HMS 09X

Subject: GP Services

INHS|

Horsham and Mid Sussex
Clinical Commissioning Group

QUESTION

CRAWLEY CCG

HORSHAM & MID SUSSEX CCG

1.

How many GP surgeries/Family Practices/Walk-in
centres with GP services there were in your
commissioning area in 2010?

How many patients those GP surgeries/Family
Practices/Walk-in centres catered/cared for in 20107

2.a Please break this data down to provide patient

numbers per GP surgery/Family Practice/Walk-in
centre?

The CCG assumed commissioning
responsibility as of 1 April 2013
and therefore does not hold
information prior to that date.

NHS England may be able to
provide you with the information
requested.

The CCG assumed commissioning
responsibility as of 1 April 2013 and
therefore does not hold information
prior to that date.

NHS England may be able to
provide you with the information
requested.

3. What was the GP to patient ratio in your -
commissioning area in 2010? They can be contacted by following They can be cc_)r_1ta(.:ted by following
4 o the link or emailing:
the link or emailing:
4. How many GP surgeries/Family Practices/Walk-in england.contactus@nhs.net england.contactus@nhs.net
centres with GP services closed in 2010? ' '
5. How many GP surgeries/Family Practices/Walk-in

centres with GP services there were in your
commissioning areain 20157

13

23



http://www.england.nhs.uk/contact-us/foi/
mailto:xxxxxxx.xxxxxxxxx@xxx.xxx
http://www.england.nhs.uk/contact-us/foi/
mailto:xxxxxxx.xxxxxxxxx@xxx.xxx

6. How many patients those GP surgeries/Family
Practices/Walk-in centres catered/cared for in 20157

6.a Please break this data down to provide patient
numbers per GP surgery/Family Practice/Walk-in
centre?

6. 126448 registered patients as of
01/04/2015

6.a The walk in centre is not
patient list based therefore patient
numbers are not available.

Leacroft 10387
Woodlands &

Clerklands 15377
Saxonbrook 15009
Gossops Green 6843
Bridge 10580
Ifield 10547
Pound Hill 14952
Furnace Green 7044
Southgate 5775
Bewbush 6758
Coachmans 8812
Langley Corner 10144

6. 231895 registered patients as of

01/04/2015

6a
The Meadows Surgery
Cowfold
Cuckfield Medical
Practice
Ship Street Surgery
Judges Close Surgery
Park Surgery
Rudgwick Medical
Centre
Courtyard Surgery
Lindfield
Orchard Surgery
Crawley Down Health
Centre
Dolphins Practice
Newtons Practice
Mid-Sussex Health Care
Moatfield Surgery
Silverdale Practice
The Brow Medical
Centre
Riverside Surgery
The Village Surgery
Northlands Wood
Practice
Ouse Valley Practice
Park View Health
Partnership
Holbrook Surgery

9799
4374

7384
11306
8096
22650

3391
7409
11067
10603

7788
12000
12233
18473
13241
11012

6386
7645
7267

5504
6193

4468
13894




7. What was GP to patient ratio in your commissioning
areain 20157

The CCG can confirm that it does
hold this information, but are
exempting it under Section 21
Freedom of Information Act 2000
as it is reasonably accessible by
other means.

This is an absolute exemption.

| have provided you with a link to
our website which will provide you
with this information:
https://www.nhs.uk/Services/Trusts

The CCG can confirm that it does
hold this information, but are
exempting it under Section 21
Freedom of Information Act 2000 as
it is reasonably accessible by other
means.

This is an absolute exemption.

| have provided you with a link to
our website which will provide you
with this information:
https://www.nhs.uk/Services/Trusts/

/GPs/DefaultView.aspx?id=89730

GPs/DefaultView.aspx?id=89655

8. How many GP surgeries/Family Practices/Walk-in
centres with GP services closed between 2010 &
2015?

0

0

9. How many GP surgeries/Family Practices/Walk-in
centres with GP services there were in your
commissioning areain 2017?

10.How many patients those GP surgeries/Family
Practices/Walk-in centres catered/cared for in 20177

10.a Please break this data down to provide patient
numbers per GP surgery/Family Practice/Walk-in
centre?

11.What was the GP to patient ratio in your
commissioning areain 2017?

The CCG can confirm that it does
hold this information, but are
exempting it under Section 21
Freedom of Information Act 2000
as it is reasonably accessible by
other means. This is an absolute
exemption.

| have provided you with a link to
our website which will provide you
with this information:

https://www.nhs.uk/Services/Trusts
/GPs/DefaultView.aspx?id=89730

The CCG can confirm that it does
hold this information, but are
exempting it under Section 21
Freedom of Information Act 2000 as
it is reasonably accessible by other
means. This is an absolute
exemption.

| have provided you with a link to
our website which will provide you
with this information:

https://www.nhs.uk/Services/Trusts/
GPs/DefaultView.aspx?id=89655

12.How many GP surgeries/Family Practices/Walk-in
centres with GP services closed between 2015 and
20177

1

0

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 22 December 2017
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