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Dear Rowland Manthorpe,  

 

Freedom of Information Request Ref: F19_429 

 

Thank you for your request for information from the University of York. Please see our response 

below. 

 

Under the Freedom of Information Act, can you please tell me how much money you spent 

on advertising for clearing in 2019. 

 

Can you please provide subtotals for the following categories (feel free to break them down 

further if that's appropriate): 

 

1. Facebook 

2. Instagram 

3. Google - that is, search advertising 

4. YouTube 

5. Snapchat 

6. Twitter 

7. Other social networks (please specify) 

8. Amazon 

9. Online - that is, on websites excluding social networks, or those websites those listed 

above (this includes advertising using Google's ad network) 

10. Television 

11. National newspapers 

12. Local newspapers 

13. Magazines 

14. Posters and billboards 

15. Radio 

16. Public transport billboards 

 

Can you also provide an example of an ad in each of the above formats. 

 

For the online forms of advertising, can you also tell me how many clicks each advertisement 

received. Can you also provide any other data you have which indicates the engagement with 

each ad. 

 

mailto:xxx@xxxx.xx.xx


For Google advertising, can you list which keywords you advertised against. Can you please 

indicate the cost-per-click in each case. 

 

For Facebook, can you please supply 

- A list of the interests and/or demographics you targeted 

- If you used custom audiences, where you derived the data to make that custom audience 

from 

 

Information not held. 

 

Information not held. The University does not hold a specific advertising budget for clearing spend 

and does not hold the detailed breakdown information requested specifically related to clearing. The 

University engages in recruitment efforts throughout the year including before, during and after the 

A-level results period. However some advertisements during these time periods may be generic, 

whilst others may be subject specific.  In the context of your request, the University cannot therefore 

determine whether an advertisement would be related only to clearing.   

 

I hope this information is useful.  

 

Yours sincerely, 

 

Information Governance Team  


