
  

 
 

Ms Naomi Aharony   
Information Management

Shire Hall
Warwick

CV34 4RL
Telephone 01926 412211

Email brucegreen@warwickshire.gov.uk 

  
Please ask for Bruce Green 

  
  
Our ref: 5042953 Your ref: Date: 13th November 2019
 
Dear Ms Aharony
 
Freedom of Information Act 2000  
 
Your request for information has been considered by Warwickshire County Council 
under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. 
 
I can confirm that some of the information you have requested is held by Warwickshire 
County Council. 
 
However, please be advised we are unable to provide all of the information you have 
requested.  This is because some of the information you have requested is not held by 
Warwickshire County Council. 
 
Please see below for further details and explanation.   
 
You asked us: 
 
I would like to request the following data under the Freedom of Information Act 
2000: 

1. How many Fixed Penalty Notices has your council handed out between 
September 2018 to July 2019 to parents for the following unauthorised school 
absences: 

a. Persistent lateness (arriving after the register has been taken)?
 
None.   

b. Unauthorised leave in term time (e.g. being taken out of school for holiday)?



  

 
683.  

c. Delayed return from authorised leave?
 
Not applicable.  
 
Please note:  Warwickshire County Council do not record and hold information at the 
level of detail required to answer this part of your request.  

d. General unauthorised absence / truancy (including parentally condoned 
absence)?
 
90.  

2. How many FPNs have not been paid within the 21 day allocated time frame?
 
134 FPN's issued were not paid within 21 days. 

3. How many FPNs have not been paid within the 28 day allocated time frame, and 
subsequently gone to court?
 
64 FPN’s were not paid within the 28 day time frame, and have subsequently gone to 
court to date.   

4. How much revenue has been collected from FPNs between September 2018 to 
July 2019?
 
£40,020.00 

5. Could you please provide a comparison for questions 1 to 4 for the previous 
school year (2017-2018)?
 
1a.  None. 
 
1b.  583. 
 
1c.  Not applicable. 
 
Please note:  Warwickshire County Council do not record and hold information at the 
level of detail required to answer this part of your request.  
 
1d.  76. 
 
2.  132 FPN’s were not paid within the 21 day time frame.   
 
3.  52 FPN’s were not paid within the 28 day time frame, and matters were heard in 
court.  
 
4.  £33,900.00



  

Yours faithfully.  
 
 
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to ask for an 
internal review.  Internal review requests should be submitted within 40 days of the date 
of receipt of the response to your original letter and should be addressed to:
 
Information Management 
Shire Hall 
Warwick 
CV34 4RL 
inforights@warwickshire.gov.uk
 
 
If you are not content with the outcome of the internal review, you have the right to 
apply directly to the Information Commissioner for a decision.  The Information 
Commissioner can be contacted at: 

The Information Commissioner's Office 
Wycliffe House  
Water Lane  
Wilmslow  
Cheshire  
SK9 5AF 
Phone: 0303 123 1113  
Website: www.ico.gov.uk

 
I will now close your request as of this date.
 
 
Yours sincerely
 
 
Bruce Green 
Information Rights Officer

mailto:xxxxxxxxxx@xxxxxxxxxxxx.xxx.xx
http://www.ico.gov.uk

