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David Gale

 FOI Reference: 2578544 

xxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxx@xxxxxxxxxxxxxx.xxx 

 

 

Date: 12 August 2021

 
 
 

 
 

Dear David Gale

Your Freedom of Information Request

Thank you for your email dated 29 June 2021 in which you requested an internal review of 
our response dated 16 June 2021. Please accept my apologies for the delay in responding 
– I had hoped to send something out to you before I went on leave but required clarification 
from a colleague before sending this out.  

You state in your request for review the following:

CONTEXT: A previous FOI response has evidenced that in 2017 the EHRC informed 
Universities UK and other key stakeholders that it would provide litigation funding for 
university students making claims for disability discrimination against their universities for 
those cases that met the EHRC's legal criteria.

It is evidenced from documents already secured from the EHRC that access to such 
litigation funding support for university students was covertly withdrawn circa 2018 without 
any notification or consultation with Universities UK or other key stakeholders. Indeed, 
Universities UK, the Office of the Independent Adjudicator, and the Office for Students are 
still under the impression that university students suffering disability discrimination may 
receive litigation funding support from the EHRC. For its part, the DfE still erroneously 
maintains that the OIA can provide legal resolution for disability discrimination claims 
brought by university students, despite having received written confirmation from the OIA to 
the contrary. In turn, all of the involved public bodies have confirmed that they have no 
means of collecting statistics related to disability discrimination suffered by university 
students and therefore are completely unaware not just of the significant increases of 
discrimination but also the increase in universities abusing their own internal complaints 
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procedures. To all intents and purposes university students have been left entirely 
unprotected from disability discrimination perpetrated by their universities within a complete 
void of regulatory scrutiny and governance.

REQUEST: Please provide sight of minutes, memoranda, policies, procedures, and any 
other documents that evidence the development, delivery and consultation of the EHRC's 
policy to focus EHRC disability discrimination litigation funding support on school children, 
to include any reference that directly or indirectly implies the exclusion of university 
students from any litigation funding support, as well as any instructions issued to reviewing 
lawyers or other EHRC staff members to disqualify any applications from litigation funding 
because of that policy even after they had met the EHRC's legal criteria, to include 
statistics on the volume of university students who have been denied funding because of 
the referenced EHRC policy. 

To clarify: I do not want an internalised view of EHRC policy but instead an audit trail view 
of the policy decision process that excluded university students from litigation funding 
support; I do not want a list of funding applications for university student cases, just those 
which met the legal criteria for funding support but fell foul of the age-based policy decision 
in favour of school children that overrides the EHRC's legal criteria for support; 

I can clarify that the response should focus on information that evidences the consequential 
denial of litigation funding support for university students. 

Response Approach
 
I have conducted a full and impartial review which includes consideration of the information 
released against the information requested and a full review of the papers associated with 
the original application, including:

1. FOI request received 6 May 2021;
2. Reply to clarification request received 18 May 2021 
3. FOI response sent 16 June 2021;
4. Review request received 29 June 2021; and
5. EHRC’s guidance for conducting FOIA Internal Reviews.

I have also:

• Read the relevant sections of the Freedom of Information Act; 

• Read the ICO guidance on ‘Determining whether information is held’ and 

‘Interpreting and clarifying requests’ ; and
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• Discussed the decisions made with the staff member who dealt with the original 

request in order to build a full picture as to how decisions were made.

Context 

On 06 May 2021, you wrote to us outlining that a previous FOI response has evidenced 
that in 2017 the EHRC informed Universities UK and other key stakeholders that it would 
provide litigation funding for university students making claims for disability discrimination 
against their universities for those cases that met the EHRC's legal criteria. 

I believe you are referring to our legal support project for cases concerning discrimination in 
education which ran from 17 September 2017 and focused on increasing access to justice 
for victims of discrimination involving schools, further or higher education institutions, or 
general qualifications bodies. Funding for new cases under this project has now ended but 
we still consider applications from legal representatives for any cases that may meet our 
business priorities and the criteria set out in our Strategic Litigation policy.

Response

Information Not Held - Approach

In considering whether we hold the information requested, I have looked at: 

1. the adequacy of our original search for the information; 
2. the reasons given explaining why the information is not held; and 
3. the wording of your request. 

Adequacy of searches for information 

Our Information Governance team contacted relevant teams and individuals providing them 
with the requested information and asking that they carry out a search of their records 
(including emails, electronic folders, systems, and paper records). The email asked the 
individuals to respond confirming that they had carried out the searches and providing any 
relevant information, in addition to confirming the name of anyone else they believed may 
hold relevant information. The email also set out guidance on the Commission’s obligations 
to respond to requests under FOIA, including that the Commission is legally required to 
consider all information that is held for disclosure and also, except for very limited 
circumstances, to confirm or deny if it holds any relevant information even if the 
Commission determines it should not be disclosed. 
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In order to ascertain what, if any, information was held, multiple staff were approached 
across a number of teams.  These included: 

-

Senior Principals – Heads of Advisory and Litigation;

-

Senior Principals – Heads of Strategy;

-

Solicitor - Principal / Legal - Intelligence and Impact;

-

Principal – Strategy (Work, Education and Transport).

Those approached advised that university students are not excluded from litigation funding 
support and although our Education Aim prioritises school-aged children, there is still scope 
for us to support university students via our Core Aim.  No member of staff provided any 
relevant information to demonstrate that university students were excluded from funding 
support and some provided information showing that we had considered cases involving 
university students and also taken action. 

I am satisfied that adequate searches were conducted at the time, particularly in light of the 
fact that everyone approached concurred on the position. 

Reasons given explaining why the information is not held

It was explained to you that our Education Aim prioritised school-aged children.  The 
‘Education Aim’ we referred to in our previous response is Strategic Goal 2, Priority Aim 4 
of our Strategic Plan 2019-2022.  This provides: 

“The education system promotes good relations with others and respect for equality 
and human rights. Schools and nurseries play an important part in shaping 
children’s attitudes. We will increase our understanding of the best ways to prevent 
and change prejudiced attitudes. We will work to ensure that schools are truly 
inclusive places where diverse children with different beliefs and backgrounds mix, 
children receive their education without discrimination and education instils 
understanding of and respect for difference, to create engaged citizens who value 
equality and human rights and each other. This will be particularly important for 
people who continue to experience prejudice, and even hate crime, such as lesbian, 
gay, bisexual and trans people, people with particular religions or beliefs and people 
from ethnic minorities, in particular Gypsy, Roma and Traveller people.”

Whilst the focus of Priority Aim 4 of Goal 2 of the Strategic Plan is on school children, this 
does not, as you have suggested, exclude university students from applying for legal 
assistance with cases and does not prevent us from agreeing to provide such assistance. 
Within the Core Aim of our Strategic Plan 2019-2022, we state that: 
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“We will increase our litigation and enforcement work to:

• Send a clear message about the need to comply with equality and human rights law 

by challenging flagrant breaches.

• Tackle the systemic barriers people face through legal challenges to widespread 

failures to comply with equality and human rights law.

• Defend the rights of people in the most vulnerable positions experiencing serious 

breaches of their fundamental rights.”

We would not disqualify a case based solely on the fact that it related to a university 
student as it could fall into the above Core Aim and I am therefore satisfied with the 
reasons given explaining why the information is not held. However, I wish to provide you 
with some further advice and assistance regarding your request. 

Advice and Assistance 

From the file, I can see that on 10 May 2021 we wrote to you explaining that under section 
1(3) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 ("the Act") we reasonably required further 
information in order to identify and locate the information requested. To help us identify and 
locate the requested information, we asked you to clarify whether you were seeking:

a) information relating to the development of Goal 2 within our strategic plan relating to 

the education system, and if so, what specific records you were seeking;

b) a list of applications for funding support for litigation relating to university students; 
c) the Commission's criteria for litigating funding support.

 
Having considered the ICO’s guidance on ‘Interpreting and clarifying requests’, I believe 
this was the correct thing to do. You could not reasonably have been expected to have 
detailed knowledge of our decision making process or the way in which we prioritise work 
in line with our Strategic Plan and our Litigation and Enforcement Policy and it is right that 
we should make allowances for that. The ICO guidance provides that if we are unclear 
what the requester is asking for then we must to go back to them and ask for further 
clarification.  

I can see that you did not confirm which of the above you were looking for but rather 
responded: 

“I do not want an internalised view of EHRC policy but instead an audit trail 
view of the policy decision process that excluded university students 
from litigation funding support; I do not want a list of funding applications 
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for university student cases, just those which met the legal criteria for 
funding support but fell foul of the age-based policy decision in favour of 
school children that overrides the EHRC's legal criteria for support…” 

I am satisfied that we responded to the first part of you clarification (underlined and in bold) 
correctly as there is no such policy decision.  However, I do not believe that the following 
parts of your request have been addressed: 

“I can clarify that the response should focus on information that evidences the 
consequential denial of litigation funding support for university students.”
Clarification dated 18 May 2021. 

“to include any reference that directly or indirectly implies the exclusion of university 
students from any litigation funding support, as well as any instructions issued to 
reviewing lawyers or other EHRC staff members to disqualify any applications from 
litigation funding because of that policy even after they had met the EHRC's legal 
criteria, to include statistics on the volume of university students who have been denied 
funding because of the referenced EHRC policy.” 
Original request dated 6 May 2021.

I believe that reference to a ‘consequential denial of litigation funding’ and a policy that 
‘indirectly implies the exclusion of university students from any litigation funding support… 
to include statistics’ would in effect refer to information relating to the development of Goal 
2 within our strategic plan relating to the education system and statistics of why we have 
denied funding to university students. 

Whilst you did not confirm this by way of clarification, I believe that we could have 
interpreted your terminology accordingly and considered releasing such information.  I am 
therefore upholding your review request. 

Next Steps 

I am clear from your request that you were asking for certain statistical information.  Since 
April 2019 our Legal Intelligence and Impact and Scotland teams have triaged 10 requests 
for assistance from university students relating to disability discrimination and I provide 
further information on those (particularly where funding has been declined) below: 
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No.

Date

Triage outcome 

Reason

Further details

1

26 June 2019 Unsuccessful

Didn't meet 

No more detail available

criteria in 
strategic plan

2

26 June 2019 Unsuccessful

Didn't meet 

No more detail available

criteria in 
strategic plan

3

August 2019

Review Rejected

Review was 

Disability discrimination claim 

carried out and 

failure to provide notes in 

rejected

advance.

4

August 2019

Not strategic

Not strategic

Request to investigate 
Glasgow Uni treatment of 
disabled student

5

4 March 2020 Unsuccessful

Didn't meet 

'The issue of failure to make 

criteria in 

reasonable adjustments in 

strategic plan

further/higher education does 
not align with either our pre or 
post-coronavirus strategic 
priorities. Under the education 
aim we are looking at failure 
to make reasonable 
adjustments for children and 
discriminatory school 
exclusions, not in higher 
education. We do not have 
any information that would 
suggest the case could fall 
under the core aim…'

6

7 April 2020

Successful

Referred to 

'No to s.28 as does not fit 

enforcement team  closely with education aim. 
for more detailed  The matter does align with the 

 
T: 020 7832 7800
E: xxx@xxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxx.xxx
 
Fleetbank House, 2-6 Salisbury Square
London, EC4Y 8JX
 
equalityhumanrights.com



[bookmark: 8][image: ]

No.

Date

Triage outcome 

Reason

Further details

scoping of the 

core aim, but enforcement 

issues

action more likely to achieve 
desired impact and likely to 
be more cost effective. The 
impact of assisting with a first 
instance case that has 
potential for settlement is 
likely to be much more 
limited.'
Referred to Enforcement but 
no further action after 
scoping- organisation 
provided details of support for 
disabled pupils.

7

7 April 2020

Unsuccessful

Didn't meet 

The Education Aim does not 

criteria in 

encompass Higher Education. 

strategic plan 

The issues in this case do not 

(NB- priorities 

align with the Core Aim covid 

were being 

business plan litigation 

restructured due  matters which prioritises covid 
to COVID)

related rights breaches.

8

17 March 

Successful

Referred to 

No further action following 

2020

Scotland team for  scoping- Planning decisions 
more detailed 

were largely historic so not 

scoping of the 

amenable to challenge.

issues

 

9

28 May 2021

Successful

Referred to 

Matter is still being scoped by 

litigation team for  litigation team
more detailed 
scoping of the 
issues

10

3 June 2021

Successful 

Referred to 

Matter is still being scoped by 

litigation team for  litigation team
more detailed 
scoping of the 
issues

As outlined in my email last week, I think it would be useful to have a telephone call to 
determine exactly what information you require and provide further advice and assistance 
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in this regard. This will enable us to provide you with the information that you want, which I 
believe to be:

• information relating to Goal 2 within our strategic plan relating to the education 

system and our legal strategy on this Goal.

Please let me know when is a convenient time to speak and I would be happy to schedule 
a call. 

Information Commissioner's Officer (ICO) 

If you are not satisfied with the outcome of this review you may apply directly to the ICO at:
The Information Commissioner's Office
Wycliffe House
Water Lane
Wilmslow
Cheshire
SK9 5AF

Yours sincerely

A Bennett 
Senior Principal – Legal 
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