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Dear Mr Popescu  

Freedom of Information Act (FOIA) Request – 190211006 

 

Thank you for your requests in which you asked for the following information from the 

Ministry of Justice (MoJ). Please note we have amalgamated your three requests into one so 

they can be dealt with as quickly as possible following your request to the Independent 

Commissioners Office. 

 

1. What are a Master's duties and responsibilities?  

2. What qualifications and experience one must have in order to become a Master?  

3. How are the Masters selected?  

4. Are Masters working on a full-time, part-time or contract employees?  

5. Can a Master practice law while holding that judicial office?  

6. How many Masters are at the Court of Appeal?” 

7. I would like to know how and where does the Court of Appeal record the 

destruction of case bundles and how can this record be accessed 

8. How is the Master of the Rolls appointed and what are the terms of that 

appointment? 

 

 

 

Your request has been handled under the FOIA and, in the absence of specifying the 
jurisdiction of the Masters in scope of your requests we are replying on the basis of the 
Masters within the Court of Appeal (Civil Division).   
 
Questions 1 
Please see attached extract from the Civil Procedure Rules which sets out the role and 
responsibilities of these court officials. 
 
Questions 2 
Please see attached detailed CPR extract from the Civil Procedure Rules which sets out the 
required qualifications and experience required of these court officials. 
 
Questions 3 
In the event of a vacancy the Civil Service recruitment campaign policies and processes 
would be followed. They are recruited by open and fair competition 
 
Questions 4 
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Masters are appointed on a full-time basis. 
 
Questions 5 
No, they cannot practise law while holding judicial office 
 
Questions 6 
There are two Masters in the Court of Appeal (Civil Division) 
 
Questions 7 
The bundles are destroyed after the hearing in accordance with CPR 52C Para 27 (15). The 
files are destroyed after 3 years from the date of the last order. When destroyed we note 
“dead bundle destroyed” on our internal case management system.  
This system is not available for public inspection. 

 

 
Question 8 
The MoJ does not hold any information in the scope of your request. This is because we are 
not the appropriate authority to contact on this subject.  The Judicial Appointments 
Commission - an executive non-departmental public body - is responsible for judicial 
recruitment.   
 
The FOIA does not oblige a public authority to create information to answer a request if the 
requested information is not held. The duty is to only provide the recorded information held. 
 

You can make an FOI request to the JAC: 

• by email: FOIA@judicialappointments.gov.uk 

• by post: FOIA Manager, Judicial Appointments Commission, 5th Floor, 70 Petty 

France, London, SW1H 9EX 
 
 
 
Appeal Rights  
 
If you are not satisfied with this response you have the right to request an internal review by 
responding in writing to one of the addresses below within two months of the date of this 
response.  
 
data.access@justice.gov.uk 
 
Disclosure Team, Ministry of Justice, 10.38, 102 Petty France, London, SW1H 9AJ 
 
You do have the right to ask the Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO) to investigate any 
aspect of your complaint. However, please note that the ICO is likely to expect internal 
complaints procedures to have been exhausted before beginning their investigation. 
 

 

 

Yours sincerely  

 

Knowledge and Information Liaison Officer 

London and South East Regional Support Unit | HM Courts and Tribunals Service 
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