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Reference: FOI 27595 BUCKS 14Y 
 
Subject: Neurodevelopmental Disorders 
 
I can confirm that the CCG does hold some of the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

A. Could you provide details of whether a specific diagnostic pathway for children exists within your CCG for each of the 
following conditions: 

1) Attention Deficit/Hyperactivity Disorder. Yes 

2) Autism Spectrum Disorder. Yes 

3) Developmental Coordination Disorder/Developmental 
Dyspraxia. No 

4) Developmental Dyscalculia. No 

5) Developmental Dyslexia. No 

6) Specific language impairment/Developmental language 
disorder. Yes 
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B. If a diagnostic pathway exists could you provide further 
details of that pathway? 

Yes.  Buckinghamshire CCG does not hold this information. This 
information will be held by Oxford Health NHS Foundation Trust and 
Buckinghamshire Healthcare NHS Trust. If you would like to redirect 
your request please follow the links: 
 
Oxford University Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust 
 
Buckinghamshire Healthcare NHS Trust 

C. For each of the above conditions, if a diagnostic pathway exists, could you provide the following details for the last 5 years, 
broken down by year: 

1) The number of children who were referred and the number who were diagnosed. 

• 2014 

Buckinghamshire CCG does not hold this information. This 
information will be held by Oxford Health NHS Foundation Trust and 
Buckinghamshire Healthcare NHS Trust. If you would like to redirect 
your request please follow the links in question B. 

• 2015 Please see the above response. 

• 2016 Please see the above response. 

• 2017 Please see the above response. 

http://www.ouh.nhs.uk/about/foi/
http://www.buckshealthcare.nhs.uk/About/freedom-of-information.htm
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• 2018 Please see the above response. 

2) The average (both mean and median if available, if not please specify which), minimum, and maximum wait time between 
referral and diagnosis. 

• 2014 Please see the above response. 

• 2015 Please see the above response. 

• 2016 Please see the above response. 

• 2017 Please see the above response. 

• 2018 Please see the above response. 

 
 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 29 August 2018, and has been authorised for release by Robert 
Majilton, Deputy Chief Officer and Director of Sustainability & Transformation for NHS Buckinghamshire CCG.   
 


