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Social Care
Chandra Singh

By email to: request-861269-40b919c1 @whatdotheyknow.com

25 July 2022
Dear Chandra,
Freedom of Information Request Reference FOI-1405002

Thank you for your request dated 11 May to the Department of Health and Social Care
(DHSC), a copy of which can be found in the accompanying annex.

Your request has been handled under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA) and we
apologise for the delay in replying. We will answer each of your questions in turn.

1. DHSC holds the information you have requested. Between 17 May 2021 and 15 July
2022, there have been 8,275,267 NHS COVID Pass letters issued.

2. DHSC does not hold the information you have requested. This is because we do not
store personal information with which to track letters issued in this way.

3. DHSC does not hold the information you have requested. This is because we do not
store personal information with which to track letters issued in this way.

4. DHSC holds information relevant to your request. The cost of our standard print format
is shown in the table below.

Letter Type Total Unit Cost (£)

Vaccination Travel Pass — 1 certificate (a one-dose | 0.43
course of vaccination, e.g. Janssen)

Vaccination Travel Pass — 2 certificate (a two-dose | 0.47
course of vaccination, e.g. Pfizer)

Vaccination Travel Pass — 3 certificate (a two-dose | 0.51
course of vaccination, e.g. Pfizer, plus a booster)

Vaccination Travel Pass — Failure 0.41

5. We have considered your request for information, but we are unable to answer it without
further clarification. Section 1(3) of the FOIA does not oblige us to answer requests where
we require further clarification to identify and locate the information requested. It states:
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Where a public authority—

(a) reasonably requires further information in order to identify and locate the information
requested, and

(b) has informed the applicant of that requirement,

the authority is not obliged to comply with subsection (1) unless it is supplied with that
further information.

Therefore, until we receive clarification about which costs you are referring to, we will not
be able to process your request further. Please be aware that we cannot guarantee at this
stage that a clarified request will fall within the FOIA cost limit, or that other exemptions will
not apply.

If you are not satisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to appeal by
asking for an internal review. This should be sent to freedomofinformation@dhsc.gov.uk or
to the address at the top of this letter and be submitted within two months of the date of
this letter.

Please remember to quote the reference number above in any future communication.

If you are not content with the outcome of your internal review, you may complain directly
to the Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO). Generally, the ICO cannot make a
decision unless you have already appealed our original response and received our internal
review decision. You should raise your concerns with the ICO within three months of your
last meaningful contact with us.

Guidance on contacting the ICO can be found at https://ico.org.uk/global/contact-us and
information about making a complaint can be found at https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint.

Yours sincerely,

Freedom of Information Team
freedomofinformation@dhsc.gov.uk
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Annex

From: Chandra Singh <request-861269-40b919c1@whatdotheyknow.com>
Sent: 11 May 2022 20:13

To: Freedomofinformation <freedomofinformation@dhsc.gov.uk>

Subject: Freedom of Information request - Covid Pass Letters Issued

Dear Department of Health and Social Care,
My request relates to the issuance of covid pass letters via telephone or via the following

website:
https://covid-status-letter.service.nhsx.nhs.uk/who-are-you-requesting-for

1. How many covid pass letters have been issued to date?
2. How many covid pass letters have been issued to the same person more than once?

3. What is the maximum number of covid pass letters that have been issued to an
individual to date?

4. What is the cost of issuing a single covid pass letter?
5. What is the cost to date for the entire covid pass letter service?
Yours faithfully,

Chandra Singh

Please use this email address for all replies to this request:
request-861269-40b919c1@whatdotheyknow.com
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