Rosemary Wilkins Cycling Officer

From: Martin Mason Development Management Engineer

Sent: 24 September 2012 10:58

To: Rosemary Wilkins Cycling Officer

Cc: Simon Walker Engineer; Tara Jowett Senior Design Engineer; Alan Lindsay Principal
Area Transportation Co-ordinator

Subject: RE: Cycle path Essex Uni to Fire Station

Hi Rosemary,

According to the Unilateral Undertaking, which we're not party to, the contribution should be paid
to CBC prior to commencement of development, which will obviously be determined by the
developer.

Either CBC just pass the contribution straight onto us or we request that they do so and then it is
up to Bev's team to take it from there in terms of getting the money spent.

Brad will oversee discharge of the planning conditions attached to the planning permission.
Hope this helps.

Thanks.

Martin.

Martin Mason

Strategic Development Engineer

Sustainable Environment & Enterprise

Essex County Council | telephone: 01245 433 162 | extension: 52162 | mobile: 07919 624331 |
email: martin.mason@essex.qov.uk

From: Rosemary Wilkins Cycling Officer

Sent: 19 September 2012 10:37

To: Martin Mason Development Management Engineer

Cc: Simon Walker Engineer; Tara Jowett Senior Design Engineer; Alan Lindsay Principal Area
Transportation Co-ordinator

Subject: RE: Cycle path Essex Uni to Fire Station

Hi Martin

When will the S106 funds be available to ECC to construct the cycleway? I'm guessing they will
be paid to CBC, then we request it from them, then we do a CMA to have the scheme added to
the capital programme.

Would Bradly Heffer be dealing with the conditions of the approval?

Thanks

Rosemary Wilkins

Cycling Officer
Strategy & Engagement Team



Highways & Transportation
Phone (01245) 437048 Ednet: 51048 Mobile: 07919624500

From: Martin Mason Development Management Engineer

Sent: 17 September 2012 14:58

To: Rosemary Wilkins Cycling Officer; Alan Lindsay Principal Area Transportation Co-ordinator;
Simon Walker Engineer; Tara Jowett Senior Design Engineer

Subject: RE: Cycle path Essex Uni to Fire Station

Hi Rosemary,

The planning permission has been granted (20th August 2012) and so therefore it is now up to the
University in terms of timescales for implementing the permission.

Please follow this link to the permission:

http://www.planning.colchester.gov.uk/WAM/findCaseFile.do?appNumber=120151&appType=plan

ning

Thanks.
Martin.

Martin Mason

Strategic Development Engineer

Sustainable Environment & Enterprise

Essex County Council | telephone: 01245 433 162 | extension: 52162 | mobile: 07919 624331 |
email: martin.mason@essex.qov.uk

From: Rosemary Wilkins Cycling Officer

Sent: 17 September 2012 10:38

To: Alan Lindsay Principal Area Transportation Co-ordinator; Martin Mason Development
Management Engineer; Simon Walker Engineer; Tara Jowett Senior Design Engineer
Subject: FW: Cycle path Essex Uni to Fire Station

Hi All
Has the funding been drawn down yet, or is there any other update | can provide to Cllr Young?
Thanks

Rosemary Wilkins

Cycling Officer

Strategy & Engagement Team

Highways & Transportation

Phone (01245) 437048 Ednet: 51048 Mobile: 07919624500

From: Julie Young Member CC

Sent: 16 September 2012 17:09

To: Rosemary Wilkins Cycling Officer

Subject: Fw: Cycle path Essex Uni to Fire Station
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Can you update me please?
Julie

----- Original Message -----

From: Julie Young Member CC

Sent: Sunday, September 16, 2012 05:04 PM
To: Simon Walker Engineer

Subject: Cycle path Essex Uni to Fire Station

Dear Simon

Now funding has been allocated as 106 money from the Car Park at the Uni, can you provide
advice about delivery dates. Be grateful for a responce monday as | have Wivenhoe Town Council
Monday night.

Julie



