NHS

Oxfordshire
Clinical Commissioning Group

Reference: FOI 35214 OXF 10Q
Subject: Community Venous Thromboembolism (VTE) Clinic

I can confirm that the CCG does not hold the information requested; please see responses below:

QUESTION RESPONSE

The VTE clinic is managed by the Oxford University Hospitals NHS Foundation
Trust (OUH) and, as such, Oxfordshire CCG does not hold the information being

1. Does your CCG commission a Community VTE Clinic?
requested.

May we suggest you contact Oxford University Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust
as they may be able to provide the data required.

2. In the last 12 months how many patients have been treated at

the clinic? Please note: FOI responses may take longer to complete at the moment as the
Trust may need to prioritise essential services to ensure the wellbeing of our
residents. The Information Commissioners Office (ICO) has advised that although
3. How many patients have been treated with a Direct Oral they are unable to extend statutory timescales, they will advise people that they
Anticoagulants (DOAC) within the clinic? may experience understandable delays when making FOIs during the COVID-19

pandemic.

4. Of these patients how many were treated with:
a) Xarelto
b) Lixiana
c) Pradaxa
d) Eliquis

Oxfordshire CCG does not know the number of patients treated with a DOAC so
we are not able to specify which DOACs patients are using

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 26 March 2020 and has been authorised for release by Catherine Mountford, Director of
Governance for NHS Oxfordshire CCG.


http://www.ouh.nhs.uk/about/foi/

