Gibbons, Frances

From: Jon Severs <IPIH

Sent: 13 August 2019 12:05

To: Simmonds, Ross; Lane, Rebecca
Cc: Williams, Deborah; Barrett, Rebecca
Subject: RE: Cumberland Basin

Brilliant Ross, thanks for the confirmation.

Regards
Jon

Jon Severs

City Design Manager

City Design Group — Growth and Regeneration
City Hall

XXX XXXXXX (@ XXXXXXX . XXX. XX

By Post:

City Design Group (City Hall)
PO Box 3176

Bristol City Council

BS3 9FS

From: Simmonds, Ross [mailto:Ross.Simmonds@HistoricEngland.org.uk]
Sent: 13 August 2019 12:00
To: Jon Severs; Lane, Rebecca
Cc: Williams, Deborah; Barrett, Rebecca
Subject: RE: Cumberland Basin
Dear Jon,
Many thanks for this and for confirming your agreement to proceed with
To confirm we are liaising internally to organise the contract for this EAS work, and will
arrange to have the initial order form issued to you as soon as possible.

Ross

Ross Simmonds | Head of Region | South West
Direct Line: 0117 975 0692 (x2292) | Mobile: 07881 872218

Historic England | 29 Queen Square | Bristol | BS1 4ND
Follow us on Twitter at @HE_SouthWest

https://historicengland.org.uk/
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From: Jon Severs [Mailto:XXX.XXXXXX @ XXXXXXX.XXX.XX]
Sent: 13 August 2019 09:58

To: Simmonds, Ross; Lane, Rebecca

Cc: Williams, Deborah

Subject: RE: Cumberland Basin

Hello Ross/ Rebecca

In Deborah’s absence | wonder if you’re ab le to help.

Many thanks
Jon

Jon Severs

City Design Manager

City Design Group — Growth and Regeneration
City Hall

XXX XXXXXX (@ XXXXXXX. XXX XX

By Post:

City Design Group (City Hall)
PO Box 3176

Bristol City Council

BS3 9FS

From: Williams, Deborah [mailto:Deborah.Williams@HistoricEngland.org.uk]
Sent: 01 August 2019 12:46

To: Jon Severs

Cc: Simmonds, Ross; Lane, Rebecca

Subject: RE: Cumberland Basin

HiJon,
| have now had the detailed project proposals from my colleagues who would be undertaking a screening service
(attached). Historic England’s flat hourly rate is £100 exclusive of VAT. This would give the following costs for the

two options:

e Single Phase Screening service for the area within the red impact boundary: £14,400 ex. VAT



| hope that this provides you with all you need to consider how to move forward. If you require any further
information though please do get in touch.

All the best

Deborah

Deborah Williams MCIfA FSA
South West Listing Team Leader

Historic England 29 Queen Square, Bristol BS1 4ND

Direct dial: 0117 975 0669 Mobile: 07702 831753

[
A Historic England

We are the public body that helps people care for, enjoy and celebrate England's spectacular historic
environment, from beaches and battlefields to parks and pie shops.
Follow us: Facebook | Twitter | Instagram Sign up to our newsletter

This e-mail (and any attachments) is confidential and may contain personal views which are not the views of Historic
England unless specifically stated. If you have received it in error, please delete it from your system and notify the
sender immediately. Do not use, copy or disclose the information in any way nor act in reliance on it. Any
information sent to Historic England may become publicly available. We respect your privacy and the use of your
information. Please read our full privacy policy for more information.

From: Jon Severs [Mailto:XXX.XXXXXX @ XXXXXXX.XXX.XX]
Sent: 30 July 2019 18:00

To: Williams, Deborah

Subject: RE: Cumberland Basin

Hi Deborah, thanks for this. Just to confirm then (I’'m afraid my memory is appalling), we’d discussed;
- Ascreening exercise based on your Enhanced Advisory Service to be undertaken in two phases;
0 The first focussed around the existing transport assets to be the subject of an upcoming consultation
exercise with an appropriate, but quite tightly defined, buffer, followed by

3



Assuming that’s your recollection too (!) are you able to confirm the estimate for the screening service element for
those two phases. | know you had estimated 8-10K initially but mindful that was for a single area/ process.

Apologies for the questions, I’'m just trying to work out how to advise colleagues here on the process and likely
budget envelope we’ll need to factor in.

I’'m now out of the office until 12" August but will be picking up emails until Friday. If you’re able to reply before
then that would be great and | can hopefully set the wheels in motion!

Many thanks again for your help.
Regards
Jon

Jon Severs

City Design Manager

City Design Group — Growth and Regeneration
City Hall

XXX XXXXXX (@ XXXXXXX XXX XX

By Post:

City Design Group (City Hall)
PO Box 3176

Bristol City Council

BS3 9FS

Council services: http://www.bristol.gov.uk/service
Latest council news: http://www.bristol.gov.uk/ournews
Consultations: http://www.bristol.gov.uk/consult
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