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ABERDEEN CITY COUNCIL 

 
Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 – (FOISA) 

 
Information not Held Notice 

 
 
ENQ10334 – City Garden Project 
2. Details of communications with regard to the formation of a Special Purpose 
Vehicle (“SPV”) to take the (“CGP”) forward, 
4. Details of all communications with regard to the preparation of the business 
case in relation to the CGP and 
8. Details of all communications regarding the proposed terms of any lease or 
transfer of Union Terrace Garden to CGT. 
 
Please be advised that Aberdeen City Council received your request for information 
on 14 March 2011.  Aberdeen City Council confirms that it has undertaken the 
requisite search for the information which you have requested.  Aberdeen City 
Council now writes to confirm that this information is not held by it. 
 
Yours faithfully, 
 
 
FOI Compliance Team 


