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To: request-716471-e0b19661@whatdotheyknow.com

Cc: LBS FOI <foi@sutton.gov.uk>

Dear Chandu

RBK, LBS and AfC (unifiedgov.co.uk) Mail - FOIS026 - CAF (CATCHMENT) Admissions Information

Kieran Holliday <kieran.holliday@sutton.gov.uk>

29 January 2021 at 16:38

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 - INFORMATION REQUEST - REF NO - FOIS026
| refer to your request for information received on 7 January 2021 concerning school admissions.

Some of the information requested is not available in accordance with the parameters of the request made; | hope the table

below explains the information we are able to provide.

Wallington High School for Girls as

2018 2019 2020
1) How many application received for These figures represent the total
Non Such High school as their 846 883 851 number of on-time preferences named;
preference ? (CAF within catchment at the time of application, they are not
area circle ) as of October 31st considered into catchment circles
210 210 240 Offers made at 1 March and at end of
How many offered places? process
61 36 74 This is a total from 1 March to 31
How many rejected place of offer? December
2) How many application received for
Non Such High school as their
preference ? & How many offered N/A N/A N/A Totals are included in Q1. No offers
places (late application) as of March were made to late applicants at 1
1st March
0 0 1 Total of late applications to 31
How many offered places? December
0 0 1 Total of late applications to 31
How many rejected place of offer? December
3) How many application received for
Non Such High school as their Not held 037 918
preference ? & How many offered This is not held as of June 1st; these
places(late application) as of June 1st total applications are at 31 December
N/A N/A N/A Totals to 31 December are included in
How many offered places? section 2
N/A N/A N/A Totals to 31 December are included in
How many rejected place of offer? section 2
4) How many application received for
Non Such High school as their
preference ? & How many offered N/A N/A N/A
places(late application) as of August This is not held as of August 31st;
31st ? please see section 3
N/A N/A N/A Totals to 31 December are included in
How many offered places? section 2
N/A N/A N/A Totals to 31 December are included in
How many rejected place of offer? section 2
5) How many application received for 766 802 800 These figures represent the total

number of on-time preferences named;
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their preference ? & How many
offered places (CAF within catchment
area circle ) as of October 31st
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at the time of application, they are not
considered into catchment circles

How many rejected place of offer?

210 210 210 Offers made at 1 March and at end of
How many offered places? process

82 56 82 This is a total from 1 March to 31
How many rejected place of offer? December
6) How many application received for
Wallington High School for Girls as
their preference ? &How many offered N/A N/A N/A Totals are included in Q5. No offers
places (late application) as of March were made to late applicants at 1
1st March

0 0 1 Total of late applications to 31
How many offered places? December
1 0 0 Total of late applications to 31

How many rejected place of offer? December
7) How many application received for
Wallington High School for Girls as Not held 835 848
their preference ? &How many offered This is not held as of June 1st; these
places (late application) as of June 1st total applications are at 31 December

N/A N/A N/A Totals to 31 December are included in
How many offered places? section 6

N/A N/A N/A Totals to 31 December are included in
How many rejected place of offer? section 6
8) How many application received for
Wallington High School for Girls as
their preference ? & How many N/A N/A N/A
offered places (late application) as of This is not held as of August 31st;
August 31st ? please see section 7

N/A N/A N/A Totals to 31 December are included in
How many offered places? section 6

N/A N/A N/A Totals to 31 December are included in

section 6

If you are unhappy with the way in which your request has been handled you have the right to ask for an internal review.
Please notify us in writing as soon as possible with the grounds upon which you feel the appeal is justified to
: foi@sutton.gov.uk or by post to Information Governance Team London Borough of Sutton

Civic Offices
St. Nicholas Way, Sutton SM1 1EA

We aim to respond to you within 20 working days of receiving your request. If it is going to take longer we will let you know.

Should you still be dissatisfied with the outcome you have the right to refer to the Information Commissioner: Wycliffe

House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF www.ico.org.uk

Yours sincerely

Kieran Holliday

Head of Pupil Based Commissioning
London Borough of Sutton

Civic Offices

St. Nicholas Way

Sutton SM1 1EA

0208 770 6553

07740173464

www.sutton.gov.uk

Follow us on LinkedIn
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Follow us on twitter @SuttonCouncil

Like us on facebook.com/SuttonCouncil

C Sutton
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