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Your request and our response are set out below.

Request

1. In February 2022, the council installed monitoring equipment to record the
number and length of vehicles passing over the disused railway bridge
(HGG2/1) on Church Road, Barcombe, during a seven-day period. Please
provide me with a copy of the results/report/outcome.

2. In November 2021, ESCC agreed to commission a new structural
assessment of Church Road bridge in Barcombe. If this has since been
completed, could | have a copy

Response

1. Please see the two spreadsheets attached for the daily volume and daily
length data recorded from this survey.

2. Information not held. Under Section 3 (2) of the Freedom of Information Act
2000 there is an exemption from the duty to provide information on request
when the information is not held. This has not yet been completed.



