FOIR220125-916Webb

Request for:
For each year that your Article 26 Scholarship programme has been running,
please could you provide me with:

1. The number of Article 26 scholarships that were advertised as being on offer
(each year).

2. The number of applications received for the Article 26 Scholarship (each
year).

3. The number of Article 26 Scholarships successfully awarded (each year).

4. The name of the main point of contact for your Article 26 Scholarship

programme.
Scholarships Scholarships

Year Applications | Offered Awarded
2012 Not recorded | 3 3

2013 Not recorded | 3 3

2014 Not recorded | 3 3

2015 44 3 3

2016 39 3 3

2017 26 3 3

2018 36 3 3

2019 23 3 4

2020 26 4 3

2021 27 4 5

2022 In progress 4 N/A

Contact Name — Jane Hopkinson or email studentdiversity@salford.ac.uk

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to ask for an
internal review. Internal review requests should be submitted to foi@salford.ac.uk.

If you are not content with the outcome of the internal review, you have the right to apply
directly to the Information Commissioner for a decision. The Information Commissioner
can be contacted at: Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane,
Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF
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