17/05/2022
Our Reference: FOIR-415147603
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Hastings...
Borough Council
Information Officer
Hastings Borough Council
Muriel Matters House
Breeds Place
Hastings
TN34 3UY

Mr. Hurrell

Dear Mr. Hurrell

| refer to your recent request for information from this authority. Our response to your request is below.
You have the right to request an internal review if you are not satisfied with any aspect of the way we have handled your
request for information or its content.

Once an internal review has been conducted and you still remain dissatisfied you may complain to the Information
Commissioner who will decide whether the request has been handled properly.

Please note: The Information Commissioner cannot generally make a decision unless our internal review process has first
been exhausted. The Information Commissioner can be contacted at:

The Information Commissioner’s Office
Wycliffe House

Water Lane

Wilmslow

Cheshire

SK9 AF

WWW.iC0.0rg.uk

Yours sincerely

Lisa Greathead

Information Officer

Muriel Matters House

Breeds Place

Hastings

TN34 3UY

01424 451066

E Mail: informationofficer@hastings.gov.uk

Subiject: Tree works on TPO protected trees at Shearbarn Caravan Park Barley Ln, Hastings TN35 5DX

Details of Request:

Tree works have been observed by members of the public on TPO protected trees. These works were carried out
between the 15/12/2021 and the 23/12/2021.

The location of the works were in woodland area W3 around the reservoir - please see HBC TPO number 310 and the
map pf area W3 : https://linkprotect.cudasvc.com/url?
a=https://www.hastings.gov.uk/content/plan...&c=E.1.EyVYskuCaTkvuefddYJT598bkY7sQJIKDFKe929 0-
ewKVigFmDPIB_56J3BMQEtFHO3xI6c44KuJZ6fnmiM_yFKI7vrBzcC2FyVhNEO8BQ5&typo=0

No planning permission has been granted for tree works in this area. A Planning Enforcement query to Hastings Borough
Council dated 01/02/2022 states that the tree works were carried out under authority of the Environment Agency and no
prior permission was therefore sought or necessary:

"Following a site visit on 21st December 2021 and 18th January 2022 by a Structural Engineer and a County


http://www.ico.org.uk
mailto:xxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxx@xxxxxxxx.xxx.xx
https://linkprotect.cudasvc.com/url?a=https://www.hastings.gov.uk/content/plan...&c=E,1,EyVYskuCaTkvuef9dYJT5q8bkY7sQJ9KDFKe929_0-ewKVfqFmDPiB_56J3BMQEtFHO3xI6c44KuJZ6fnmiM_yFKI7vrBzcC2FyVhNEO8BQ5&typo=0

Arborculturalist, we have confirmed that minor tree works were undertaken within a TPO zone. However these works
were done under the authority of the Environment Agency who have jurisdiction to conduct any required works on their
land. As such we will now close this case."

An EIR request to the Environment Agency (EA) reveals that the Environment Agency have no knowledge of these works.
https://linkprotect.cudasvc.com/url?a=https://www.whatdotheyknow.com/request/tree_works_on_tpo_protected tree?

nocache=incoming-20201344#incoming-2020134&c=E.1,-6gzNH-1ezGE5eDgMmMyXCvF9httFrZNb3W-

Aul5g7q 2aPb PEBQIOW|j0m-UyVIPMzXCkgR8nSmS9h98nMv720-7zaUdcvw5SMmirtgvS-Ooxj8d3jCuZMMCw,,&typo=0

| am concerned that these works were not done under the authority of the Environment Agency as claimed by HBC
Planning Enforcement. To allay these concerns | request any information that HBC holds  which confirms that the works
were carried out with Environment Agency authorisation.

1. Confirmation that tree works carried out were with the authority of the EA

2. The reference number used to authorise such works

3. Copies of any documents held by HBC  authorising such works

4. The location of the works

5. The scale and scope of the works

6. Why such works were deemed necessary by the Environment Agency

7. Whether any tree replantings will be carried out

8. Copies of any site visit reports/notes (in any form) by HBC officers

9. Copies of any site visit reports/notes (in any form) by the structural engineer

10. Copies of any site visit reports/notes (in any form) by the County Arborculturalist,

11. Copies of any correspondence (in any form) between HBC and the owners of the Caravan Park concerning these
works

12. Copies of any correspondence (in any form) between HBC and EA concerning these works

Please consider this a formal request under EIR.

This information is partially held

Response:

Q1 - This is not a request for recorded information. Please refer to the Environment Agency.
Q2 - Information not held. Please refer to the Environment Agency.

Q83 - Information not held.

Q4 - The works took place on the South-West bank of Ecclesbourne reservoir and they consisted of pollarding and
pruning.

Q5 - Please see response to Q4.
Q6 - Information not held.
Q7 - This is not a request for recorded information.

Q8 -


https://linkprotect.cudasvc.com/url?a=https://www.whatdotheyknow.com/request/tree_works_on_tpo_protected_tree?nocache=incoming-2020134#incoming-2020134&c=E,1,-6qzNH-1ezGE5eDgMmMyXCvF9httFrZNb3W-Aul5g7q_2aPb_PE6QI0Wj0m-UyVlPMzXCkqR8nSmS9h98nMv72O-7zaUdcvw5SMmjrtgvS-Ooxj8d3jCuZMMCw,,&typo=0

Visited the site and walked the reservoir with a member of the staff. Bramble bushes and grass are being removed in
order to prepare to open the reservoir for fishing. Several branches have been removed and a large amount of wood
chippings are present on the reservoir’'s banks. In order to identify whether these works contravene the area’s TPO, a site
visit will be conducted by **** in the immediate future; further action will be taken based on the comments from site
visit.” 21/12/2021

*kkk

Next site visit confirmed that works did not exceed what was allowed under the TPO restrictions.
Q9 - Information not held.

Q10 - Information not held.

Q11 - Information not held.

Q12 - Information not held.

End of Request

Please note:

This information is copyrighted to Hastings Borough Council and is supplied for your personal use only. Except as
permitted under the Copyright, Designs and Patents Act 1988, the information supplied may not be copied, distributed,
published, or exploited for commercial purposes or financial gain without the explicit written consent of Hastings Borough
Council.

We do not give permission for this information to be used for the purposes of direct marketing.

Your council services online at my.hastings.gov.uk



