




Date: 7 June 2019   
Our ref: ### 
Contact: Lynsey Wilson 
Direct dial: 01275 885117 
Email: lynsey.wilson@n-somerset.gov.uk

 

###

Corporate Services - Information requests 
 North Somerset Council 

 Town Hall 
Weston-super-Mare 

BS23 1UJ 

DX 744900 Clevedon 

Dear ###
 
Freedom of Information Act 2000
 
I can confirm that most of the information requested is held by North Somerset Council.  I have 
detailed below the information that is being released to you.  For ease of reference, I have enclosed a 
copy of your original request, so you can cross-reference the responses with the questions.

1. No
1. N/A
1.2 N/A
1.3 N/A
1.4 Please see enclosed email and document search results, which searched for terms “5G”, “2G 
in public spaces”, “3G in public spaces”, “4G in public spaces”, “WiFi in public spaces” and “WiGIG 
in public spaces”.  You will note that some information has been redacted out of the response.  
This is because the content did not fall within the scope of your request.

2. N/A

3.
a) CMS – Harvard, now Lucy Zodian Vision (no software / hardware specifications held)
b) We do not hold this information
c) We do not hold this information
d) We do not hold this information
e) We do not hold this information
f) All lanterns and CMS are to the relevant British and EU standards, and CE marked
g) We do not hold this information
h) SSE Contracting was our term maintenance contractor who did install the CMS system.  We 

are no longer installing any new CMS and will be removing it as part of our continued LED 
rollout

i) Centregreat Ltd who is our new term maintenance contractor
j) The manufacturers – CMS – Lucy Zodian (who took over from Harvard), LED Luminaires – 

Urbis Schreder and INDO Lighting, but also the term maintenance contractor
k) All lanterns and CMS are to the relevant British and EU standards, and CE marked which 

covers safety standards
l) We do not hold this information
m) We do not hold this information
n) No
o) All lanterns are to the relevant British and EU standards, and CE marked

4. Please see enclosed email and document search results, which searched for terms “5G”, “2G in 
public spaces”, “3G in public spaces”, “4G in public spaces”, “WiFi in public spaces” and “WiGIG in 



public spaces”.  You will note that some information has been redacted out of the response.  This 
is because the content did not fall within the scope of your request.
 

North Somerset Council now considers that it has complied with your request.  However, you have a 
right to appeal if you are dissatisfied with our response.  Requests for an internal review must be made 
in writing, and within 40 working days of this response being issued to you.  When requesting an 
internal review, please include your reference number, the date of your original request and your 
contact details.  Please also include an explanation of why you are dissatisfied with our response.  
Requests for an internal review should be sent to foi@n-somerset.gov.uk
 
If you are not content with the outcome of the internal review, you have the right to apply directly to the 
Information Commissioner for a decision. The Information Commissioner can be contacted at: 
The Information Commissioner's Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF. 
Phone: 0303 123 1113 
Website: www.ico.gov.uk
 
I will now close your request as of this date.
 
Yours sincerely
 

### 
###

mailto:xxx@xxxxxxxxxx.xxx.xx
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Lynsey Wilson

From: Richard Penska
Sent: 22 March 2016 10:45
To: Mike Jackson; John Wilkinson; Paul Morris; Richard Blows
Subject: FW: Transformation Initiatives
Attachments: Agilisys NSC-Project Commissioning Process_v1 2.pdf; Transformation Opps catalogue  - 

updated 05.03.16.xlsx

Dear all, 
 
Please find below an e-mail recently provided by Agilisys responding to the council’s request for 
transformation ideas.  

  

 
 

 
 
 

  
Sent: Monday, March 07, 2016 3:19 PM 
To: Richard Penska <Richard.Penska@n‐somerset.gov.uk> 
Subject: RE: Transformation Initiatives 
 
Richard 
 
Further to our earlier meeting, please now find attached the material we reviewed this morning; 
 

 Proposed commissioning process – as discussed 

 Opportunity Catalogue – updated to include alignment to NSC Transformation themes 
 
The initial 13 opportunities also have a completed pre‐qualification tab. 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 

  
Sent: 26 February 2016 18:56 
To: Richard Penska 
Subject: Transformation Initiatives 
 
Rich 
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Thanks for your time on Monday.   I committed to document what we agreed in terms of the initiatives that we 
would look to take forward as well as other investigative actions we would undertake. 
 
I will also take the opportunity here to outline next steps. 
 
Projects to Move Forward  

 Smart Town/Authority 

 
  

  

 
  

 
  

  

More Information Required 

  

  

 
  

 Street Lighting (LED’s) – RP to investigate  

  

  

  

  

We have already work‐shopped the output from our session on Monday and are in the process of 
developing/finalising the following: 
 

1. Blueprint proposal for future business case / project commissioning 
2. Pre‐qualification questionnaire (draft attached) 
3. Commercial model to articulate joint costs 
4. Delivery approach / sequencing 

 
Any proposals will also include known projects for next year   
 

 

 

 
 
 
 
 

 

| Transformation Programme Director | Agilisys  
 
North Somerset: Town Hall, Walliscote Grove Road, Weston-super Mare BS23 1UJ 

 
 
http://www.agilisys.co.uk 

 
At Agilisys we deliver success through innovation… working with our clients to transform services that make a difference to 
millions of people across the UK. 



ID Initiative Theme
Council Theme

Description
Status (22 

Feb 2016)

Qualificatio

n (Y/N)

Grouping Agilisys IT 

Involvemen

t

Agilisys IT 

Led

 

  

4 Smart Authority / Town Smart Authority > Becoming a Smart Authority / Town by harnessing data to allow residents / visitors 

to transact and interact with the Council and it's partners e.g. 

> Providing the infrastructure to become a Smart Authority e.g. free ubiquitous WiFi 

in public spaces

> Review of European funding

Yes N N/A M N

     

 

 

 

   

   

     

 

    

 

 

 

   

 

 

 

 

 

 

Y 5 L N

   

16 Street Lighting Replacement Street Lighting One Council Replacing current street luminaires with LEDs RP to confirm Y 12 L N

 

 

   

 

  14 M N

 

  14 M N

 

 

 

  15 L N

  

 

 

 

 

 

 



ID: 4 Initiative Title: 

Date Assessed: 04‐Mar‐16

Assessed By:

Directorates 

Impacted:

Organisation Qualification Area Question Answer Supporting Comments

Does the initiative support the aims of the Council? Y

Does the initiative support the aims of the Directorate and / or Service AY

Is there Political sponsorship (Leader and Portfolio Holder)? ?

Is there Executive sponsorship (Chief Executive and Director)? ?

Is there a relationship with the Head of Service?  ?

What is the addressable budget from which to derive benefits? Number

Can the initiative be Capitalised? Y

Will the initiative impact more than one service area? Y

What level of organisational change is required? M

What level of process change is required? L

What level of technical change is required? H

Will the initiative increase profitability? Y

Will the initiative develop relationships (within Council and wider regionY

Will the initiative create capability (to repeat sell)? Y

Is this an enabling initiative? ?

Is this a dependent initiative? ?

Stakeholder Assessment Is there a relationship with the Head of Service?  ?

What is the level of risk to reputation? H

What is the level of financial risk? H

Has Agilisys delivered this elsewhere? N

Will it be possible to use existing Agilisys services or solutions? N

Has Agilisys got the capability to deliver the initiative? N

Will Agilisys require external expertise/partners? Y

Decision: (Y/N)

No

Comments: A thought leadership piece is required prior to putting this through a Blueprint process. This will need to include a review of the EU funding.

Smart Authority / Town

Initiative Description:

> Becoming a Smart Authority / Town by harnessing data to allow residents / visitors to transact and interact with the Council 

and it's partners e.g. 

> Providing the infrastructure to become a Smart Authority e.g. free ubiquitous WiFi in public spaces

> Review of European funding

NSC Strategic Fit Assessment

Stakeholder Assessment

Financial Assessment

Complexity Assessment

Agilisys Strategic Fit Assessment

Risk Assessment

Capability Assessment



1

Lynsey Wilson

From: Richard Penska
Sent: 22 March 2016 14:51
To: Kieron Kilbride
Cc: John Wilkinson
Subject: RE: Digital strategy

Kieron, 
 
A revised Strategy Document would be good. Please find attached the Digital projects provided by 
Agilisys ( I think you will recognise most of them) for the Digital First Board’s consideration. 
 
Rich 
 

 
 

_____________________________________________ 
From: Kieron Kilbride  
Sent: Tuesday, March 22, 2016 11:54 AM 
To: Richard Penska <Richard.Penska@n‐somerset.gov.uk> 
Subject: Digital strategy 
 
 

Hello Richard 
 
I hope all is well. Just a quick follow up to last week’s strategy catch up. I’ve amended the 
doc to reflect your feedback. Would you like me to send over a copy (although I haven’t 
tracked changes)? 
 
I also thought I’d follow up on the outstanding action, whereby you were to send over the 
Agilisys potential project list for me to incorporate as necessary. If there was any update on 
that front it would be appreciated. 
 
Kind regards, 
 

Kieron Kilbride  

Digital Transformation Manager 

North Somerset Council 

 

Tel:   01934 42 6626  

E-Mail: xxxxxx.xxxxxxxx@xxxxxxxxxx.xxx.xx  

Post:  Town Hall, Walliscote Grove Road, Weston-super-Mare, BS23 1UJ  

Web:  www.n-somerset.gov.uk 

 



ID Initiative Theme
Council Theme

Description
Status (22 

Feb 2016)

Qualificatio

n (Y/N)

Grouping Agilisys IT 

Involvement

Agilisys IT 

Led
 

 

 

   

4 Smart Authority / Town Smart Authority > Becoming a Smart Authority / Town by harnessing data to allow residents / visitors to 

transact and interact with the Council and it's partners e.g. 

> Providing the infrastructure to become a Smart Authority e.g. free ubiquitous WiFi in 

public spaces

> Review of European funding

Yes N N/A M N
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Lynsey Wilson

From:
Sent: 20 July 2017 16:33
To: Michael Reep;  

Subject: RE: JSP Policy 7
Attachments: Policy 7 with introductory section with SGC Amends - Final 20th July 2017.docx

Thanks Michael for circulating and apologies for the delay in replying.  Here are the suggested amends from South 
Glos.  
 
Regards 
 

  

 
Strategic Planning Policy and Specialist Advice Manager 
South Gloucestershire Council 
01454 863574 

From: Michael Reep [mailto:Michael.Reep@n‐somerset.gov.uk]  
Sent: 07 July 2017 12:09 
To:  

 
 

 
Subject: JSP Policy 7 
 

Here is a revised version of Policy 7 where I have pulled out the common elements into an 
introductory section.  I have then struck through the original text which would be superfluous in the 
detailed SDLs.  I think this works – although there will be some discussion around the wording of 
the generic elements and what is needed in the detailed policies.  I suggest that any wording in 
the detailed policies should be specific to the location. 
 
Michael. 
 

Michael Reep  

Planning Policy Manager 

Development & Environment 

North Somerset Council 

 

Tel:                01934 426775  

E-Mail:          Michael.Reep@n-somerset.gov.uk 

Post:             Town Hall, Walliscote Grove Road, Weston-super-Mare, BS23 1UJ  

Web:           www.n-somerset.gov.uk 

 

Keeping in touch 

Visit www.n‐somerset.gov.uk for information about our services 



Draft Confidential: This document is not for wider circulation 

 

JSP Draft Policy 

 

 

POLICY 7 – STRATEGIC DEVELOPMENT LOCATIONS SITE REQUIREMENTS 

The following Strategic Development Locations will be delivered during the plan period: 

Bath and North East Somerset: North Keynsham, Whitchurch. 

North Somerset: Backwell, Banwell, Churchill, Nailsea. 

South Gloucestershire: Buckover Garden Village, Charfield, South of Chipping Sodbury, Coalpit 

Heath, Yate, Thornbury. 

The guiding principles common to all the strategic development locations are: 

  

 

  

 

 

  

 

 

  

  

 

 

 

  

  

 

 

  

  

 

 

  

 

  

  

 

 

  

 

 



Draft Confidential: This document is not for wider circulation 

 

 

 

• Provision of high speed digital infrastructure, including wifi in public spaces. 
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Lynsey Wilson

From: xxxxxxxxxx@xxxxxxxxxx.xx.xx
Sent: 25 April 2019 05:57
To: The Campus
Subject: Legalbrief Today - Jiba, Mrwebi found unfit for office

CAUTION: This email originated from outside North Somerset Council. Only click on links or open attachments if you 
recognise the sender and if you are certain that the content is safe. 

  

  

 

Legal News Watch  

Issue no:4685 Thursday 25 April 2019 

View in browser  

Today's Headlines 
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Vodacom claims it has reduced the cost of data in the past year. In a 
statement recorded in a Moneyweb report, spokesperson Byron Kennedy
says: ‘Vodacom can confirm that, as part of its ongoing pricing transformation
strategy to address the cost-to-communicate in SA, we have reduced the
effective cost of data by 34% in the past calendar year alone.’ The report 
notes the Competition Commission measured SA data prices against other
countries in Africa and around the world and found they compare poorly. One 
reason is the government’s repeated delays in providing new mobile
spectrum, which would increase access and bring down costs, it said. 
However, any upcoming auction should be based on a requirement for
providers to cut fees and lay on services including free WiFi in public spaces.
The wireless carriers’ views on the findings should be submitted by 14 June,
while a final report will be published later this year. 
Full Moneyweb report 
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