

**FOI Request F071.17-18 Final**

Academic Year / Breakdown	1) BEM Applicants receiving offer from University of Warwick						
	Level of Study	Male		Female		Total	
		Offers	%	Offers	%	Offers	%
17/18	Undergraduate	2,616	12.2%	2,626	12.2%	5,242	24.4%
16/17		2,485	11.7%	2,411	11.3%	4,896	23.0%
15/16		2,004	10.5%	1,976	10.3%	3,980	20.8%
14/15		1,730	10.8%	1,431	9.0%	3,161	19.8%
13/14		1,448	9.7%	1,284	8.6%	2,732	18.3%
17/18	Postgraduate Taught	390	1.8%	415	1.9%	805	3.7%
16/17		393	1.8%	419	2.0%	812	3.8%
15/16		323	1.7%	324	1.7%	647	3.4%
14/15		365	2.3%	350	2.2%	715	4.5%
13/14		407	2.7%	335	2.2%	742	5.0%
17/18	Postgraduate Research	54	0.3%	48	0.2%	102	0.5%
16/17		33	0.2%	41	0.2%	74	0.3%
15/16		42	0.2%	28	0.1%	70	0.4%
14/15		50	0.3%	47	0.3%	97	0.6%
13/14		28	0.2%	34	0.2%	62	0.4%

Academic Year / Breakdown	2) BEM Students Enrolled at University of Warwick						
	Level of Study	Male		Female		Total	
		Intake	%	Intake	%	Intake	%
17/18	Undergraduate	607	10.5%	590	10.2%	1,197	20.7%
16/17		555	9.3%	521	8.8%	1,076	18.1%
15/16		525	8.9%	491	8.4%	1,016	17.3%
14/15		458	8.2%	457	8.2%	915	16.4%
13/14		423	7.3%	465	8.0%	888	15.4%
17/18	Postgraduate Taught	218	3.8%	251	4.3%	469	8.1%
16/17		237	4.0%	262	4.4%	499	8.4%
15/16		243	4.1%	237	4.0%	480	8.2%
14/15		254	4.6%	235	4.2%	489	8.8%
13/14		270	4.7%	219	3.8%	489	8.5%
17/18	Postgraduate Research	31	0.5%	29	0.5%	60	1.0%
16/17		24	0.4%	28	0.5%	52	0.9%
15/16		33	0.6%	23	0.4%	56	1.0%
14/15		33	0.6%	34	0.6%	67	1.2%
13/14		19	0.3%	25	0.4%	44	0.8%

**FOI Request F071.17-18 Final**

Academic Year / Breakdown	3) BEM Applicant Actual GCSE Level Grades					
	A*	A	B	C	D	Other
17/18						
16/17						
15/16						
14/15						
13/14						

**Data Notes**

• Section 1(1) (a) Freedom of Information Act imposes a duty on public authorities to inform the requester whether or not the information requested is held by the authority. The University does not hold the grades achieved at GCSE level, so is unable to answer this part of your request.

Academic Year / Breakdown	4) BEM Applicant Predicted A Level Grades					
	A*	A	B	C	D	Other
17/18						
16/17						
15/16						
14/15						
13/14						

Academic Year / Breakdown	5) BEM Applicant Actual A Level Grades					
	A*	A	B	C	D	Other
17/18						
16/17						
15/16						
14/15						
13/14						

**Data Notes**

• The University is unable to provide information in relation to part of your request as the information regarding exam results is held individually for each applicant. The University's admission team does not have the software or the expertise to collate predicted or actual exam performance into the requested groupings. Each qualification for an applicant is presented as a single entry, therefore, to determine what A-level subjects the applicants took or the grades attained it would be necessary to conduct a manual search of each line for each applicant to ascertain each subject and each grade, which the University estimates would exceed the cost limit. Section 12(1) of the Freedom of Information Act states that a public authority is not obliged to comply with a request for information if the authority estimates that the cost of complying with the request would exceed the appropriate limit. This is currently £450, which equates to 18 hours of staff time calculated at £25 an hour as set out in the Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulations 2004.

**FOI Request F071.17-18 Final - 6) BEM Applicant degree courses applied for**

6) BEM Applicant degree courses applied for - Undergraduate

Academic Year / Breakdown	Accounting and Finance	Accounting and Finance (with Foundation Year)	BEng Civil Engineering	BEng Electronic Engineering	BEng Engineering	BEng Mechanical Engineering	Biochemistry	Biochemistry (MBio)	Biological Sciences	Biomedical Science	Biomedical Science (MBio)	Chemistry 3 yr Variants	Chemistry with Management
13/14	19	0	9	7	22	26	16	0	11	53	0	15	6
14/15	30	0	9	0	17	27	13	0	6	38	0	29	0
15/16	25	16	5	0	31	38	18	0	8	49	0	29	0
16/17	25	11	0	0	20	32	23	0	12	52	0	28	0
17/18	25	10	0	0	10	20	16	6	15	41	12	36	0

  

Academic Year / Breakdown	Childhood, Education and Society	Classical Civilisation	Coaching	Coaching and Mentoring (HE Level One)	Computer Science	Computer Science MEng	Discrete Mathematics	Early Childhood	Early Years Professional Studies	Economics 3 Year Variants	Economics, Politics and International Studies	Education Studies	Engineering (Degree Apprenticeship)
13/14	8	5	0	0	8	9	9	0	0	61	8	0	0
14/15	0	5	0	0	9	9	10	0	0	66	0	0	0
15/16	0	7	0	0	16	15	8	0	5	82	0	8	0
16/17	0	0	8	0	20	12	6	6	0	60	6	5	0
17/18	0	6	5	5	22	18	6	0	0	64	0	0	7

  

Academic Year / Breakdown	English and French	English Literature	English Literature and Creative Writing	Film and Literature	French and History	History	History and Philosophy	History and Politics	History and Sociology	History, Literature and Cultures of the Americas	Information Systems Management and Innovation	International Management	Law (3 year) (Qualifying Degree)
13/14	6	23	0	5	0	23	0	9	0	0	0	0	51
14/15	0	22	5	0	5	34	0	8	0	0	5	6	38
15/16	0	27	0	0	0	26	0	6	0	5	0	0	47
16/17	0	21	0	0	0	39	0	8	11	0	0	6	62
17/18	0	22	5	0	0	63	5	16	0	0	0	0	54

  

Academic Year / Breakdown	Law (European) (Qualifying Degree)	Law (Year Abroad) (Qualifying Degree)	Law and Business Studies (Three-Year)	Law and Sociology (Qualifying Degree)	Law with French Law (Qualifying Degree)	Law with Social Sciences (3 Year) (Qualifying Degr)	Liberal Arts	Management	Management (with Foundation Year)	Master of Chemistry Variants	Master of Maths, Operational Research, Statistics and Economics	Mathematics (BSc)	Mathematics (MMath)
13/14	5	0	16	10	0	0	0	13	0	14	19	17	35
14/15	5	0	16	0	0	0	0	13	0	13	23	22	36
15/16	0	9	14	12	0	6	0	8	5	7	22	19	43
16/17	0	7	11	5	0	0	8	11	0	22	17	20	29
17/18	0	9	6	11	6	0	8	14	0	13	17	30	34

  

Academic Year / Breakdown	Mathematics and Physics (BSc MMathPhys)	Mathematics and Physics (BSc)	Mathematics and Physics (MMathPhys)	Mathematics and Statistics (BSc MMathStat)	Mathematics and Statistics (BSc)	Mathematics, Operational Research, Statistics and Economics	MBChB	MEng Engineering	MEng Mechanical Engineering	Modern Languages	Modern Languages and Economics (4-year)	Person-Centred Counselling and Psychotherapy	Philosophy
13/14	6	5	0	0	0	11	27	7	0	0	0	7	22
14/15	6	0	0	0	5	5	36	17	8	5	0	17	14
15/16	12	0	0	5	0	10	32	9	6	0	0	0	9
16/17	11	7	0	9	8	14	41	17	20	0	0	8	15
17/18	0	0	18	6	10	17	50	19	23	0	6	0	22

FOI Request F071.17-18 Final - 6) BEM Applicant degree courses applied for

6) BEM Applicant degree courses applied for - Undergraduate

Academic Year / Breakdown	Philosophy and Literature	Philosophy with Psychology	Philosophy, Politics and Economics	Physics (BSc MPhys)	Physics (BSc)	Physics (MPhys)	Politics	Politics and International Studies	Politics and Sociology	Politics with International Studies	Psychology	Social Studies (Full-time)	Social Studies (Part-time)
13/14	5	0	26	12	10	0	7	0	6	22	31	0	0
14/15	0	0	32	15	6	0	7	0	7	21	16	0	5
15/16	10	0	27	21	5	0	5	30	7	0	24	0	0
16/17	6	6	32	20	8	0	0	19	0	0	32	0	0
17/18	0	0	26	0	10	15	6	15	9	0	46	5	0

  

Academic Year / Breakdown	Social Studies [2 + 2]	Sociology	Sure Start-Recognised Early Years Foundation Degree	Theatre and Performance Studies
13/14	20	11	5	0
14/15	20	19	0	0
15/16	25	14	0	0
16/17	25	19	0	5
17/18	10	39	0	0

**FOI Request F071.17-18 Final - 6) BEM Applicant degree courses applied for**

**6) BEM Applicant degree courses applied for - Postgraduate Taught**

Academic Year / Breakdown	Advanced Clinical Practice for Health Care Profess	Advanced Legal Studies	Advanced Mechanical Engineering	Biotechnology, Bioprocessing & Business Management	Business Administration	Business Administration (Distance Learning)	Business Administration (Executive)	Business Administration (Executive) London	Business Administration (for the Global Energy Ind	Career Development	Career Development and Coaching Studies	Central Banking & Financial Regulation	Clinical Applications of Psychology
13/14	0	0	0	5	6	69	21	0	5	0	5	0	0
14/15	0	0	0	6	0	72	15	0	5	7	0	0	0
15/16	7	0	0	0	5	58	0	34	0	7	0	0	0
16/17	0	5	5	5	9	29	11	23	0	12	0	9	0
17/18	0	8	8	9	0	0	9	17	0	0	0	28	5

  

Academic Year / Breakdown	Computer Science	Continental Philosophy	Cyber Security and Management	Diabetes	Early Years Initial Teacher Training	Economics	Education (FE and Skills)	Educational Innovation	Educational Leadership (Teach First)	Educational Leadership (Teaching Leaders)	Educational Leadership and Management	Engineering Business Management (Home Fees)	Engineering Business Management (OS and PT)
13/14	0	0	0	9	0	7	0	8	9	5	7	5	5
14/15	0	0	0	9	5	9	0	6	16	0	5	0	0
15/16	0	5	0	0	0	11	6	0	11	0	0	0	0
16/17	0	0	9	0	5	7	10	6	18	0	0	0	0
17/18	5	0	12	0	5	9	5	0	10	0	0	0	0

  

Academic Year / Breakdown	English Literature	Essentials of Clinical Education	Finance	Finance and Economics	Healthcare Operational Management	Human Resource Management and Employment Relations	Implant Dentistry	Innovation and Entrepreneurship	International Corporate Governance and Financial	International Development	International Development Law and Human Rights	International Political Economy	International Relations
13/14	0	5	0	0	0	0	12	0	6	0	6	0	0
14/15	0	0	5	0	0	6	0	0	5	0	6	5	5
15/16	5	7	0	0	0	0	0	0	10	6	10	0	0
16/17	0	0	0	0	6	0	0	6	6	0	7	0	0
17/18	0	0	6	5	0	0	0	5	0	0	9	0	0

  

Academic Year / Breakdown	International Trade, Strategy and Operations	Leadership for Healthcare	Management	Medical Biotechnology and Business Management	Medical Education	Orthodontics	PGCE (Early Years)	PGCE (Primary) School Direct Salaried	PGCE (Primary): English Specialism	PGCE (Primary): Mathematics Specialism	PGCE (Primary): Science Specialism	PGCE (Primary): Special Education Needs Specialism	PGCE (Secondary) School Direct
13/14	0	0	0	0	15	16	0	0	0	0	6	0	10
14/15	0	10	0	0	17	18	7	0	0	0	8	0	14
15/16	0	0	10	0	11	6	0	0	6	6	0	0	10
16/17	5	0	0	0	15	17	6	0	5	0	0	0	13
17/18	8	0	0	8	11	7	0	5	0	5	0	5	21

  

Academic Year / Breakdown	PGCE (Secondary) School Direct Salaried	PGCE (Secondary): Chemistry	PGCE (Secondary): Mathematics	Professional Education	Programme and Project Management	Public Health	Religions, Society and Education	Restorative Dentistry	Social Work	Statistics	Sustainable Materials and Manufacturing	Teaching Advanced Mathematics
13/14	6	0	0	0	9	8	0	11	17	0	0	6
14/15	0	0	0	0	7	7	0	0	10	0	0	5
15/16	0	0	8	0	6	8	0	0	24	0	5	0
16/17	5	5	12	0	8	6	0	0	18	0	0	0
17/18	6	0	5	8	10	0	5	0	9	7	0	0

**FOI Request F071.17-18 Final - 6) BEM Applicant degree courses applied for**

6) BEM Applicant degree courses applied for - Postgraduate Research

Academic Year / Breakdown	Chemistry	Engineering	Health Sciences	Life Sciences	Life Sciences (MIBTP)	Warwick Business School Doctoral Programme
13/14	0	6	5	0	0	0
14/15	0	0	0	0	0	7
15/16	0	0	0	0	0	0
16/17	0	5	0	5	0	0
17/18	6	5	0	0	6	0



FOI Request F071.17-18 Final

Academic Year / Breakdown	9) BEM Applicant First Generation			
	BEMs parents didn't go to		BEMs parents did go to university	
	Total #	Total %	Total #	Total %
17/18				
16/17				
15/16				
14/15				
13/14				

**Data Notes**

• Section 1(1) (a) Freedom of Information Act imposes a duty on public authorities to inform the requester whether or not the information requested is held by the authority. The University does not hold information relating to it's applicant's or student's parents attendance at University, so is unable to answer this part of your request.

Academic Year / Breakdown	10) BEM Applications to the University of Warwick		
	Level of Study	Total #	Total %
17/18	Undergraduate	7,809	25.8%
16/17		7,149	24.2%
15/16		5,395	19.9%
14/15		4,546	18.1%
13/14		4,547	19.9%
17/18	Postgraduate Taught	1,518	5.0%
16/17		1,407	4.8%
15/16		936	3.5%
14/15		1,265	5.0%
13/14		1,225	5.4%
17/18	Postgraduate Research	266	0.9%
16/17		209	0.7%
15/16		272	1.0%
14/15		274	1.1%
13/14		249	1.1%