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Dear Chris Roberts,
Thank you for your Freedom of Information request of 12 September 2017. You asked:
“In Theodore Allan’s FoI, Your Ref: 3555, he asked for any recorded information held by the
DWP stating whether or not it was a legal requirement for a claimant to provide a mobile phone
number or email address in order to claim Universal Credit (UC) when the claimant is being
switched from Jobseeker’s Allowance (JSA) to UC.
In your reply, you stated: (a) there was no recorded information on this issue because it is not
a legal requirement of claiming UC that a claimant provide a mobile phone number or email
address; and (b) UC can be paid to the claimant without either of these being recorded.
However, in your reply to Glenys Harriman’s FoI request, Your Ref: 3128, the CTA (Call To
Action) letter that you included states that claimants will need their own email address before
they can begin the switch over process.
1. When claimants are being switched from JSA to UC, will their claim for UC be suspended
and terminated if they fail to provide an email address or phone number as part of the switch
over?
2. Will their JSA be suspended, i.e. will they be sanctioned if they do not provide an email
address and phone number?
3. If it is not a legal or policy requirement for claimants to provide an email address or phone
number when being switched over, how is their claim processed?
DWP Response:
We do not hold the requested information.
FOI 3128 and the response refers to the move from Universal Credit Live Service to Universal
Credit full service. This is different to the managed migration of legacy benefit claimants to
Universal Credit. This process does not start until 2019, when we will start managed migration
of existing benefit claimants to Universal Credit. This will be completed by March 2022.

We are still planning this activity and will make final decisions and announcements in due
course. There is currently no policy or guidance available.
Yours sincerely,

DWP Strategy FoI Team
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