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Dear Mr Temple 
 
FOI Call ID: iw21/2/13035 
 
Thank you for your Freedom of Information request, which was received on 8 February 2021.   
 
Please find below the information you have requested. 
 
Please can you supply me with the following information about items considered under Part B (Press and 
Public excluded) at meetings of the council: 

1) Are the specific reasons as to why the information is exempt stated in the Agenda for the meeting? The 
exemption reason is contained within the agenda item excluding the Press and Public, and a list of exempt 
information is contained in the Council’s constitution Part 5 Section 2 (Access to Information Rules) 
Paragraph 6 (please see Part 1 of Schedule 12A to the Local Government Act 1972). 

2) Is the Part B of the meeting fully minuted and the full minute agreed in Part B of a future meeting? We 
do not hold information relevant to your request.  

If not, how is the Part B minuted? We do not hold information relevant to your request. 

3) Are all or some papers considered under Part B routinely reviewed at a later date to establish whether 
the reason for their exemption remains valid, or whether the passage of time has resulted in the public 
interest in their publication out weighing the reason for which they were originally exempted? We do not 
hold information relevant to your request. 

4) If only some items are routinely reviewed, what is the policy as to which items should be reviewed? We 
do not hold information relevant to your request. 

5) When it is established that the exempt paperwork or record relating to a Part B meeting is appropriate 
for total or partial publication, either as a result of routine review or because it has been supplied in reply 
to a Freedom of Information request, is that paperwork then published on the council’s website alongside 
the other paperwork for the relevant meeting? We do not hold information relevant to your request. 

 

https://iow.moderngov.co.uk/documents/s1979/PART%205%20-%20Access%20to%20Information%20Rules.pdf


6) Has the council ever reviewed its policy on Part B papers in one of the council’s public meetings? Full
council do routinely review and agree the constitution, of which the access to information provisions, form
a part.

You are free to use any information supplied for your own non-commercial, research, or private 
study purposes. However, if you intend to use the information for other reasons, please contact the 
Corporate Information Unit for advice. 

Please contact me again if you require any further assistance on this matter and I will do my best 
to provide relevant help and advice. 

If you have any complaints in respect of your information request, please write to the Corporate 
Information Unit at the above address, or complete the on-line appeals form that can be found at 
www.iwight.com. If your complaint is not resolved to your complete satisfaction, you have the 
ultimate right, once you have exhausted the internal appeals process, to appeal to the Information 
Commissioner. 
Yours sincerely 

 Lucy Mclaughlin 
Lucy Mclaughlin 
Corporate Leadership Support Officer (Lead) 


