
 

 
 
Mr Abdul Muhaimin 
  

London Borough of Redbridge
Lynton House 

255-259 High Rd, 
Ilford IG1 1NN

Children’s Services team

Please reply to:
Sue Garner

 Head of Admissions, Awards and Complaints
02087083282

xxx.xxxxxxxxxxx@xxxxxxxxx.xxx.xx
www.redbridge.gov.uk

 
 Our ref: 880735

 
Date: 23 October 2017

 
 
 
Dear Mr Muhaimin
 
Freedom of Information Act 2000
 
I can confirm that the information requested is held by London Borough of Redbridge. I have detailed 
below the information that is being released to you, some of which is attached:

I am interested in school level data for admissions into Redbridge schools through the annual 
secondary transfer process.

For each school that you hold the data for I would like 

     Q1.   * Establishment LA 
* Establishment DfE number 
* Admitting authority 

A. Please find attached an Excel spreadsheet that provides the information requested above.

     Q2.    * Year 
               * Admission criteria 

A. Please find attached the Guidance for Parents Booklets for the relevant academic years:
For 2017-2018, please refer to page 13 for community schools and pages 47-90 for own 
admission authority schools in the ‘Transfer to Secondary School 2017’ attached.

For 2016-2017, please refer to page 10 for community schools and pages 20-60 for own 
admission authority schools in the ‘Transfer to Secondary School 2016’ attached.

http://www.redbridge.gov.uk


 

For 2015-2016, please refer to page 8 for community schools and pages 27-59 for own 
admission authority schools in the ‘Transfer to Secondary School 2015’ attached.

Q3.   * Distance of last admitted pupil, where distance a factor stating length measurement use

*Breakdown of number of pupils admitted (broken down by criteria by which they were           
admitted, eg Looked After, Sibling, Distance, entrance exam) 

               * Total number of applications (broken down by preference, eg. first, second, third)

A.   Please find attached the Guidance for Parents Booklets for the relevant academic years:

For 2017-2018, please refer to page 104 of the Guidance for Parents Booklet ‘Transfer to   
Secondary School 2018’ attached.

For 2016-2017, please refer to page 102 of the Guidance for Parents Booklet ‘Transfer to   
Secondary School 2017’ attached.

For 2015-2016, please refer to page 67 of the Guidance for Parents Booklet ‘Transfer to   
Secondary School 2016’ attached.

      Q5.   * Breakdown of number of pupils admitted (broken down by preference, e.g. first, second, 
third, LA placed) 

A.  Please find attached an Excel spreadsheet with the information we hold relating to preferences 
for places offered. We do not hold records for the numbers admitted.
Please note that we do not hold this information for individual schools, only for the full cohort 
for each year.

     Q6.    * Number of appeals heard 
                * Number of appeals allowed 

A. Please find attached the Guidance for Parents Booklets for the relevant academic years:
For 2017-2018, please refer to page 103 of the Guidance for Parents Booklet ‘Transfer to 
Secondary School 2018’ attached.

For 2016-2017, please refer to page 101 of the Guidance for Parents Booklet ‘Transfer to 
Secondary School 2017’ attached.

For 2015-2016, please refer to page 66 of the Guidance for Parents Booklet ‘Transfer to 
Secondary School 2016’ attached.

      Q7.  * Published Admission Number 

A. Please find Excel spreadsheet attached.



 

       Q8.   * Number of pupils on roll 11-16, 16-19 

A.  Please find attached the Guidance for Parents Booklets for the annual January Census 
information:

For 11-16 in January 2017, please refer to pages 98- 99 of the Guidance for Parents Booklet 
‘Transfer to Secondary School 2018’ attached.

For 11-16 in January 2016, please refer to pages 96- 97 of the Guidance for Parents Booklet 
‘Transfer to Secondary School 2017’ attached.

For 11-16 in January 2015, please refer to pages 62- 63 of the Guidance for Parents Booklet 
‘Transfer to Secondary School 2016’ attached.

Please note that we do not hold the information you have requested for Sixth Forms. Please 
contact the schools directly for this.

 
Please quote the reference number 880735 in any future communications.

If you are dissatisfied with the outcome or the handling of your request, you have the right to ask for 
an internal review. Internal review requests should be submitted within 20 working days of the date of 
receipt of the response to your original email or letter and should be addressed to:
Information Officer, 10th Floor (front), Lynton House, High Road, Ilford, IG1 1NN or sent to 
xxx.xxxxxxxxxxx@xxxxxxxxx.xxx.xx 

If you are still dissatisfied with the Council’s response after the internal review you have a right of 
appeal to the Information Commissioner at:

The Information Commissioner's Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire SK9 5AF. 
Telephone: 01625 545 700 
Website: www.ico.gov.uk

I will now close your request as of this date.
 
Yours sincerely

  
Sue Garner 
Head of Admissions, Awards and Complaints
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