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        We don't know whether the most recent response to this request contains information or not – if you are cMilnes please sign in and let everyone know.
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        cMilnes
      

      
          23 September 2019

        
                      Delivered        

    


    
      We couldn’t load the mail server logs for this message.

      Try opening the logs in a new window.

    


    
      Dear Imperial College London,


1) Please could you provide statistics on the number of non academic part time roles you have recruited into in the last five years at grade 4 or above.


Please break the data down into:

2016

2017

2018 and 

2019.


2) Please could you provide the number of part time roles, grade 4 or above, that have been recruited into roles in the current Enterprise department.


Please break down the data into:


2016

2017

2018

2019


Do not include any employees who were initially recruited into full time posts.


Yours faithfully,


cMilnes
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        IMPFOI,
        Imperial College London
    

    
      23 September 2019
  


  

      

    
      

    Dear C Milnes,


This is to acknowledge receipt of your request below, made under the Freedom of Information Act. The College will respond to your request by 21st October 2019.


Kind regards,


Freedom of Information Team

Imperial College London
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    Dear Ms Milnes,

  

 Thank you for your FOI requests (our references 507, 508 and 521). Your

 requests and our responses are below.

  


  1. IMPFOI-19-507, received 23/09/19, Part-time roles grade 4 and above,

 past five years


  

 1) Please could you provide statistics on the number of non academic part

 time roles you have recruited into in the last five years at grade 4 or

 above.

  

 Please break the data down into:

 2016

 2017

 2018 and

 2019.

  

 2) Please could you provide the number of part time roles, grade 4 or

 above, that have been recruited into roles in the current Enterprise

 department.

  

 Please break down the data into:

  

 2016

 2017

 2018

 2019

  

 Do not include any employees who were initially recruited into full time

 posts.

  

 We are able to provide figures on the number of new starters whose working

 hours were less than the standard full-time hours at the time they took up

 the role, as follows:

  


 Staff Group Professional, Technical, Operational, Learning and Teaching


 Grade Grade 4 to 7


 All Imperial College Year 2016 Year 2017 Year 2018 Year 2019 to 21 Oct

 Employee Starters 2019

 Under 1 FTE 24 30 39 24

 Enterprise Employee Year 2016 Year 2017 Year 2018 Year 2019 to 21 Oct

 Starters 2019

 Under 1 FTE 0 1 2 0


  

  

  


  2. IMPFOI-19-508, received 23/09/19, Staff grievances


  

 Please could you provide the following statistics separately for each year

 2016, 2017, 2018 and 2019.

  

 1) The number of formal grievances submitted by employees in total.

  


 2016 2017 2018 2019 Total

 15 9 20 26 70


  

  

 2) The number of formal grievances that included claims of disability

 discrimination.

  

 Of the total grievances for the period, 3 out of 70 involved allegations

 of disability discrimination. We are unable to break the numbers down by

 year because of the low numbers involved and the risk that the individuals

 involved could be identified.

  

 3) The number of formal grievances that included allegations of the

 College not abiding by its own internal policies.

  

 3 out of 70.

  

 4) The number of formal grievances that included complaints against

 members of the human resources function.

  

 Fewer than 3 out of 70.

  

 5) The number of grievances in each year that ultimately resulted in the

 employee leaving the College.

  

 This information is not held by the College. We would not be able to

 distinguish between people who raised a grievance and then subsequently

 left the College for some other reason (for example because they were on a

 fixed-term contract)) and those who left for reasons related to a

 grievance.

  

 6) The number of employees with disclosed mental health issues.

  

 We are not clear what you mean by “disclosed mental health issues”. The

 College may be made aware of employees’ mental health issues through

 various channels, which might include the reasons given to explain

 sickness absence and referrals to Occupational Health. If you are

 interested in the number of employees who have a declared disability that

 relates to mental health issues, please confirm.

  

  


  3. IMPFOI-19-521, received 03/10/19, Compliance with the PSED and info

 about grievances


  

 In accordance with The Equality Act 2010  please could you provide the the

 annual publications (the last five years) that demonstrates compliance

 with the PSED. Namely the proactive steps that the College has taken to:

  

 "1. Eliminate discrimination, harassment, victimisation and any other

 conduct prohibited by the Act.

 2. Advance equality of opportunity between persons who share a relevant

 protected characteristic and persons who do not.

 3. Foster good relations between persons who share a relevant protected

 characteristic and persons who do not"

  

 Please find attached published reports addressing these matters. Please

 see also the links below for further figures relating to the Public Sector

 Equality Duty.

  

 [1]https://www.imperial.ac.uk/about/introdu...

 [2]https://www.imperial.ac.uk/human-resourc...

  

 I would be particularly like information pertaining to how the College has

 addressed the above criteria for those with mental health issues at the

 College?

  

 Please see the publications attached and referred to above.

  

 For the years 2015, 2016, 2017 and 2018 please could you provide the

 numbers of formal grievances that have been submitted to the College by

 its employees pertaining to:

  

 1) Harassment

 2) Victimization

 3) Direct discrimination

  

 With regards to direct discrimination what proportion of grievances to the

 College involved the Complainant having mental health issues?

  

  

 We do not record information about grievances in a way that enables us to

 distinguish between those involving grievances brought on the basis of

 allegations of harassment, victimisation or direct discrimination. The

 categorisation used is “harassment and bullying”. The numbers of

 grievances raised that were categorised as relating to harassment and

 bullying are as follows:

  


 2015 2016 2017 2018 2019

 3 or less 11 3 or less 7 18


  

  

 If you are unhappy with the way that we have handled your request, you can

 ask us to conduct a review. Please make your representation in writing

 within 40 days of the date you received this response. If you remain

 dissatisfied with how Imperial College has handled your request, you may

 then approach the Information Commissioner’s Office.   

  

 Yours,

  

 Freedom of Information Team

 Imperial College London 
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        cMilnes
      

      
          31 October 2019

        
                      Delivered        

    


    
      We couldn’t load the mail server logs for this message.

      Try opening the logs in a new window.

    


    
      Dear IMPFOI,

Thank you for your response.


I am concerned by the response pertaining to the adherence of the University to Public Sector Equality Duty (PSED).


1) One of the links to information the University believes provides information on its adherence to PSED is only available to those who are employees/students at the University and is password protected. 

Why is this not available to the public?


2) I appear to have been sent a number of documents that contain general statements but no statistics or information on how statements will be achieved or when any aims will be delivered?


3) In the HR strategy document there are only two references to mental health (for which information was specifically requested).


i) "..we will provide the best in class support in physical and mental health.."

ii) " An organisation that nurtures the physical and mental health of its workforce"


Could you explain:


Which part of the documents demonstrates compliance, it is not clear. 


4) The University wide strategy does not appear to mention mental health. It does mention diversity three times, however only once is an aim. 


" we will be proactive in our promotion of inclusiveness and diversity"...


Could you provide details on how the above has been achieved?  Which part of the strategy document demonstrates delivery of the University's responsibility under S.149 of the Equality Act 2010?


Yours sincerely,


cMilnes


    


    

    




      
  
    

    Link to this

    Report
  









      



  
    
        IMPFOI,
        Imperial College London
    

    
      31 October 2019
  


  

      

    
      

    Dear Ms Milnes,


Thank you for your further communication about your FOI requests. We shall treat this as an internal review and respond to you by 28 November 2019.


Yours,


Freedom of Information Team

Imperial College London 
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    Dear Ms Milnes,


  


 Thank you for your recent Internal Review Request. You were unhappy about

 the information provided in response to your request relating to the

 Public Sector Equality Duty (PSED), our ref. IMPFOI-19-521.


  


 I am sorry that we sent you a link to a page on our website that was not

 accessible. I have downloaded and attached a pdf version of the statistics

 relating to staff published on that page. It provides general information

 about staff that broadly relate to the PSED. There is nothing on those

 pages relating specifically to mental health issues. As stated in our

 response, the links provided were to "further figures relating to the

 Public Sector Equality Duty". You may also find the following information

 helpful, in addition to the information that was provided originally:

 [1]https://www.imperial.ac.uk/health-and-we...


  


 In respect of your other points, it is important to bear in mind that the

 Freedom of Information Act gives the public a right to access records held

 by public authorities. As the [2]Information Commissioner’s guidance

 states, while a request may be phrased in the form of a question, “the

 authority does not have to answer your question if this would mean

 creating new information or giving an opinion or judgment that is not

 already recorded”. We have provided you with all of the information that

 we hold that is relevant to your questions about the PSED. Following a

 search of our paper and electronic records, I can confirm that we hold no

 recorded information that directly answers your questions.


  


 Having reviewed the College’s original response I am satisfied that the

 College has provided all of the information that it holds on this matter.

 If you are unhappy with the outcome of my review of your request, you have

 the right to complain to the [3]Information Commissioner’s Office.  


  


 Yours,


  


 Anita Hunt


 Access to Information Manager


 Central Secretariat


 [4]Imperial College London  I South Kensington Campus I Faculty Building

 Level 4 I London SW7 2AZ


 Tel: +44 (0)20 7594 5107
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