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              Peter Silverman made this Freedom of Information request to National Highways Limited
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        Peter Silverman
      

      
          25 October 2018

        
                      Delivered        

    


    
      We couldn’t load the mail server logs for this message.

      Try opening the logs in a new window.

    


    
      Dear Highways England Company Limited,


Please refer to

https://www.cleanhighways.co.uk/wp-conte...


Can you please let me have:


1. A copy of the agreement

2.  The names of the  councils involved?

3. Any reports etc looking at the progress being made / lessons learnt etc?


Peter Silverman

www.cleanhighways.co.uk
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        Highways England,
    

    
      25 October 2018
  


  

      

    
      

    This is an automated response:


  


 Thank you for your email to Highways England.


  


 If you’re reporting a real time issue which requires immediate attention

 please call the Customer Contact Centre on 0300 123 5000. 


  


 A map of the roads for which we are responsible can be found here

 [1]https://assets.publishing.service.gov.uk....

 If the road you’re interested in isn’t on this map it will fall under the

 jurisdiction of the local authority.  You can find details of local

 authorities using the search facility on the gov.uk website

 at: [2]https://www.gov.uk/find-your-local-council


  


 If your email does relate to an issue on Highways England's network it

 will be passed to the relevant team within Highways England and they will

 respond to you within a maximum of 15 working days.


  


 If you’ve made a request under the Freedom of Information Act we will

 respond to you within a maximum of 20 working days. Your request will be

 dealt with in line with government guidelines:

 [3]https://www.gov.uk/make-a-freedom-of-inf...


  


 Please be advised that emails may be monitored for training and quality

 assurance purposes.


  


 To help us improve our service please click [4]here to complete a short

 survey.


  


 Kind regards


  


 Highways England Customer Contact Centre.


 This email may contain information which is confidential and is intended

 only for use of the recipient/s named above. If you are not an intended

 recipient, you are hereby notified that any copying, distribution,

 disclosure, reliance upon or other use of the contents of this email is

 strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please

 notify the sender and destroy it.


  


 Highways England Company Limited | General enquiries: 0300 123 5000

 |National Traffic Operations Centre, 3 Ridgeway, Quinton Business Park,

 Birmingham B32 1AF |

 [5]https://www.gov.uk/government/organisati... |

 [6][Highways England request email]


  


 Registered in England and Wales no 9346363 | Registered Office: Bridge

 House, 1 Walnut Tree Close, Guildford, Surrey GU1 4LZ 


  


 Consider the environment. Please don't print this e-mail unless you really

 need to.
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 1. https://assets.publishing.service.gov.uk...

 2. https://www.gov.uk/find-your-local-council
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 3. https://www.gov.uk/make-a-freedom-of-inf...

	https://www.gov.uk/make-a-freedom-of-inf...

 4. https://www.surveymonkey.co.uk/r/HECCC

 5. https://www.gov.uk/government/organisati...

 6. mailto:[Highways England request email]
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        FOI Advice,
    

    
      25 October 2018
  


  

      

    
      

    Dear Mr Silverman,


Thank you for your request for information about December 2015 Midlands Region partnership agreement dated 25th October 2018. I am dealing with it under the terms of the Environmental Information Regulations 2004.


This is because the information requested concerns measures and activities affecting or likely to affect elements of the environment or affect factors such as noise, pollution discharges and other releases into the environment.


The due date for issuing a response is 22nd November 2018.


If you have any queries about this letter, please contact me. Please remember to quote reference number 766,911 in any future communications.


Yours sincerely


Amanda Speight, Freedom of Information Team

Highways England | Lateral | 8 City Walk | Leeds | LS11 9AT

Web: http://www.highways.gov.uk
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      22 November 2018
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    Dear Mr Silverman


  


 Thank you for your request dated 25 October 2018.  Please find attached

 our response and a document titled ‘Highway Cleansing Protocol Redacted’.


  


 Kind regards


  


  


 Rachel Keogh, Customer Correspondence Executive


 High Level Correspondence Team - Operations Midlands

 Highways England | The Cube | 199 Wharfside Street | Birmingham | B1 1RN


 Customer Contact Centre: 0300 123 5000

 Web: [1]www.highwaysengland.co.uk
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        Peter Silverman
      

      
          26 November 2018

        
                      Delivered        

    


    
      We couldn’t load the mail server logs for this message.

      Try opening the logs in a new window.

    


    
      Dear Rahel,


I had asked in relation to the "Dec 2015 Midlands Region partnership agreement" for copies of 'any reports etc looking at the progress being made / lessons learnt"


You have kindly sent me links to documents which report on litter in general. None of them however makes any reference  to the Midlands agreement.


I assume therefore that you do not hold any reports etc looking at the progress made / lessons learnt from it.


Can you please confirm that this is the case?


Yours sincerely,


Peter Silverman
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        OD MIDLANDS HLC,
    

    
      27 November 2018
  


  

      

    
      

    Dear Mr Silverman


  


 Thank you for your email dated 26 November 2018 regarding our response to

 your request for information, reference EIR 766 911. 


  


 We are looking into the matters you have raised and we hope to be able to

 provide you with a full response by 14 December 2018.


  


 Kind regards


  


  


 Rachel Keogh, Customer Correspondence Executive


 High Level Correspondence Team - Operations Midlands

 Highways England | The Cube | 199 Wharfside Street | Birmingham | B1 1RN


 Customer Contact Centre: 0300 123 5000

 Web: [1]www.highwaysengland.co.uk
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    Dear Mr Silverman


  


 Further to my email dated 27 November 2018, please find attached our

 response.


  


 Kind regards


  


  


 Rachel Keogh, Customer Correspondence Executive


 High Level Correspondence Team - Operations Midlands

 Highways England | The Cube | 199 Wharfside Street | Birmingham | B1 1RN


 Web: [1]www.highwaysengland.co.uk


  


  


  


 From: OD MIDLANDS HLC

 Sent: 27 November 2018 15:31

 To: '[FOI #528504 email]'

 Subject: Highways England Response - EIR 766 911 - query


  


 Dear Mr Silverman


  


 Thank you for your email dated 26 November 2018 regarding our response to

 your request for information, reference EIR 766 911.


  


 We are looking into the matters you have raised and we hope to be able to

 provide you with a full response by 14 December 2018.


  


 Kind regards


  


  


 Rachel Keogh, Customer Correspondence Executive


 High Level Correspondence Team - Operations Midlands

 Highways England | The Cube | 199 Wharfside Street | Birmingham | B1 1RN


 Customer Contact Centre: 0300 123 5000

 Web: [2]www.highwaysengland.co.uk
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        Peter Silverman
      

      
          14 December 2018

        
                      Delivered        

    


    
      We couldn’t load the mail server logs for this message.

      Try opening the logs in a new window.

    


    
      Dear Highways England Company Limited,


Please pass this on to the person who conducts Freedom of Information reviews.


I am writing to request an internal review of Highways England Company Limited's handling of my FOI request 'Dec 2015 Midlands Region partnership agreement'.


In my request I had written:

Please refer to https://www.cleanhighways.co.uk/wp-conte... ATPRs.pdf

Can you please let me have:

1. A copy of the agreement

2. The names of the councils involved?

3. Any reports etc looking at the progress being made / lessons learnt


You have not provided me with: 

3. Any reports etc looking at the progress being made / lessons learnt


You have not cited any exception  to justify this non disclosure including EIR 12 (4) (a)  that you did not hold the information when my request was received.


You have failed therefore to comply with your duty under the regulations.


Please review your handling on this request.


A full history of my FOI request and all correspondence is available on the Internet at this address: https://www.whatdotheyknow.com/request/d...


Yours faithfully,


Peter Silverman
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        Highways England,
    

    
      14 December 2018
  


  

      

    
      

    This is an automated response:


  


 Thank you for your email to Highways England.


  


 If you’re reporting a real time issue which requires immediate attention

 please call the Customer Contact Centre on 0300 123 5000. 


  


 A map of the roads for which we are responsible can be found here

 [1]https://assets.publishing.service.gov.uk....

 If the road you’re interested in isn’t on this map it will fall under the

 jurisdiction of the local authority.  You can find details of local

 authorities using the search facility on the gov.uk website

 at: [2]https://www.gov.uk/find-your-local-council


  


 If your email does relate to an issue on Highways England's network it

 will be passed to the relevant team within Highways England and they will

 respond to you within a maximum of 15 working days.


  


 If you’ve made a request under the Freedom of Information Act we will

 respond to you within a maximum of 20 working days. Your request will be

 dealt with in line with government guidelines:

 [3]https://www.gov.uk/make-a-freedom-of-inf...


  


 Please be advised that emails may be monitored for training and quality

 assurance purposes.


  


 To help us improve our service please click [4]here to complete a short

 survey.


  


 Kind regards


  


 Highways England Customer Contact Centre.


 This email may contain information which is confidential and is intended

 only for use of the recipient/s named above. If you are not an intended

 recipient, you are hereby notified that any copying, distribution,

 disclosure, reliance upon or other use of the contents of this email is

 strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please

 notify the sender and destroy it.


  


 Highways England Company Limited | General enquiries: 0300 123 5000

 |National Traffic Operations Centre, 3 Ridgeway, Quinton Business Park,

 Birmingham B32 1AF |

 [5]https://www.gov.uk/government/organisati... |

 [6][Highways England request email]


  


 Registered in England and Wales no 9346363 | Registered Office: Bridge

 House, 1 Walnut Tree Close, Guildford, Surrey GU1 4LZ 


  


 Consider the environment. Please don't print this e-mail unless you really

 need to.
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    Dear Mr Silverman  


  


 Please find attached a copy of the internal review you requested on 14

 December 2018 into the handling of your EIR request reference: 766,911.


  


 Yours sincerely


 Sian Jones | Lead Information Rights Officer | Information & Technology


 Highways England | Piccadilly Gate | Store Street | Manchester | M1 2WD


 Web: http://highwaysengland.co.uk


  


 This email may contain information which is confidential and is intended

 only for use of the recipient/s named above. If you are not an intended

 recipient, you are hereby notified that any copying, distribution,

 disclosure, reliance upon or other use of the contents of this email is

 strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please

 notify the sender and destroy it.


  


 Highways England Company Limited | General enquiries: 0300 123 5000

 |National Traffic Operations Centre, 3 Ridgeway, Quinton Business Park,

 Birmingham B32 1AF |

 [1]https://www.gov.uk/government/organisati... |

 [2][Highways England request email]


  


 Registered in England and Wales no 9346363 | Registered Office: Bridge

 House, 1 Walnut Tree Close, Guildford, Surrey GU1 4LZ 


  


 Consider the environment. Please don't print this e-mail unless you really

 need to.
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        Peter Silverman
      

      
          15 January 2019

        
                      Delivered        

    


    
      We couldn’t load the mail server logs for this message.

      Try opening the logs in a new window.

    


    
      Dear Sian,


Thank you for confirming that you do not hold copies of  reports etc  looking at the progress made /lessons learnt from the Midlands Regional Partnership Agreement.


In the last page of your communication of 8th January you referred to a document entitled "Tackling Litter Together" which I had been sent following another FOI/EIR enquiry. I am anxious to look at it but cannot find it anywhere.  Can you please send me a link to it or direct me to the specific enquiry that I had made.


Thanks


Yours sincerely,


Peter Silverman
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        Peter Silverman
      

      
          15 January 2019

        
                      Delivered        

    


    
      We couldn’t load the mail server logs for this message.

      Try opening the logs in a new window.

    


    
      Dear Sian,


I have now found the document "Tackling litter together"


You do not need to respond to my last communication


Yours sincerely,


Peter Silverman
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      We work to defend the right to FOI for everyone

      Help us protect your right to hold public authorities to account. Donate and support our work.
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