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              Claire Russell Griffiths made this Freedom of Information request to Countryside Council for Wales




  This request has been closed to new correspondence. Contact us if you think it should be reopened.
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          The request was successful.
        

      

    

  







  

      



  


    
      
        Claire Russell Griffiths
      

      
          13 June 2012

        
                      Delivered        

    


    
      We couldn’t load the mail server logs for this message.

      Try opening the logs in a new window.

    


    
      Dear Countryside Council for Wales / Cyngor Cefn Gwlad Cymru,


How much funding has CCW given in total to the marine Conservation Society.


Yours faithfully,


Claire Russell Griffiths
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        Claire Russell Griffiths
      

      
          17 June 2012

        
                      Delivered        

    


    
      We couldn’t load the mail server logs for this message.

      Try opening the logs in a new window.

    


    
      Dear Countryside Council for Wales / Cyngor Cefn Gwlad Cymru,


Just to add I also fully expect funding to seasearch in the answer.


Yours faithfully,


Claire Russell Griffiths


    


    

    




      
  
    

    Link to this

    Report
  









      



  


    
      
        Claire Russell Griffiths
      

      
          17 June 2012

        
                      Delivered        

    


    
      We couldn’t load the mail server logs for this message.

      Try opening the logs in a new window.

    


    
      Dear Countryside Council for Wales / Cyngor Cefn Gwlad Cymru,


Just to add I also fully expect funding to 'seasearch' in the answer to my request.


Yours faithfully,


Claire Russell Griffiths
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        Claire Russell Griffiths
      

      
          11 July 2012

        
                      Delivered        

    


    
      We couldn’t load the mail server logs for this message.

      Try opening the logs in a new window.

    


    
      Dear Countryside Council for Wales / Cyngor Cefn Gwlad Cymru,


By law under section 10 (1) Freedom Of Information Act 2000


10 Time for compliance with request

 (1) Subject to subsections (2) and (3), a public authority must

 comply with section (1) promptly and in any event not later than

 the twentieth working day following the date of reciept.


Country Side Council for Wales is a Public Authority Section 3 FOIA

 2000.


11. (1) (a) the provision to the applicant of a copy of information

 in permanent form or in another form acceptable to the applicant.


I have request the information through the method used now. I would like to stress you are now by law over the twenty working day. I have had no request for more time or reasons for delay or a fee notice.


Yours faithfully,


Claire Russell Griffiths
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        Donna Muirhead,
        Countryside Council for Wales
    

    
      13 July 2012
  


  

      

    
      

     


 Dear Claire Russell Griffiths,


  


 Thank you for your e-mail 11th July stating that under the FOI CCW is late

 in responding to your request for information.


 I would like to clarify that this request does not fall under the Freedom

 of Information act.


  


 As your request askes CCW to provide you with Environmental information it

 falls within the Environmenatl Information Regulation 2004.


  


 We have a duty to make available environmental information on request


 5.—(1) Subject to paragraph (3) and in accordance with paragraphs (2),

 (4), (5) and (6) and the remaining provisions of this Part and Part 3 of

 these Regulations, a public authority that holds environmental information

 shall make it available on request.


  


 Also under EIR (2) information shall be made available under paragraph (1)

 as soon as possible and no later than 20 working days after the date of

 receipt of the request.


 Your request was sent to us on the 17th of June (please see copy of your

 original request below). Therefore the deadline for responding is 16th

 July and CCW is not in breach of failing to respond within the 20 working

 day limit.


  


 Yours faithfully


  


 Donna Muirhead


  


  


 Donna Muirhead


 Swyddog Mynediad i Wybodaeth/ Access to Information Officer


 Cyngor Cefn Gwlad Cymru/ Countryside Council for Wales


 Maes y Ffynnon


 Penrhosgarnedd


 Bangor


 Gwynedd


 LL57 2DW


  


 Ffôn / Tel. :  01248 387219


 E-bost / E-mail : [email address]


  


 -=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-


 Did you know that under Freedom of Information Act 2000, an email can form

 part of a response for information?


 -=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-
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        Claire Russell Griffiths
      

      
          13 July 2012

        
                      Delivered        

    


    
      We couldn’t load the mail server logs for this message.

      Try opening the logs in a new window.

    


    
      Dear Donna Muirhead,


The origional request was sent on the 12 June I added for clarity the additional information on 17 June, but you are fully aware seasearch is part of MCS. I was just stating that it should be included in your reply if they have recieved any funds from CCW at all.


I will await your reply by the 17th July if the information of how public funds are spent is not an easy request to answer before then.


Yours sincerely,


Claire Russell Griffiths


    


    

    




      
  
    

    Link to this

    Report
  









      



  
    
        Donna Muirhead,
        Countryside Council for Wales
    

    
      16 July 2012
  


  

      

    
        
    
      
        1 Attachment
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    Dear Claire Russell Griffiths,


  


 Please see attached CCW's response to your recent request for information.


  


 Kind Regards


 Donna


  


 Donna Muirhead


 Swyddog Mynediad i Wybodaeth/ Access to Information Officer


 Cyngor Cefn Gwlad Cymru/ Countryside Council for Wales


 Maes y Ffynnon


 Penrhosgarnedd


 Bangor


 Gwynedd


 LL57 2DW


  


 Ffôn / Tel. :  01248 387219


 E-bost / E-mail : [email address]


  


 -=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-


 Did you know that under Freedom of Information Act 2000, an email can form

 part of a response for information?


 -=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-
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        Claire Russell Griffiths
      

      
          17 July 2012

        
                      Delivered        

    


    
      We couldn’t load the mail server logs for this message.

      Try opening the logs in a new window.

    


    
      Dear Donna Muirhead,


CCW have been funding seasearch since at least 2004 but you have only given figures since 2007. 


Has MCS only had the one grant in 2009 ever from CCW just to ensure all information is given.


Yours sincerely,


Claire Russell Griffiths
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        Claire Russell Griffiths
      

      
          17 July 2012

        
                      Delivered        

    


    
      We couldn’t load the mail server logs for this message.

      Try opening the logs in a new window.

    


    
      Dear Donna Muirhead,


CCW have been funding seasearch since at least 2004 but you have only given figures since 2007. 


Has MCS only had the one grant in 2009 ever from CCW just to ensure all information is given.


Yours sincerely,


Claire Russell Griffiths


    


    

    




      
  
    

    Link to this

    Report
  









      



  
    
        Donna Muirhead,
        Countryside Council for Wales
    

    
      19 July 2012
  


  

      

    
      

    Dear Claire,


In your first request to CCW, you asked us to provide you details of grant funding to MCS, I assumed that you wanted MCS grant figures relating to MCZ work. Please can you clarify that this is the case or do you actually need amounts for all other grants (if any) awarded to MCS since 2009?


In relation to Seasearch please can you clarify what figures you are requesting. None of the grants previously awarded to Seasearch were awarded for MCZ work but we included the figures because you specifically requested this.


Kind Regards

Donna


Donna Muirhead

Swyddog Mynediad i Wybodaeth/ Access to Information Officer

Cyngor Cefn Gwlad Cymru/ Countryside Council for Wales

Maes y Ffynnon

Penrhosgarnedd

Bangor

Gwynedd

LL57 2DW


Ffôn / Tel. :  01248 387219

E-bost / E-mail : [email address]


-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-

Did you know that under Freedom of Information Act 2000, an email can form part of a response for information?

-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-
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        Claire Russell Griffiths
      

      
          19 July 2012

        
                      Delivered        

    


    
      We couldn’t load the mail server logs for this message.

      Try opening the logs in a new window.

    


    
      Dear Donna Muirhead,


My request was requesting how much money has CCW given to MCS.


I also added Seasearch.


I did not mention MCZ.


Thank you for the previous information but my request  was asking for a total, as in how much have they had in total ever off CCW.


Yours sincerely,


Claire Russell Griffiths


    


    

    




      
  
    

    Link to this

    Report
  









      



  
    
        Donna Muirhead,
        Countryside Council for Wales
    

    
      19 July 2012
  


  

      

    
      

    Rwyf i ffwrdd or swyddfa fyddai yn ol Dydd Mawrth 24


  


 I am away from the office I will be back Tuesday 24th


  



    


    
    




      
  
    

    Link to this

    Report
  









      



  
    
        Donna Muirhead,
        Countryside Council for Wales
    

    
      26 July 2012
  


  

      

    
      

    Dear Claire,


YOUR REQUEST FOR INFORMATION


The request, as it stands is not specific enough for us to identify the information clearly and in order for us to deal with your request we need further clarification. 


You Requested to know "how much have they had in total ever off CCW" They being MCS and Seasearch.


CCW does not hold all records of all grant "ever" awarded to MCS and Seasearch, however we may hold some information on our systems or archives dating back to 2004?


Please can confirm that you would like us to proceed.


Your request was received on 19 July. The time taken to clarify your request is in addition to the 20 day response limit.


Once we have received your clarification we will process your request. 


Regards

Donna


Donna Muirhead

Swyddog Mynediad i Wybodaeth/ Access to Information Officer

Cyngor Cefn Gwlad Cymru/ Countryside Council for Wales

Maes y Ffynnon

Penrhosgarnedd

Bangor

Gwynedd

LL57 2DW


Ffôn / Tel. :  01248 387219

E-bost / E-mail : [email address]


-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-

Did you know that under Freedom of Information Act 2000, an email can form part of a response for information?

-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-
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        Claire Russell Griffiths
      

      
          27 July 2012

        
                      Delivered        

    


    
      We couldn’t load the mail server logs for this message.

      Try opening the logs in a new window.

    


    
      Dear Donna Muirhead,


It is of great concern to hear that you do not hold records of how public funds are spent. This is a matter that may have to be acted upon by another authority.


However if you could just give me the information of how much funding CCW has granted, that you do currently hold, then this would be a start.


I hereby request a breakdown of any funding that has been granted by CCW to Marine Conservation Society.


I also request a breakdown of any funding that has been granted by CCW to Seasearch.


Yours sincerely,


Claire Russell Griffiths


    


    

    




      
  
    

    Link to this

    Report
  









      



  
    
        Donna Muirhead,
        Countryside Council for Wales
    

    
      27 July 2012
  


  

      

    
      

    Rwyf i ffwrdd or swyddfa fyddai yn ol Awst  9fed


  


 I am away from the office I will be back August 9th
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        Claire Russell Griffiths
      

      
          14 August 2012

        
                      Delivered        

    


    
      We couldn’t load the mail server logs for this message.

      Try opening the logs in a new window.

    


    
      Dear Donna Muirhead,


Am still awaiting a full reply on this request.


Yours sincerely,


Claire Russell Griffiths
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        Donna Muirhead,
        Countryside Council for Wales
    

    
      16 August 2012
  


  

      

    
        
    
      
        1 Attachment
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    Dear Claire,


Please see attached funding figures for MCS and Seasearch.


Kind Regards

Donna


Donna Muirhead

Swyddog Mynediad i Wybodaeth/ Access to Information Officer

Cyngor Cefn Gwlad Cymru/ Countryside Council for Wales

Maes y Ffynnon

Penrhosgarnedd

Bangor

Gwynedd

LL57 2DW


Ffôn / Tel. :  01248 387219

E-bost / E-mail : [email address]


-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-

Did you know that under Freedom of Information Act 2000, an email can form part of a response for information?

-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-=-
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        Claire Russell Griffiths
      

      
          19 August 2012

        
                      Delivered        

    


    
      We couldn’t load the mail server logs for this message.

      Try opening the logs in a new window.

    


    
      Dear Donna Muirhead,


Diolch am y wybodaeth. Rwyf dal i ddisgwyl atebion o ceisiadau eraill. Mae un dros ei amser rwan. Oes rheswm?


Yours sincerely,


Claire Russell Griffiths
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