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Dear J Roberts, 

 
In an article headed "Jobless to be remotely monitored by Government" that appeared in the 
Daily Telegraph on the 20th December 2012 it was reported that around 670,000 people had 
signed up to Universal Jobmatch and that more than half of them had given job centre advisers 
access to their account. 
      
1. How many people exactly authorised job centre advisers access to their Universal Jobmatch 
account? 
 
As of 20 January there are 1,267,245 jobseeker accounts on Universal Jobmatch. Of those 
registered, 765,054 have given Department for Work and Pensions advisers access to their 
account. 
      
2. How many people have either revoked or expressed an interest in revoking the authorisation 
that they gave to job centre advisers to access their Universal Jobmatch account? 
 
We do not hold this information. The customer does this on the Universal Jobmatch service 
and as consent is freely given the customer is not required to provide a reason for removing 
that consent. 
      
3. Please supply any information you hold on why people have revoked their authorisation 
giving job centre advisers access to their Universal Jobmatch account. 
 
We do not hold this information. Universal Jobmatch is designed to record the current status, 
and therefore we do not have historical records to check to see if things changed. 
 
 

If you have any queries about this letter please contact me quoting the reference number 
above.   

Yours sincerely,  

DWP Central Freedom of Information Team

e-mail: freedom-of-information-rexxxxx@xxx.xxx.xxx.xx

Our Ref: VTR256

30th January 2013



 
 
DWP Central FoI Team 
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Your right to complain under the Freedom of Information Act 

 

If you are not happy with this response you may request an internal review by e-mailing freedom-of-information-

request@dwp.gsi.gov.uk or by writing to DWP, Central FoI Team, Caxton House, Tothill Street, SW1H 9NA. Any 

review request should be submitted within two months of the date of this letter.  

 

If you are not content with the outcome of the internal review you may apply directly to the Information 

Commissioner’s Office for a decision. Generally the Commissioner cannot make a decision unless you have 

exhausted our own complaints procedure. The Information Commissioner can be contacted at: The Information 

Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow Cheshire SK9 5AF www.ico.gov.uk 


