
 

Louis Seaman 
request-615xxxxxxxxxxx@xxxxxxxxxxxxxx.xxx 

 

7 March 2011  

Our Ref: FOI 2011/30 – F0130074 
 
 
Dear Mr Seaman, 
 
Re: Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 – Request for Information 
 
Thank you for your email which was received by the University on 8 February 2011 timed 
19:08 hours, requesting the following information: 
 
 
‘At the University of Glasgow's Senior Management Meeting of 15 November 2010, in 
relation to the future benefits delivered by the Student Lifecycle Project the Director of 
Student Services stated: 
      
“These 'staff' benefits were estimated to produce savings of over £500k p.a., with 
additional savings in academic staff time.” 
      
1. Could you please tell me how the figure of £500k p.a. was calculated? Please provide 
a breakdown. 
      
2. According to your own published information the Student Lifecycle Project will cost 
in excess of £14m. Could you please tell me how many years it will take for the 
University to recoup the cost of this project? Please supply the assumptions used for      
this calculation. 
      
3. With regard to “savings in academic staff time”, could you please be more specific 
and identify those academic activities affected, the time saved for each, and when each 
saving will materialise? 
      
4. What will be the recurring cost of this new system? Please itemise the cost by staff, 
computers, software, licences, accommodation, consultancy, etc?’ 
 
 
University’s Response 
 
1. Could you please tell me how the figure of £500k p.a. was calculated? Please provide 
a breakdown. 
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The figure of over £500K p.a. was based on an initial high-level analysis of selected areas 
where the implementation of Campus Solutions was anticipated to realise benefits in the form 
of efficiency and other savings, such as a reduction in postage costs as a result of greater use 
of electronic communications. The information was gathered during the course of meetings 
with the various areas and explored the current processes, future processes and anticipated 
impact. It did not represent an exhaustive list within an area.  Please see table below for a 
breakdown.  
 
 

Area 
Staff Savings 

 £'000 
Other savings  

£'000 
Admissions 61 3 
Registration & Enrolment 45 28 
Student Finances 142 143 
Financial Aid 94 0 
Assessment & 
Progression 59 0 
On-Programme 3 0 
Reporting 29 0 

 
      
2. According to your own published information the Student Lifecycle Project will cost 
in excess of £14m. Could you please tell me how many years it will take for the 
University to recoup the cost of this project? Please supply the assumptions used for 
this calculation. 
 
The University of Glasgow does not hold the information that you have requested and is not 
aware of any other public authority that could respond to your request.  Section 17 of FOISA 
states that where public authorities receive requests for information that they do not hold, they 
must issue a notice advising that they do not hold the requested information.  
 
However, for information please find attached in Appendix A the SMG Paper of 17 March 
2009 which refers in Section 3 (pages 3 and 4) to Contribution to Strategic Objectives and Key 
Performance Indicators under the headings Student Recruitment, Student Retention and 
Student Satisfaction and outlines the contributions the Student Lifecycle Project (SLP) will 
make to these. 
 
Section 4 of this paper (pages 5 and 6) on Qualitative Benefits lists the range of benefits of 
which the system will enable the realisation. Section 5 (page 6) outlines the areas in which 
operational efficiencies can be achieved by implementation.  
 
3. With regard to “savings in academic staff time”, could you please be more specific 
and identify those academic activities affected, the time saved for each, and when each 
saving will materialise? 
 



  

 
 

During the course of the high-level analysis the following academic activities were identified as 
contributing to the overall savings. 
 
Registration and enrolment (estimated at 29 days) 
 

a) Plan will allow students to select courses. Adviser will review planner and endorse 
selection or advise students on options in advance of enrolment. 

b) Advisement rules will be used to help make selection and plan future options. Adviser 
intervention by exception only. 

c) Adviser intervention by exception or request. Fifty percent of continuing students in 
general degree programmes would not need intervention 

d) Student self-service enrolment into classes. Advisers no longer require face-to-face 
meeting with all new students to approve course selection. Advisers can report on 
class choices and contact students if concerned about choices.  

 
Assessment and progression (estimated at 210 days) 
 

a) Progression to next year will be auto-calculated. Progress cases automatically 
identified. There will be time savings in reviewing individual records/reports to 
determine eligibility. Progress into next year will run automatically in straightforward 
cases. 

b) Eligibility to progress to honours is auto-calculated, based on criteria, rules and tariffs. 
Students make own course selections and enrol on classes. Rules in system used to 
manage volumes, tariffs, etc. Time savings in removing manual tasks associated with 
assessment of eligibility and allocation to courses/classes. 

 
The estimated savings are expected to be realised once the system is operational and the 
new processes embedded. 
     
4. What will be the recurring cost of this new system? Please itemise the cost by staff, 
computers, software, licences, accommodation, consultancy, etc? 
 

 The post go-live support model which will include costs covering functional and 
technical support is being developed. 

 Licences – licence fees were paid at the commencement of the project in the form of a 
one-off payment for a perpetual right to use. No further licence fees are due unless in 
the event of an increase in FTE headcount which is not envisaged for the foreseeable 
future. Oracle licence fees totalled £758,095. 

 Campus software maintenance – following purchase of the above licences a software 
maintenance contract then provides support from Oracle including the provision of 
ongoing new releases. The annual cost of this maintenance is £264,473 per annum. 

 Computers – a range of hardware items have been purchased to cover implementation 
activities and live running. At this point no further upgrades are planned. Hardware 
spend to date totals £535,150. 



  

 
 

 Hardware maintenance – hardware purchased to date has included maintenance 
cover for between three and five years. Thereafter maintenance cover will be 
extended. Maintenance payments to date total £108,308. 
 
Please note that all costs quoted above are inclusive of VAT. 

The supply of documents under the terms of the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 
does not give the applicant or whoever receives the information any right to re-use it in such a 
way that might infringe the Copyright, Designs and Patents Act 1988 (for example, by making 
multiple copies, publishing or otherwise distributing the information to other individuals and the 
public). The Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 (Consequential Modifications) Order 
2004 ensured that Section 50 of the Copyright, Designs and Patents Act 1988 (“CDPA”) 
applies to the Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002 (“FOISA”).   
 
Breach of copyright law is an actionable offence and the University expressly reserves its 
rights and remedies available to it pursuant to the CDPA and common law. Further information 
on copyright is available at the following website: 
 
http://www.ipo.gov.uk/copy.htm 

Your right to seek a review 

 
Should you be dissatisfied with the way in which the University has dealt with your request, 
you have the right to require us to review our actions and decisions. If you wish to request a 
review, please contact the University Secretary, University Court Office, Gilbert Scott Building, 
University of Glasgow, Glasgow, Scotland G12 8QQ or e-mail: xxx@xxx.xx.xx within 40 
working days. Your request must be in a recordable format (letter, email, audio tape, etc). You 
will receive a full response to your request for review within 20 working days of its receipt.  
 
If you are dissatisfied with the way in which we have handled your request for review you may 
ask the Scottish Information Commissioner to review our decision.  You must submit your 
complaint in writing to the Commissioner within 6 months of receiving the response to review 
letter. The Commissioner may be contacted as follows: 
 
The Scottish Information Commissioner 
Kinburn Castle 
Doubledykes Road 
St Andrews 
Fife 
KY16 9DS 
Telephone: 01334 464610 
Fax: 01334 464611 
Website www.itspublicknowledge.info 
E-mail: enquiries@itspublicknowledge.info 
 

http://www.ipo.gov.uk/copy.htm
mailto:xxx@xxx.xx.xx


  

 
 

An appeal, on a point of law, to the Court of Session may be made against a decision by the 
Commissioner. 
 
For further information on the review procedure please refer to 
(http://www.gla.ac.uk/services/dpfoioffice/policiesandprocedures/foisa-complaintsandreview/ ) 
All complaints regarding requests for information will be handled in accordance with this 
procedure. 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 
 
 
 
Data Protection and Freedom of Information Office 
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